Bid Summary Estimated Construction Cost: $525,000.00

Engineering Il Pavilion Renovation Bid Opening Date:Tuesday, May 22, 2007 @ 2:30 PM
FM070120S/980925 Project Manager: G. Levinthal
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|Contractor Base Bid Compensable Delay Days Total Compensable Delays Total
Ateiler 21 No Bid Submitted 10

18345 Ventura Blvd., Suite 512
Tarzana, CA 91356
818/342-9299/ Fax 818/342-9484

Brannon Inc., DBA Smith Electric Service No Bid Submitted 10
2335 Meredith Lane

Santa Maria, CA 93455
805/922-6243/ Fax 805/922-9770

Blum & Sons Electric Inc. No Bid Submitted 10
606 Linden Ave.

Carpinteria, CA 93013
805/684-1010/ Fax 805/684-2260

Carroll Construction $386,000.00 $100.00 10 $1,000.00 $387,000.00 $387,000.00
216 E. Gutierrez Street

Santa Barbara, CA, 93101
805/966-4810/ Fax 805/966-5654

Subcontractors

Drywall: A G S Wall Systems Inc.

Paint: Landgraff's Painting

Windows: South Coast Industries Inc., DBA Santa Barbara Glass Co.
Flooring: Curtis Carpet Inc.

Shades: Floor Connection Inc.

Frame Structure: Goleta Fabrication Inc., DBA Precision Welding
Plumbing: Kittle Plumbing Inc.

HVAC: Dahl Air Conditioning Inc.

Electric: Newton Construction & Management Inc.

Fire Stop: Karcher Enviromnental Inc.
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EJS Construction Inc. $356,400.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $356,400.00 $356,400.00
4191 Carpinteria Ave. Suite 7
Carpinteria, CA 93013
805/684-6381/ Fax 805/684-6312

Subcontractors

Demolition: Penhall Company

SheetMetal: Jer's Repairs & Installations Inc.
Windows: South Coast Industries Inc., DBA Santa Barbara Glass Co.
HVAC: Jer's Repairs & Installations Inc.
Electrical: The Good Service Company
Plumbing: Goleta Plumbing & Mechanical
Plaster: Garibay Drywall Inc.
Drywall/Plaster: Garibay Drywall Inc.
Window Treatment: Floor Connection Inc.
Paint: Mar Vista Painting

Flooring: AC Ramirez Floor Covering Inc.
Landscape: Coastal Landscape

Canopies: Superior Awning Inc.

Lack Construction $466,325.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $466,325.00 $466,325.00
420 East Carrillo Street

Santa Barbara, CA 93101
805/963-3600/ Fax 805/963-6060

Subcontractors:

Concrete: Anderson's Concrete Concepts Inc.
Glass/Glazing: South Coast Industries Inc., DBA Santa Barbara Glass Co.
Flooring: AC Ramirez Floor Covering Inc.

Painting: Guy Smithson Painting & Decorating

Drywall: Premier Drywall

Doors/Hardware: John Pence Building Specialties Inc.
HVAC: Dahl Air Conditioning Inc.

Electric: VESB Inc., DBA Vastola Electric of Santa Barbara
Window Coverings: Floor Connection Inc.

Structural Steel: West Coast Construction

Plumbing: M/M Mechanical Inc.

Schock Contracting No Bid Submitted 10
340 S. Kellogg, Suite J

Goleta, CA 93117

805/681-9796/ Fax 805/681-9717




