Bid Bummary, Rav, 1, 112707

Pulatran Lok fenovation
FMO704665/00 1550

Bid Openng Date: Thursday,
Hovember B, 2007 & ZHPY
Pigject Menager: J. Ganzales

Conbraclor

Basa Bld

Cotnpensabio Deluy

Dy s

Total Compensahls

Basn Bid Plus Compenachia Datoy

Tatal

Andersan Syslems
5588 Corla Stresl
Guolela, CA. 53117
B05-B83-65133
Bi5-864-2351

No Bid Recejved

Beachslde Assoclales
10§ Amold Place
Goleta, CA. B3117
BOS.-EE83-7745
BOA-683-3066

No Bid Racelved

Battenfield Consiruetlon
24832 Apple Strest
Mewhall, CA. 81385
£61-260-1720
B61-250-1401%

tors:

4 b Wiesterm Lob b

Daorsfindayis: Golden West
Elactricalt Venca
¥ lastar: R

Flapilng: Santa Bubwa Sutfacing
#IVAC: Dahl Rtechanical

Palnt: JP Redriguez

Plumking: Galat Phurnbing
Raofing: Channe lsfand Reofing
Bhic. Blasl: West Cons! Weiding
Louver Vents: Specialty Bidp Ce.

Ca.

$1,452,000.00

$450.00

53,250.00

§1,456,250.00

$1,455,250.00

Camoll Construction

218 Ensl Guliesraz

Eanla barbara, CA. 5310
805.956-4610
805-856-5654

Subcontrattors

ard Denio; Bitvore
Concrate:fatworz

Struct, Strealz A0

Raafing: Shanneiiptand Reafing
Plastart TFT

Drywall: AGS

Paink Ludgrotis

Casewaric ISEC

HWALC: Alpha Pumbng
Elatitrie: Parngon
Flumblng:Alaha Pumbing
Accouste Tie: Poodfic Acoysties

Hid Withdrawn




Bid Summary, Rev. §, 10207

falstrom Lab Aeacvatian
FMOTOABBSAEI55

Bid Opening Dato: Thursday,
Havember B, 2007 @ 2I0PM
Piojoct blanager J, Gopzoles

Caniractor

Basa Bld

Compunsabin Galoy

Day

Tata) Compensablo

Baso Bld Plus Compensablz Deiny|

Tokal

FNG Constructian, nc.
P.O. Box 1070
MNipemo, CA. 83449
BR5.829-1164
BR5-929-8330

No Bid Recejved

Lack Canstruction

420 Easl Carillo Stresy
Sunta Barbary, CA. 8310t
BN5-953-3600
805-253-6060

Subcaniractors:

Electilzal: Faragon Elecyic

Louvers: Specialty Blug. Ca.

Electronlz Canlrols: Johnssn Contok
HVAG; Alphn Pumting & Mach.
Plumbing: Galeta Plumbing

Casewark; SEC

Palnling: Caect Coamigs

Drywall, Steel Stud, Acouslic: Wuadward
Stucco! Specialy Team

Flashlngat Montiz Waymne

Roafing ~Standhy Seam:Pasific Roolng
Roafing- Membrne: Tii Valay Roalog
Sleal: West Coast Welding

Conciete: Kenney Constiucton

Demo: CS¥ Envaonmental

bema; Rirwen.

Scatfald: Wasa Scalfolds

Doars; Avaion Goor & Windaw

$1,349,900.00

5100.00

§500.00

51,350,400.00

$1,350,100.€0

L.as Anpeles Air Cenditioning, Inc.
1714 Lindbemh Court

La Verne, CA. 81750
900-596-7077

©{19.586-6657

Subconlraciors:

Insulation: FAE Insufatian

Conlrols; Ishnaan Conlrsls

AltWater Balynes: Amedean Ai Balance
Ganeral Construction: Steaa Pactfic
Plumbing! Golata Plumbing

Elattilcat: Ry Electtizal

Rooflag: Southwest Group

Struetural Steal: Vukkon Gteel

Dema wotk: Dirtwarx Ine.

$1,740,560.00

5400.00

$2,000.00

51,742,560.00

§4.742,560.00




Bld Summeaty, Aev. 1, 11/3707

Paistrom |ob Renavation
FMO7042059081550

Bid Opening Date: Thursday,
Hovember 8. 2007 ¢ 2I0PA
Fioject Manuger: J Ganzales

Gonfraciar

Basa Bld

LCampenashla Delay

Bay

Total Eompanszkla

Baso BId Plua Compensabla Dalay

Toixl

Pat McCarihy Capslrucliers
633 Enst Ventura Blvd.
DRxnard, CA 93035
B05-484-4646
H05-484-4646

Ra Bid Receivad

PreCen Indusiries, Ine.
724 Eust Qok Street
Santa Mania, CA. 93454
G§058-345-3147
805.345.3148

Subcantrciors:

Sieal; Caok Ezecisrs

Bult-up Root: Cambron Aoofing
Plum¥ing: Goleta Plumling & Mech.
Doois? Juhn Pance Bily. Speciaties
Palnting: Cests Pro Paviters

Demol Conctote: Blitwsrz

Matal Casewnthe Wesiam: Lok
Sianding Saam Roop: Pacific Ravfing
Floutlag: Ftae: Seat Tech

{8lucce: Coaidsgos X Sana
HVACIDemo: Daht Air

Efeshrical Hewion Cansuuclian

51,625511.00

$344.00

$4,720.00

$1,630,231.00

$1,630,221.00

SBS Corporistion

3146 Agoura Road, Suite 135
Wasilake Wllage, CA. 81361-4621
B1B-5897-4363

B1B-597-4368

Ne Bid Received

Sanders Construciion
21731 Rushiard

Lake Forasi, CA. 2830
8408.951. 5044

No Bid Recaived

Schock Contracting

P.C. Box £1505

Sania Basbara, CA. 93160
EB05-GB1-9795
B05-561-9717

No Bid Recelved




Hid Summery, Rev. 1, 142710

Falstiom Lab Repovatcn
FI0704665M61 560

Bid Opening Date: Thurstday,
Havember B, 2007 @ 239FM
Frojett Manager: J. Gonzales

| Conkhetor

Baga Bid

Compensablo Dalay

Day

Vatal Compensobin

Basa Bld Plus Compansabla Dalay

Total

Smith Elactric Sarvice
2335 Meredith Lang
Santa Maria, CA. 82485
B05.622.6243
B805-348-7270

Subcontraciors:

Palymer Floors: SB Surfazing

Drywalt BluccniMaial Studs Pocifc Inietiors
Painl; Cuy Smithaon

Lab Equlp: iSEC

Realing: Shannred lsland Accfng

Centrols: Johnsan Conbsts

Alr Balanca: Ameiican Al Balance

§1,197,200.00

50.00

2040

51,197,200

$1,187,200

Sauthland Canatruction
10760 Buzstank Bivd.

Herih Hollywood, CA. 91501
818.508-%134
B818-504-4141

Subcantraciors:

Plumbing: Galela Plumbing & Mechtnkcal
Flie Spiinkless: Ragency Fia

Floaring; Phoenic Fisazs

HVAC: Graycon

Electrlcal: Parapas Eleciricad

$1,475,669,00

$500.00

52,500.00

$1,478,165.00

1,478,188 00

Spacially Canslruclon

545 Clarion Court

San Luis Obispo, CA. 93401
H05-543-1706
805-543-1722

o Bid Recaived

Spiess Consineclian Ca., lnc.
P.0=> Hax Z84%

Sanla Marfa, CA, 83457-2848
B05-937-5855%

805.431-2252

Na Bid Received

Viola, Inc.

1144 Cormmercial Ave.
Oxnard, CA, 8303
605-407-38T1
B05-487-3870

Nuo Bid Recelved




