

Bid Summary

Project: Place, Splice Terminate, Copper, Fiber and Coax Cables  
 Project No.: F090029BR/981240

Estimated Price: \$102,000.00  
 University Rep.: Karl Burrelsman

BASE BID		COMPENSABLE DELAY			Project Cost
General Contractor	Base Bid	Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Base Bid and Compensable Delays
Bering Sea Eccotech 1556 Santa Ana, Suite 120 Sacramento, CA. 95838 Tele: 916-921-7464 FAX: 916-921-7463	\$117,816.65	\$100.00	10	\$1,000.00	\$118,816.65
Subcontractors No Subcontractors					<b>Bid Rejected</b>
Blum and Sons Electric 606 Linden Ave. Carpinteria, CA. 93013 Tele: 805-684-1010 FAX: 805-684-2260	No Bid Received		10		
Subcontractors N/A					
Bouchard Communications, Inc. 11231 Burbank Blvd. North Hollywood, CA. 91601 Tele: 818-761-2154 FAX: 818-761-2154	No Bid Received		10		
Subcontractors N/A					
D & B Communications 6100 Francis Botello Road Goleta, CA. 93117 Tele: 805-964-6261 FAX: 805-964-6269	No Bid Received		10		
Subcontractors N/A					
HCI, Inc. 3166 Horseless Carriage Drive Norco, CA. 92860 Tele: 951-520-4200 FAX: 951-520-4320	No Bid Received		10		
Subcontractors N/A					
High Tech Electric 5888 E. Teague Ave. Clovis, CA. 93619 Tele: 559-299-7152 FAX: 559-229-3225	No Bid Received		10		
Subcontractor N/A					
Pavietich Electric & Communications 6308 Seven Seas Ave. Bakersfield, CA. 93308 Tele: 661-589-9473 FAX: 661-589-0533	No Bid Received		10		
Subcontractors N/A					
Quintron Systems, Inc. 2105 So. Blosser Road Santa Maria, CA. 93458 Tele: 805-928-4343 FAX: 805-928-5775	\$100,555.58	\$1,675.92	10	\$16,759.20	\$117,314.78
Subcontractor No Subcontractors					

Bid Open: Time: Date:

Bid Summary

SECC Cable/Communications Corporation					
183 Business Center Drive	\$86,535.00	\$3,500.00	10	\$35,000.00	\$121,535.00
Corona, CA. 92880					
Tele: 951-734-3110 FAX: 951-734-4878					
Subcontractors					
No Subcontractors					
Taft Electric					
650 Alamo Pintado Road #201	\$109,970.00	\$50.00	10	\$500.00	\$110,470.00
Solvang, CA. 93463					
Tele: 805-688-0121 FAX: 805-688-0125					
Subcontractors					
D & B Communications - Splicing					
Tel Tech Plus, Inc. (TTP)					
393 Enterprise Street	No Bid Received		10		
San Marcos, CA. 92078					
Tele: 760-208-7490 FAX: 760-510-8559					
Subcontractor					
N/A					
Vector Resources, Inc.					
3530 Voyager Street	\$189,811.96	\$3,500.00	10	\$35,000.00	\$224,811.96
Torrance, CA. 90503					
Tele: 310-436-1000 FAX: 310-436-1177					
Subcontractor					
No Subcontractors					
Vision Communications					
1421 State Street, Suite "F"	No Bid Received		10		
Santa Barbara, CA. 93101					
Tele: 805-963-7670 FAX: 805-963-7673					
Sucontractor					
N/A					
Werner Tile Company, Inc.					
22935 Ventura Blvd.	No Bid Received		10		
Woodland Hills, CA. 91364					
Tele: 818-222-5585 FAX: 818-222-5527					
Subcontractors					
N/A					