
Mosher Alumni House
981040
University Rep: Jim Pinard
University Desg. Admnstr: Ed Marini

BP # 01
Site Development, Grading, Utilities and Landscaping

Bid Release #1
Bid Date: July 13, 2005

  Time: 2:30 p.m.

ALTERNATE - 
NONE

PTC / Bid Pack #01 License: A or B or C-8 
& C-12 & C-27 & C-32 & C-34 Base Bid Amount

Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable Alternate 

Base Bid w/unit 
prices & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates

ALL BIDS REJECTED

See Bid Release #2

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST



Mosher Alumni House
981040
University Rep: Jim Pinard
University Desg.  Admnstr:  Ed Marini

BP # 02
Bldg. Concrete, Reinforcement, Masonry, Stone Veneer

Bid Release #1
Bid Date: July 13, 2005

  Time: 2:30 p.m.

PTC / Bid Pack #02 License: B or C8 & 
C29 Base Bid Amount

Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable

ADD, DEDUCT, 
NO CHANGE Alternate 

Base Bid w/unit 
prices & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates

L& H CONCRETE, INC.
4403 Vineyard Avenue 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Oxnard, CA 93030

T: 805/278-2075                     FAX: 805/278-1656

                         Subcontractors

NO BID SAUBMITTED

MERCO CONSTRUCTION
1175 Calle Suerte $1,276,000.00 $1,000.00 30 $30,000.00 ADD $27,800.00 $1,306,000.00 $27,800.00 $1,333,800.00

Camarillo, CA 93012

T: 805/987-8615              FAX: 805/987-6606

                         Subcontractors

Reinforcing Steel: Canoga Rebar

Masonry: Lindero 

Stone Veneer: RDM Tile

MENDEZ CONCRETE
1210 Santa Paula Street 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Santa Paula, CA 93060

T: 805/525-8043                    FAX: 805/525-8057

                         Subcontractors

NO BID SUBMITTED

PRECISION CONCRETE
465 East Carmel Street $1,460,000.00 $500.00 30 $15,000.00 ADD $71,000.00 $1,475,000.00 $71,000.00 $1,546,000.00

San Marcos, CA 92078

T: (760) 930-0251               FAX: (760) 930-0681

                         Subcontractors

Site Concrete: Cleanline Concrete

Masonry: Reyes Masonry

Rebar: Canoga Rebar

T.B. PENICK & SONS
9747 Olson Drive $1,275,000.00 $1,800.00 30 $54,000.00 ADD $30,000.00 $1,329,000.00 $30,000.00 $1,359,000.00

San Diego, CA 92121

T: 858/558-1800              FAX:858/558-1881

                         Subcontractors

Site Wiork: Miller Engineering

Partial Concrete: Cleanline Concrete

Rebar: Canoga Rebar

Masonry: Lindero Masonry

Stone Veneer: RDM Tile Co.

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COSTALTERNATES



Mosher Alumni House
981040
University Rep: Jim Pinard
University Desg. Admnstr:  Ed Marini

BP # 03
Structural Steel, Decking, Misc. Metal Fabrications

Bid Release #1
Bid Date: July 13, 2005

  Time: 2:30 p.m.

ALTERNATES

PTC / Bid Pack # 3 : License  C51 Base Bid Amount
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable

ADD, DEDUCT, 
NO CHANGE Alternate 

Base Bid w/unit 
prices & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates

COOK ERECTORS, INC.
1601 - J West Central Avenue $1,707,062.00 $200.00 30 $6,000.00 ADD $64,500.00 $1,713,062.00 $64,500.00 $1,777,562.00

Lompoc, CA 93436

T: 805/736-6606                     FAX: 805/736-2042 

                         Subcontractors

Metal Decking: Eckles Construction

Metal Stairs: American Stair

Detailing: Smith Detailing

STEELCON INC.
2677 S. Chestnut Avenue $1,508,500.00 $1,500.00 30 $45,000.00 ADD $104,760.00 $1,553,500.00 $104,760.00 $1,658,260.00

Fresno, CA 93725

T: 559/266-3823                     FAX: 559/266-3019

                         Subcontractors

None Listed

WEST COAST IRON
2302 Jamacha Road 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Springs Valley, CA 91977

T: 619/464-8456                        FAX: 619/464-7973

                         Subcontractors

NO BID SUBMITTED

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST



Mosher Alumni House
981040
University Rep: Jim Pinard
University Desg.  Admnstr:  Ed Marini

BP # 04
Plumbing

Bid Release #1
Bid Date: July 13, 2005

  Time: 2:30 p.m.

ALTERNATE - 
NONE

PTC / Bid Pack #4 Plumbing - License: C-
36 Base Bid Amount

Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable Alternate 

Base Bid w/unit 
prices & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates

KITTLE PLUMBING, INC.
7730 Evergreen Drive $292,492.00 $500.00 30 $15,000.00 $0.00 $307,492.00 $0.00 $307,492.00

Goleta, CA 93117

T: 805/968-4238               FAX: 805/968-4215 

                         Subcontractors

Insulation: Dahl Air Conditioning

M / M MECHANICAL
1027 Cindy Lane $337,536.00 $0.00 30 $0.00 $0.00 $337,536.00 $0.00 $337,536.00

Carpenteria, CA 93013

T:805/745-1126                 FAX: 805/745-1116 

                         Subcontractors

Insulation: Dahl Air Conditioning

Fire Stopping: Karcher Fire Stopping

INGALLS & SON PLUMBING & HEATING, INC.
1912 De La Vina $289,825.00 $500.00 30 $15,000.00 $0.00 $304,825.00 $0.00 $304,825.00

Santa Barbara, CA 93101

T: 805/569-2180                FAX: 805/569-0863 

                         Subcontractors

Insulation: Dahl Air Conditioning

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST



Mosher Alumni House
981040
University Rep: Jim Pinard
University Desg. Admnstr: Ed Marini

BP# 05
Site and Bldg. Electrical, Fire Alarms, Data / Phone Comm.

Bid Release #1
Bid Date: July 13, 2005

  Time: 2:30 p.m.

ALTERNATES

PTC / Bid Pack # 5 Site & Bldg. Electrical, 
Fire Alarm, Data/Phone/Communications  
- License C-10 Base Bid Amount

Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable

ADD, DEDUCT, 
NO CHANGE Alternate 

Base Bid w/unit 
prices & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates

TAFT ELECTRIC
1694 Eastman Avenue $860,395.00 $75.00 30 $2,250.00 ADD $4,057.00 $862,645.00 $4,057.00 $866,702.00

Ventura, CA 93003

T: 805/642-0121                 FAX: 805/650-9015

                         Subcontractors

NETA Testing: Power Systems Testing

High Voltage Testing: De Young Power Systems

Fire Stopping: Karcher Firestopping, Inc.

Assistive Listening Systems: Pacificaon, Inc.

Trench, Paving, Concrete: Tierra Contracting

P & L ELECTRIC
P.O. Box 605 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Lompoc, CA 93438

T: 805/735-6250          FAX: 805/735-8950 

                         Subcontractors

NO BID SUBMITTED

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST



Mosher Alumni House
981040
University Rep: Jim Pinard
University Desg. Admnstr: Ed Marini

BP # 06
HVAC Mechanical Systems, Eqpmnt, Hydronic Piping, EMCS

Bid Release #1
Bid Date: July 13, 2005

  Time: 2:30 p.m.

ALTERNATE - 
NONE

PTC / Bid Pack # 06 - License B, or C-7 & 
C-20 & C-36 & C-38 Base Bid Amount

Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable Alternate 

Base Bid w/unit 
prices & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates

DAHL AIR CONDITIONING
30 S. La Patera Lane, #9 $973,735.00 $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 $973,735.00 $0.00 $973,735.00

Goleta, Ca 93117

T: 805/964-2002                  FAX: 805/683-7654

                         Subcontractors

Wet Side Piping: M&M Mechanical

Air Balanc: LA Air Balance

LOS ANGELES AIR CONDITIONING
1714 Lindbergh Court $620,800.00 $200.00 20 $4,000.00 $0.00 $624,800.00 $0.00 $624,800.00

La Verne, CA 91750

T: 909/596-7077                  FAX: 909/596-6657

                         Subcontractors

Controls: Johnson Controls

Air Balance: American Air Balance

Insulation: Dahl Insulation

RJ LANTHIER Co., Inc.
485 Corporate Drive $643,000.00 $200.00 20 $4,000.00 $0.00 $647,000.00 $0.00 $647,000.00

Escondido, CA 92029

T: 760/738-9798                   FAX: 760/738-9799

                         Subcontractors

Temperature Control: Johnson Controls

Test & Balance: Los Angeles Air Balance

Mechanical Insulation: Dahl Insulation

SHELDON MECHANICAL
21130 Centre Pointe Parkway $849,490.00 $650.00 20 $13,000.00 $0.00 $862,490.00 $0.00 $862,490.00

Santa Clarita, CA 91350

T: 661/286-1361                      FAX: 661/287-9083 

                         Subcontractors

Hydronic Piping: Ingalls

EMCS: Johnson Controls

Insulation: Dahl Air Conditioning

Fire Stop: Karcher

Test & Balance: American Air

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST



Mosher Alumni House
981040
University Rep: Jim Pinard
University Desg. Admnstr:  Ed Marini

BP# 07
Fire Sprinklers

Bid Release #1
Bid Date: July 13, 2005

  Time: 2:30 p.m.

ALTERNATE -  
none

PTC / Bid Pack # 07 License: C-16 Base Bid Amount
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable Alternate 

Base Bid w/unit 
prices & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates

ALPHA FIRE SPRINKLER CORP.
650 Sweeney Lane $99,883.00 $1,440.00 20 $28,800.00 $0.00 $128,683.00 $0.00 $128,683.00

San Luis Obispo, CA 93401

T:805/541-2324               FAX: 805/541-4624

                         Subcontractors

Karcher Fire Stopping

COSCO FIRE PROTECTION, INC.
4233 W. Sierra Madre, Ste. 108 $98,000.00 $500.00 20 $10,000.00 $0.00 $108,000.00 $0.00 $108,000.00

Fresno, CA 93722

T:  559/275-3795            FAX: 559/275-8006

                         Subcontractors

None listed

ROY LEE DESIGN
812 Railroad Avenue 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Santa Paula, CA 93060

T:  805/933-2444       FAX: 805/933-2846

                         Subcontractors

NO BID SUBMITTED

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST



Mosher Alumni House
981040
University Rep: Jim Pinard
University Desgn. Admnstr:  Ed Marini

BP # 08
Metal Framing, Fire Stopping and Proofing, Gypsum Brd, Stucco, Insulation

Bid Release #1
Bid Date: July 13, 2005

  Time: 2:30 p.m.

ALTERNATE - 
NONE

PTC / Bid Pack #08  License: B or C5 & -5 
& C-9 & C-2 & C-35 Base Bid Amount

Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable Alternate 

Base Bid w/unit 
prices & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates

PREMIER DRYWALL
P.O. Box 5728 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Santa Maria, CA 93456

T: 805/928-3397              FAX: 805/928-0977

                         Subcontractors

TARLTON & SON, INC.
4173 S. Fig Avenue $1,284,750.00 $275.00 20 $5,500.00 $0.00 $1,290,250.00 $0.00 $1,290,250.00

Fresno, CA 93706

T: 559/486-0584                FAX: 559/486-0511

                         Subcontractors

Fireproofing: Custom Spray

ANDERSON BURTON CONSTRUCTION
1131 El Camino Real $1,062,949.00 $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 $1,062,949.00 $0.00 $1,062,949.00

Arroyo Grande, CA 93420

T: 805/481-5096              FAX: 805/473-8890

                         Subcontractors

Fire Stopping: Karcher

Insulation: Gearhart

SPACECON
2037 South 4130 West, Ste. 3 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Salt Lake City,  Utah 84104

T: 801/972-9023               FAX: 801/972-1101

                         Subcontractors

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST



Mosher Alumni House
981040
University Rep: Jim Pinard
University Desg. Admnstr:  Ed Marini

BP # 09
Waterproofing, Flashing, Sheet Metal

Bid Release #1
Bid Date: July 13, 2005

  Time: 2:30 p.m.

ALTERNATE - 
NONE

PTC / Bid Pack #09 License: C-39 & C-43 Base Bid Amount
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable Alternate 

Base Bid w/unit 
prices & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates

ALL BIDS REJECTED

See Bid Release #2

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST



Mosher Alumni House
981040
University Rep: Jim Pinard
University Desg. Admnstr:  Ed Marini

BP # 10
Wood and Steel Doors, Metal Frames Hardware

Bid Release #1
Bid Date: July 14, 2005

Time: 2:30 p.m.
ALTERNATE - 
NONE

PTC / Bid Pack #10  License: C-5 Base Bid Amount
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable Alternate 

Base Bid w/unit 
prices & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates

ARCHITECTURAL DOORS, INC.
11700 Monarch Street $113,169.00 $100.00 20 $2,000.00 $0.00 $115,169.00 $0.00 $115,169.00

Garden Grove, CA 92841

T: 714/898-3667        FAX: 714/372-3434

                         Subcontractors

None Listed

ANDERSON BURTON CONSTRUCTION
1072 Old Oak Park 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Arroyo Grande, CA 93420

T: 805/481-5096              FAX: 805/473-8890

                         Subcontractors

NO BID SUBMITTED

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST



Mosher Alumni House
981040
University Rep: Jim Pinard
University Desg. Admnstr:  Ed Marini

BP # 11
Wood, Plastics, Misc. Specialties

Bid Release #1
Bid Date: July 14, 2005

Time: 2:30 p.m.
ALTERNATES

PTC / Bid Pack 11 License: C-6 Base Bid Amount
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable

ADD, DEDUCT, 
NO CHANGE Alternate 

Base Bid w/unit 
prices & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates

ALL BIDS REJECTED

See Bid Release #2

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST



Mosher Alumni House
981040
University Rep: Jim Pinard
University Desg. Admnstr:  Ed Marini

BP # 12
Paint, Blinds, Final Construction Cleaning

Bid Release #1
Bid Date: July 14, 2005

Time: 2:30 p.m.
ALTERNATES

PTC / Bid Pack 12 License: C-33 Base Bid Amount
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable

ADD, DEDUCT, 
NO CHANGE Alternate 

Base Bid w/unit 
prices & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates

NIKE CONSTRUCTION 
15635 Cobalt St. Unit B $121,000.00 $0.00 20 $0.00 ADD $8,000.00 $121,000.00 $8,000.00 $129,000.00

Sylmar, CA 93142

T: 818/362-1949          FAX: 818/362-0209

                         Subcontractors

Final Cleaning: A-Alberts Reliable Cleaning Corp.

SPACECON
2037 South 4130 West, Ste. 3 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Salt Lake City,  Utah 84104

T: 801/972-9023               FAX: 801/972-1101

                         Subcontractors

NO BID SUBMITTED

CALIFORNIA PRO PAINTING
800 S. Broadway, Ste. 125 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Santa Maria, CA 93455

T: 805/922-3706             FAX: 805/922-6756

                         Subcontractors

NO BID SUBMITTED

VANGUARD PAINTING, INC.
2101 S. Rose Ave., Unit A 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Oxnard, CA 93033

T: 805/240-2331          FAX:  805/240-2332

                         Subcontractors

NO BID SUBMITTED

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST



Mosher Alumni House
981040
University Rep: Jim Pinard
University Desg. Admnstr:  Ed Marini

BP # 13
Ceiling Systems

Bid Release #1
Bid Date: July 14, 2005

Time: 2:30 p.m.
ALTERNATE - 
NONE

PTC / Bid Pack 13 License: C-2 or D-50 Base Bid Amount
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable Alternate 

Base Bid w/unit 
prices & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates BASE BID $$$

ESTIMATE 
AMOUNT OVER / UNDER

PREMIER DRYWALL
P.O. Box 5728 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $45,000.00 (45,000.00)$            

Santa Maria, CA 93456

T: 805/928-3397              FAX: 805/928-0977

                         Subcontractors

ALL BIDS REJECTED

See Bid Release #2

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST



Mosher Alumni House
981040
University Rep: Jim Pinard
University Desg. Admnstr:  Ed Marini

BP #14 
Elevators

Bid Release #1
Bid Date: July 14, 2005

Time: 2:30 p.m.
ALTERNATE - 
NONE

PTC / Bid Pack 14  License: C-11 Base Bid Amount
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable Alternate 

Base Bid w/unit 
prices & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates

E N DELL CO., INC. dba REPUBLIC ELEVATOR CO.
77 South Fairview Ave. $239,320.00 $350.00 30 $10,500.00 $0.00 $249,820.00 $0.00 $249,820.00

Goleta, CA 93117

T: 805/683-6302              FAX: 805/683-8948

                         Subcontractors

Magco Drilling

KONE, INC.
12950 Alondra Blvd. $255,210.00 $1,325.57 30 $39,767.10 $0.00 $294,977.10 $0.00 $294,977.10

Cerritos, CA 90703

T: 562/921-1555       FAX: 562/921-6824

                         Subcontractors

None Listed

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST



Mosher Alumni House
981040
University Rep: Jim Pinard
University Desg. Admnstr:  Ed Marini

BP # 15
Carpet and Flooring

Bid Release #1
Bid Date: July 14, 2005

Time: 2:30 p.m.
ALTERNATE - 
NONE

PTC / Bid Pack 15  License: C-15 Base Bid Amount
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable Alternate 

Base Bid w/unit 
prices & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates

FLOOR CONNECTION
1333 De La Vina 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Santa Barbara, CA 93101

T: 805/965-0404                FAX: 805/965-8533

                         Subcontractors

NO BID SUBMITTED

RELIABLE FLOOR COVERING
2304 Townsgate Rd. $43,507.00 $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 $43,507.00 $0.00 $43,507.00

Westlake Village, CA 91361

T:  805/495-4811        FAX: 805/497-4069

                         Subcontractors

Seamless Flooring: Western Waterproofing & Coating

A. C. RAMIREZ
824 Cacique Street 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Santa Barbara, CA 93103

T:  805/965-0095         FAX: 805/730-9266 

                         Subcontractors

NO BID SUBMITTED

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST



Mosher Alumni House
981040
University Rep: Jim Pinard
University Desg. Admnstr:  Ed Marini

BID PACKAGE # 16
Ceramic Tile

Bid Release #1
Bid Date: July 14, 2005

Time: 2:30 p.m.
ALTERNATE - 
NONE

PTC / Bid Pack 16 CERAMIC TILE  
License:C-54 Base Bid Amount

Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable Alternate 

Base Bid w/unit 
prices & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates

NO BIDS SUBMITTED

See Bid Release #2

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST



Mosher Alumni House
 981040
University Rep: Jim Pinard
University Desg. Admnstr: Ed Marini

BID PACKAGE # 17
Aluminum Entrances, Storefronts, Alum. Windows

Bid Release #1
Bid Date: July 14, 2005

Time: 2:30 p.m.

ALTERNATE - 
NONE

PTC / Bid Pack 17  License: C-17 Base Bid Amount
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable Alternate 

Base Bid w/unit 
prices & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates BASE BID $$$

ESTIMATE 
AMOUNT OVER / UNDER

C-17 SANTA BARBARA GLASS
245557 617 B. North Salsipuedes $357,000.00 $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 $357,000.00 $0.00 $357,000.00 $357,000.00 $160,000.00 197,000.00$           

Santa Barbara, CA 93103

T:  805/962-7648         FAX: 805/966-6673

                         Subcontractors

None Listed

 MARK ANTHONY
133 S. Euclia Ave. 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 -$                        

San Dimas, CA 91773

T: 909/394-4849           FAX: 909/394-4850

                         Subcontractors

BEST ROOFING BID BOND 10%

19027 S. Hamilton Ave. 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 -$                        -$                      

Gardena, CA 90248

T: 310/328-6969          FAX: 310/328-9176

                         Subcontractors

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST



Mosher Alumni House
981040
Univ Rep: Jim Pinard
Univ Desg. Admnstr:  Ed Marini

BID PACKAGE # 18
Extr. Weather Rstve Barriers, Sld Phen. and Cmnt. Brd. Wall Pnls

BR #1
Bid Date: July 14, 2005

Time: 2:30 p.m.

ALTERNATE - 
NONE

PTC / Bid Pack 18  License: B or C-39 & C-
5, or D-41 Base Bid Amount

Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable Alternate 

Base Bid w/unit 
prices & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates BASE BID $$$

ESTIMATE 
AMOUNT OVER / UNDER

BEST ROOFING
19027 S. Hamilton Ave. 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 -$                        

Gardena, CA 90248

T: 310/328-6969          FAX: 310/328-9176

                         Subcontractors

NO BID SUBMITTED

PREMIER DRYWALL
P.O. Box 5728 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $425,000.00 (425,000.00)$          

Santa Maria, CA 93456

T: 805/928-3397              FAX: 805/928-0977

                         Subcontractors

NO BID SUBMITTED

ANDERSON BURTON CONSTRUCTION
1072 Old Oak Park 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $425,000.00 (425,000.00)$          

Arroyo Grande, CA 93420

T: 805/481-5096              FAX: 805/473-8890

                         Subcontractors

NO BID SUBMITTED

B. T. MANCINI
876 S. Milpitas Blvd. 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $425,000.00 (425,000.00)$          

Milpitas, CA 95036

T:  408/942-7900        FAX: 408/945-1360

                         Subcontractors

NO BID SUBMITTED

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST



Mosher Alumni Hous
981040
University Rep: Jim Pinard
University Desg. Admnstr:  Ed Marini

BP# 19

Food Service and Appliances
Bid Release #1

Bid Date: July 14, 2005 
Time: 2:30 p.m.

ALTERNATE - 
NONE

PTC / Bid Pack 19 FOOD SVC  License: C-
38 or C-43 Base Bid Amount

Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable Alternate 

Base Bid w/unit 
prices & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates BASE BID $$$

ESTIMATE 
AMOUNT OVER / UNDER

ALL BIDS REJECTED

See Bid Release #2

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST


