
Job Order Contract- Campus Paving Projects
FM080457-JOC
License: A OR C-12

BID SUMMARY Project Manager: R.Aronson
Bid Opening Date:Wednesday July 2, 2008 @ 2:30PM
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United Seal Coating & Slurryseal Inc. 1.2000 10% 0.1200 1.2500 10% 0.1250 1.0600 70% 0.7420 1.2550 10% 0.1255 1.1125
3463 State Street, #522
Santa Barbara, CA 93105
805/563-4922/ Fax 805/898-0805
License Number: 812136

Pavement Recycling Systems No Bid Submitted 10% 10% 70% 10%
121 N. Main Street
Riverside, CA 92501-1023
951/682-1091/ Fax 951/682-1094

Berry General Engineering No Bid Submitted 10% 10% 70% 10%
P.O. Box 1457
Ventura, CA 93002
805/643-7482/Fax 805/643-7482

Tierra Contractors No Bid Submitted 10% 10% 70% 10%
5484 Overpass Road
Goleta, CA 93111
805/964-8747/Fax 805/964-4438

Lash Construction Inc. No Bid Submitted 10% 10% 70% 10%
721 Carpinteria Street
Santa Barbara, CA 93103
805/963-3553/Fax 805/965-8189

Granite Construction Company 1.3030 10% 0.1303 1.3515 10% 0.1352 1.2516 70% 0.8761 1.3016 10% 0.1302 1.2717
5335 Debbie Lane
Santa Barbara, CA 93111
805/964-9951/Fax 805/964-7661
License Number: 89

Papich Construction Company Inc 1.1689 10% 0.1169 1.1689 10% 0.1169 1.1689 70% 0.8182 1.1689 10% 0.1169 1.1689
1686 Ramona Ave, Suite D
Grover Beach, CA 93433
805/473-3016/Fax 805/481-5966
License Number: 767055

MTM Construction, Inc. 1.1500 10% 0.1150 1.1500 10% 0.1150 1.0900 70% 0.7630 1.0900 10% 0.1090 1.1020
16035 Phoenix Drive
City of Industry, CA 91745
626/934-1112/Fax 626/934-1113
License Number: 659142

Challenge Asphalt No Bid Submitted 10% 10% 70% 10%
118 Nopalitos Way
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
805/964-2616/Fax805/564-0586

Toro General Engineering 1.1495 10% 0.1150 1.3195 10% 0.1320 1.1148 70% 0.7804 1.2848 10% 0.1285 1.1557
P.O. Box 6285
Oxnard, CA 93031
805/483-4515/Fax 805/483-3635
License Number: 710580

Mendez Concrete No Bid Submitted 10% 10% 70% 10%
1210 Santa Paula Street
Santa Paula, CA 93060
805/525-8043/Fax 805/525-8057


