
Job Order Contract- Asbestos Abatement, Pb Related Construction Clean Demolition
FM080460-JOC
License: B, C-21, ASB, HAZ, DOSH

BID SUMMARY Project Manager: J. Ripley
Bid Opening Date:Wednesday December 3 2008 @ 2:30PM

Contractor: 
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Allied Industries, Inc 0.7853 50% 0.3927 0.7992 10% 0.0799 0.7512 30% 0.2254 0.7684 10% 0.0768 0.7748
11333 Vanowen Street Bid Rejected
North Hollywood, CA 91605 Bid Bond Irregularity
818/781-2490/ Fax 818/781-2496

Argus Contracting, Inc. 0.9658 50% 0.4829 1.2000 10% 0.1200 1.5150 30% 0.4545 1.0000 10% 0.1000 1.1574
2340 E. Artesia Blvd Bid Rejected
Long Beach,  CA 90805-1740 Bid Bond Irregularity
562/422-7370/ Fax 562/422-8703

Castlerock Environmental, Inc. 1.0000 50% 0.5000 1.3800 10% 0.1380 1.0000 30% 0.3000 1.3500 10% 0.1350 1.0730
12041 Mora Drive
 Santa Fe Springs, CA 90670-6073
562/941-9244/Fax 562/941-9204

Channel Coast Corporation No Bid Submitted 50% 10% 30% 10%
123 Santa Barbara Staree
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
805/899-1227/Fax 805/899-8690

CST Environmental, Inc. 1.5000 50% 0.7500 1.5000 10% 0.1500 2.0000 30% 0.6000 2.0000 10% 0.2000 1.7000
404 North Berry Street Bid Rejected
Brea, CA 92821-3104 Bid Bond Irregularity
714/672-3500/Fax 714/672-3501

Flagship PDG No Bid Submitted 50% 10% 30% 10%
1567 State College Blvd
Anaheim, CA 92806
714/780-0000/Fax 714/780-0290

Frank Schipper Construction No Bid Submitted 50% 10% 30% 10%
610 Cota Street
Santa Barbara, CA93103
805/963-4359/Fax 805/963-1270

Marcor Remediation Inc. 1.2750 50% 0.6375 1.5250 10% 0.1525 1.2500 30% 0.3750 1.5000 10% 0.1500 1.3150
DBA Marcor Environmental
16027 Carmenita Road
Cerritos, CA 90703
562/921-2733/Fax 562/921-2383

Matrix Environmental No Bid Submitted 50% 10% 30% 10%
2330 Cherry Industrial Circle
Long Beach, CA 90805
562/236-2704/Fax 562/236-2725

Miller Environmental Inc. 1.0200 50% 0.5100 1.2000 10% 0.1200 1.0200 30% 0.3060 1.2000 10% 0.1200 1.0560
2210 South Dupont Drive
Anaheim, CA 92806
714/385-0099/Fax 714/385-0011

V.A. C Environmental & Demo Contr. No Bid Submitted 50% 10% 30% 10%
5150 Goldman Ave, Unit B'
Moorpark, CA 93021
805/523-8894/Fax 805/523-7318
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