
Project:Eng. II Life Safety Improvements Addition
Project No.:  FM080324L/981320
University Representative: Frank Castanha

Estimated Construction Cost $9,025,000.00

ALTERNATES

 General Contractor Base Bid
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable Alternate #1

Alternate #2 
NOT USED Alternate #3 Alternate #4 Alternate #5

Base Bid & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates Total with all Alternates

Diana Building Corp.
295 N. Blosser Road $7,877,000.00 $1,750.00 20 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $101,000.00 $60,000.00 $7,912,000.00 $76,000.00 $7,988,000.00
Santa Maria, CA 93456 No Change Deduct
T:   805/925-9533   FAX: 805/928-2150 $7,947,000.00 Total + Alt 1

Subcontractors: $7,912,000.00 Total + Alt 3
Earthwork & Demo - Schwann Brother's        Structural Steel - Junior Steel Co. Waterproofing - SB Surfacing Plaster - Stucco Concepts Aud. Seating - Sierra School $8,013,000.00 Total + Alt 4
Driller Piers - Calex Engineering        Steel Deck - Alexander Buggy Insulation - Masco Contr's Svcs Drywall - AGS Wall Sys. Fire Protection - Casco $7,852,000.00 Total + Alt 5
Underground - Victoria's Excavation        Metal Fab - Junior Steel Co. Roofing - Derrick's Roofing Acoust. Ceilings - Coustic Glo Plumbing/HVAC - JR Barto Htg.
Irrigation - C&S Landscape        Arch Join Sys. - Weiss S/M S/M Flash. - Weiss S/M Flooring - Floor Connection Electrical - Taft Electric 
Rebar - Vista Steel        Arch Woodwork - K&Z Cabinet Co Glazing/Curtain - Wolf CGS Painting - Vanguard Painting Sunshades - B & C Awnings

Douglas E. Barnhart Inc. NO BID
10760 Thornmint Rd. $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
San Diego, CA 92127
T:  858/385-8200    FAX: 858/385-8201

Subcontractors

Evans & Sons, Inc NO BID
25812 Springbrook Avenue $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Clarita, CA  91350
T:   661/254-8787  FAX: 661/254-5959

Subcontractors

Harbor Construction NO BID
15550 Rockfield Blvd. Ste B-100 $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Irvine, CA 92613
T:  949/457-1888    FAX: 949/457-9888

Subcontractors
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JMR Cosntruction
90 Blue Ravine Road $8,450,000.00 $1,500.00 20 $30,000.00 $20,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $127,000.00 -$60,000.00 $8,480,000.00 $87,000.00 $8,567,000.00
Folsom, CA 95630 No Alternate Deduct
T:   916/357-5167   FAX: 916/357-5172 Price given

Subcontractors $8,500,000.00 Total + Alt 1
Flooring - Floor Connection        Electic - Taft Drywall - Tarlton $8,480,000.00 Total + Alt 3
Sunshades - BC        Earthwork demo - Swan $8,607,000.00 Total + Alt 4
Fire Sprink. - R & R Fire Protection        Metal Deck - Martn Metal $8,540,000.00 Total + Alt 5
Plumbing - Rutan       Window - Spectrum
HVAC - Dahl        Plaster - Stucco Concepts

Lack Construction NO BID
420 East Carrillo Street $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
T:  805/963-3600    FAX: 805/963-6060

Subcontractors

SaifCo Construction NO BID
31368 Via Colinas, Ste 102 $0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Westlake Village, CA 91362
T:  818/584-0096    FAX: 818/584-0098

Subcontractors

Viola Inc.
1144 Commericial Ave. $7,815,000.00 $1,650.00 20 $33,000.00 $33,000.00 $0.00 $20,000.00 $95,000.00 $56,000.00 $7,848,000.00 $92,000.00 $7,940,000.00
Oxnard, CA 93031 Deduct
T:   805/487-3871   FAX:  805/487-3870

Subcontractors $7,881,000.00 Total + Alt 1
Demo/Earthwork - Schwan        Structural Steel - Junior S/M Flash. & Trim - Weiss Acoustical - Coustic-Glo $7,868,000.00 Total + Alt 3
Drilled Piles - Calex        Metal Decking - Alexander Buggy Steel Doors Frames & Hdwr. - Door Stop Spl. Coloration Concrete - SB Surfacing $7,943,000.00 Total + Alt 4
Landscaping & Irrigation - Ployboy        Metal Fab. & Rail. - Junior Curtain Wall Glass & Glazing - Wolf Carpet & Resil. Flr. - AC Ramirez $7,792,000.00 Total + Alt 5
Rebar - Vista        Waterproofing/Joint Sealants - SB Surfacing Metal Studs & Drywall - AGS Painting & Coatings - Certapro
Cast in  Place Concrete - DJS        Roofing - Derricks Lath & Plaster - Stucco Alum. Sun Shade - B & C
Fire sprinklers - Cja;;emge        Plumbing - M/M HVAC - Environmental Electrical, Comm & FA -  Taft

$0.00 20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Bid Open: Tuesday, June 10, 2008, 2:30 PM


