
Bid Summary
Francisco Torres Towers Deck Waterproofing Repair

FM070488S/292-71

Bid Opening Date: Wednesday,
June 27, 2007 @ 2:30PM

Project Manager: G. Levinthal

Contractor Base Bid Compensable Delay Days Total Compensable Base Bid Plus Compensable 
Delay Total

Best Waterproofing Services $199,884.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $199,884.00 $199,884.00

19027 S. Hamilton Ave.

Gardena, CA. 90248

 PH: 310-328/-6969         FAX: 310-328-9176

Subcontractor(s) 

Removal/Shotblast - EER, Inc.

Blason Industries No Bid Submitted 10
P.O. Box 2222
Monrovia, CA. 91017
PH: 626-301-0550       FAX: 626-301-0039

Brooks Quality Coatings No Bid Submitted 10

P.O. Box 4486

Santa Barbara, CA. 93140

PH: 805-966-5020      FAX: 805-966-5020

Cambron Roofing No Bid Submitted 10
P.O. Box 743

Goleta, CA. 93427

PH: 805-685-9496        FAX: 805-685-7791

Color Concepts No Bid Submitted 10
15115 Alondra Blvd.

La Mirada, CA. 90638

PH: 714-883-9697         FAX: 714-690-1231
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Craig Roofing Company $259,511.00 $1,500.00 10 $15,000.00 $274,511.00 $274,511.00

132 Garden Street

Santa Barbara, CA. 93101

PH: 805-966-5331          FAX: 805-962-1168

Subcontractor(s)

Removal of Coating - Sierra Sandblasting and Painting

Derrick's Roofing $194,990.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $0.00 $194,990.00

650 Ward Drive

Santa Barbara, CA. 93111

PH: 805-681-9954         FAX: 805-681-9952

Subcontractor(s)

Removal of Coating - Sierra Sandblasting and Painting

Kitson Specialty Contracting, Inc. No Bid Submitted 10
10370 Slusher Drive #49

Santa Fe Springs, CA. 90670

PH: 562-941-1949       562-9416408

Lack Construction No Bid Submitted 10
420 E. Carillo Street

Santa Barbara, CA. 93101

PH 805-963-3600       FAX 805-963-6060

Newton Painting No Bid Submitted 10
871 Summerland Ave.

San Pedro, CA. 90731

PH: 805-831-0830         FAX: 805-831-0830
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Santa Barbara Surfacing $101,038.38 $500.00 10 $5,000.00 $106,038.38 $106,038.38

5208 Calle Cristobal

Santa Barbar, CA. 93111

PH: 805-683-4085       FAX: 805-683-3327

Sierra Sandblasting & Painting No Bid Submitted 10
303 Cinderella Lane

Santa Barbara, CA. 93111

PH: 805-967-0389       FAX: 805-964-5548

Slater Waterproofing, Inc. No Bid Submitted 10

5577 Arrow Hwy

Montclair, CA. 91763

PH: 909-985-91000         FAX: 909-949-2431

Southwest Coatings $97,800.00 $250.00 10 $2,500.00 $100,300.00 $100,300.00

503 Kharker Street

San Pedro, CA. 90731

PH: 310-519-0422        FAX:    310-519-0698

Techno Coatings No Bid Submitted 10
1391 Allec Street

Anahiem, CA92805

PH: 714-635-1130    FAX: 714-635-6357

Tower Roofing $118,000.00 $500.00 10 $5,000.00 $123,000.00 $123,000.00

5094 La Ramada

Santa Barbara, CA. 93111

PH: 805-967-8281         FAX: 805-683-0900

William Cornell Construction No Bid Submitted 10
1300 Saratoga Ave., Unit 607

Ventura, CA. 93003

PH: 805-300-4803              FAX:  None
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