
Bid Summary
Harold Frank Hall HVAC Upgrade Floors 1-5

FM070432L/211-09

Bid Opening Date: Tuesday
October 16, 2007 @ 2:30PM

Project Manager: J. VanThyne

License Requirements:  B AND C-20 
Estimated Construction cost: 
$1,321,700.0

Contractor Base Bid Compensable Delay Days Total Compensable Base Bid Plus Compensable 
Delay Total

Carroll Construction  $1,537,000.00 $100.00 5 $500.00 $1,537,500.00 $1,537,500.00
216 E. Gutierrez Street
Santa Barbara, Ca 93101
805/966-4810 FAX 805/966-5654
Reject Bid License requirements not met.

subcontractors:

Alpha Plumbing

Taft Electric

Pacific Acoustics

CTAC, Inc  $1,768,000.00 $1,000.00 5 $5,000.00 $1,773,000.00 $1,773,000.00

520 E. Carson Plaza Ct, Ste 212

Carson, CA 90746

310/324-3443 FAX 310/324-3262

License B & C-20

subcontractors:

J.R. Barto

Taft Electric

Pacific Acoustics

Dahl A/C

Dahl Insulation No Bid Received 5

30 S. La Patera Lane Ste 9

Goleta, Ca 93117

805/964-2002  FAX 805/683-7654

subcontractors:

Environmental Heating and A/C  No Bid Received 5

821 N. Maulhardt Avenue

Oxnard, CA 93030

805/278-4425  FAX 805/278-4420

subcontractors:

Imperial Electric No Bid Received 5

6445 Calle Real

Goleta, CA 93117

805/681-0676  FAX 805/681-0703

subcontractors:
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JMPE No Bid Received

156 W. Alamar

Santa Barbara, CA 93105

805/569-9620

subcontractors:

Los Angeles Air Conditioning  $2,556,000.00 $300.00 5 $1,500.00 $2,557,500.00 $2,557,500.00

1714 Lindbergh Court

La Verne, CA 91750

909/596-7077 FAX 909/596-6657

License B & C-20

subcontractors:

P&E Insulation

American Air Balance

Bayshore Building Interiors

Rymax Electric

Dahl A/C

Newton Construction  $1,580,000.00 $400.00 5 $2,000.00 $1,582,000.00 $1,582,000.00

259 Higuera Street

San Luis Obispo, CA 93401

805/544-5583 FAX 805/544-5584

Reject Bid License requirements not met.

Subcontractors: 

Alpha Plumbing

Pacific Acoustics

Dahl A/C

Percisions Air

Sheldon Mechanical Corporation No Bid Received 5

21130 Centre Pointe Parkway

Santa Clarita, CA 91350

661/286-1361 FAX 661/287-9083

subcontractors:



Bid Summary
Harold Frank Hall HVAC Upgrade Floors 1-5

FM070432L/211-09

Bid Opening Date: Tuesday
October 16, 2007 @ 2:30PM

Project Manager: J. VanThyne

License Requirements:  B AND C-20 
Estimated Construction cost: 
$1,321,700.0

Contractor Base Bid Compensable Delay Days Total Compensable Base Bid Plus Compensable 
Delay Total

Brannon dba Smith Electric Service  $1,483,946.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $1,483,946.00 $1,483,946.00

2335 Meredith Lane

Santa Maria, CA 93455

805/922-6243 FAX 805/349-7270

License B & C-20

subcontractors:

American Air Balance

Pacific Acoustics North

Channel Island Roofing

Smith Engineering No Bid Received 5

920 DeLaVina

Santa Barbara, CA 93101

805/966-2877 FAX 805/966-2628

subcontractors:

Viola Construction Co.  $1,593,000.00 $1,000.00 5 $5,000.00 $1,598,000.00 $1,598,000.00

1144 Commercial Avenue

Oxnard, CA 93031

805/487-3871 FAX 805/487-3870

Reject Bid License requirements not met.

subcontractors:

M&T Concrete

Pacific Acoustics

Environmental

Imperial Electric


