Project: New Chiller System Biology Il Bldg. 571

Project No.: FM100281L/137-14

University Representative: Croft Yjader

Estimated Construction Cost: $1,945,748.00

BASE BID

COMPENSABLE DELAY

TOTAL PROJECT COST

General Contractor

Base Bid

Compensable
Delay

Days

Total

Compensable

Total

ACCO Engineered Systems

6265 San Fernando Road

10

Glendale, CA 90201

NO BID SUBMITTED

T: 818/730-5672 FAX: 818/548-4402

Subcontractors

Boneso Brothers

2753 Concrete Street

$1,977,523.00

$0.00

10

$0.00 $1,977,523.00

Paso Robles, CA 93446

T: 805/227-4450 FAX: 805/227-4502

Subcontractors

Concrete - MRK Construction

Insulation - Dahl Air Conditioning

Controls - Johnson Controls

Electrical - Venco Electric

Brannon Inc., DBA Smith Electric Service

1340 W. Betteravia Road

10

Santa Maria, CA 93455

NO BID SUBMITTED

T: 805/621-5000 FAX: 805/621-5050

Subcontractors

Churchill's Air Conditioning

1718 E. Main Street

10

Ventura, CA 93001

NO BID SUBMITTED

T: 805/658-1120 FAX: 805/652-1151

Subcontractors

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, Tuesday, May 10, 2011



Project: New Chiller System Biology Il Bldg. 571 University Representative: Croft Yjader

Project No.: FM100281L/137-14 Estimated Construction Cost: $1,945,748.00
BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST
Compensable Total
General Contractor Base Bid Delay Days Compensable Total

Dahl, Taylor & Associates, Inc.

2960 Daimler Street $2,906,243.00 $2,500.00 10 $25,000.00 $2,931,243.00

Santa Ana, CA 92705

T: 949/756-8654 ext.206 FAX: 949/502-0777
Subcontractors ACM LBP Removal - Marcor Environmental

Mechanical - Couts Heating & Cooling Inc.

Electrical - Taft Electric

Controls - Johnson Controls

EJS Construction Inc.
4998 Foothill Rd 10
Carpinteria, CA 93013 NO BID SUBMITTED
T: 805/684-6381 FAX: 805/684-6312
Subcontractors

Environmental Heating and A/C
821 N. Maulhardt Avenue $2,115,000.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $2,115,000.00
Oxnard, CA 93030

T: 805/278-4425 FAX: 805/278-4420

Subcontractors Electrical - Qilfield Electric
Controls - Johnson Control Test & Balance - Precision
Concrete - Hillrise Develop Cooling Tower Service - Air Treatment
Water Treatment - Walco Insulation - Dahl

Los Angeles Air Conditioning
1714 Lindbergh Court $2,023,800.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $2,023,800.00
LaVerne, CA 91750

T: 909/596-7077 FAX: 909/596-6657

Subcontractors Insulation - Dahl Air Conditioning
Controls - Johnson Controls Carpentry & Concrete Work - Precise Framing
Electrical - Rymax Rigging & Demo - Specialty Crane

Water Balance - Precision Air Balance

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, Tuesday, May 10, 2011



Project: New Chiller System Biology Il Bldg. 571
Project No.: FM100281L/137-14

University Representative: Croft Yjader
Estimated Construction Cost: $1,945,748.00

BASE BID

COMPENSABLE DELAY
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General Contractor
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Compensable
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Compensable Total

Lyles Mechanical

5085 E. McKinley PO BOX 4287

$2,185,000.00

$750.00

10

$7,500.00 $2,192,500.00

Fresno, CA 93727 Fresno, CA 93744

T: 559/441-1900 FAX: 559/487-7949

Subcontractors

Electrical - Westech Systems

Controls - Johnson Controls

Crane - Specialty Crane & Riggin

Insulation - F. Rodgers

TAB - Air Control Balancing

M/M Mechanical

1027 Cindy Lane

10

Carpinteria, CA 93013

NO BID SUBMITTED

T:805/745-1126  FAX: 805/745-1116

Subcontractors

M R K Construction

9596 Mignonette

10

Alta Loma, CA 97101

NO BID SUBMITTED

T: 909/944-9383 FAX: 909/758-8440

Subcontractors

Newton Construction and Management Inc.

259 Higuera St PO BOX 3260

$2,025,000.00

$100.00

10

$1,000.00 $2,026,000.00

San Luis Obispo, CA 93401 SLO, CA 93403

T: 805/544-5583 FAX: 805/544-5584

Subcontractors

Controls - Johnson Controls

Mechanical - Alpha Plumbing & Mechanical

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, Tuesday, May 10, 2011



Project: New Chiller System Biology Il Bldg. 571 University Representative: Croft Yjader

Project No.: FM100281L/137-14 Estimated Construction Cost: $1,945,748.00
BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST
Compensable Total
General Contractor Base Bid Delay Days Compensable Total

Onsite Construction & Engineering Inc.
720 S. Frontage Road Suites 104/105 $2,217,372.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $2,217,372.00
Nipomo, CA 93444

T: 805/929-0326 FAX: 805/929-0267

Subcontractors Cooling Tower Upgrade - Air Treatment Corp. Chiller Certification - DMG Corporation (Supplier)
Insulation & Jackets - Dahl Insulation Crane Service - Specialty Crane Assembly of Chillers - Mcquay Corp. (Manufacturer)
Chemical Treatment - Nalco Company Electrical - Taft Electric
Controls - Johnson Controls Demo Abatement - MEC Environmental Inc.

University Mechanical & Engineering Contractors, Inc.
1000 N. Kraemer Place $2,477,500.00 $1,100.00 10 $11,000.00 $2,488,500.00
Anaheim, CA 92806

T: 714/632-2600 FAX: 714/632-7500

Subcontractors Cooling Tower Fan Change - BAC Service Rep. Air Treatment Corp.
Div 16 Electrical - Taft Electric TAB 15590 - ABCO
Controls 15950 - Johnson Controls Insulation 15260 - P&E Insulation

Water Treatment 15180 - NALCO Chemical

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, Tuesday, May 10, 2011



