BASE BID		COMPENSABLE DELAY			ALTERNATES	ROJECT COST			
General Contractor	Base Bid	Compensable Delay		Total Compensable		Base Bid & Compensable Delays	Total Alternates		Total with all Alternates
JM Roofing Co. Inc. dba Action Roofing	Dase Diu	Delay	Days	Compensable	Allemale #1	Delays	Total Alternates		Allemales
524 E. Ortege Street	¢244 527 00	¢0.00	10	¢0.00	¢5 600 00	¢044 507 00	¢5 600 00		¢250.247.00
534 E. Ortega Street	\$244,527.00	\$0.00	10	\$0.00	\$5,690.00	\$244,527.00	\$5,690.00		\$250,217.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93103									
T: 805/966-3696 FAX: 805/966-6102									
Subcontractors									
Tear Off - Eagle Roof Removal									
Concrete Cutting - Santa Barbara Concrete Cutting	g								
Angeles Roofing									
617 E. Gutierrez Unit A		1	10	\$0.00					
Santa Barbara, CA 93101	NO BID SUBMITTED			\$0.00					
T: 805/886-3330 FAX: 805/963-6672	NO BID COBINITIED								
Subcontractors									
B&M Tear Off								_	
2420 Sandcreek Rd			10	\$0.00					
Brentwood, CA 94513	NO BID SUBMITTED								
T: 925/628-7760 FAX: 925/755-9572									
Subcontractors									
BEST Constracting Services Inc.									
19027 S. Hamilton Avenue	\$269,485.00	\$0.00	10	\$0.00	\$14,000.00	\$269,485.00	\$14,000.00		\$283,485.00
Gardena, CA 90248	\$209,485.00	φ0.00	10	φ0.00	\$14,000.00	\$209,403.00	\$14,000.00		φ203,403.00
T: 310/328-6969 FAX: 310/328-9176									
Subcontractors									
Tear off - B&M Tear off									
Cambron Roofing and Waterproofing									
7334 Hollister Avenue, Ste F PO Box	\$248,730.00	\$0.00	10	\$0.00	\$7,100.00	\$248,730.00	\$7,100.00		\$255,830.00
	leta, 93116								
T: 805/685-9496 FAX: 805/685-7791									
Subcontractors									
Roof Removal - Eagle Roof Removal		1							
		1							
l			I						

BASE BID		COMPENSABLE DELAY			ALTERNATES	TOTAL PROJECT COST		
General Contractor	Base Bid	Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Alternate #1	Base Bid & Compensable Delays	Total Alternates	Total with all Alternates
Channel Islands Roofing								
4155 N. Southbank Rd.	\$280,744.00	\$0.00	10	\$0.00	\$3,840.00	\$280,744.00	\$3,840.00	\$284,584.00
Oxnard, CA 93036	\$200,111.00	\$0.00	10	\$0.00	\$0,010.00	φ200,7 T1.00	φ0,010.00	¢201,001.00
T: 805/485-1622 FAX: 805/485-8634								
Subcontractors								
Roof Demolition - Honeycutt Tear Off								
Craig Roof Company	\$005 005 00	\$0.00	10	¢0.00	0,000,00	\$265 205 00	00000	¢074.005.00
132 Garden St Unit T-1 Santa Barbara, CA 93101	\$265,305.00	\$0.00	10	\$0.00	\$9,000.00	\$265,305.00	\$9,000.00	\$274,305.00
T: 805/966-5331 FAX: 805/962-1168								
Subcontractors								
Demo - Eagle								
Derrick's Roofing								
650 Ward Drive, Ste F	\$273,742.00	\$0.00	10	\$0.00	\$11,250.00	\$273,742.00	\$11,250.00	\$284,992.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93111	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·				, ,	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	, ,	· · · · · · · ·
T: 805/681-9954 FAX: 805/681-9952								
Subcontractors								
Concrete Cutting - Santa Barbara Concrete Cutting						ALT.#1 -		
Demo - Eagle Roof Removal						Concrete Cutting	ete	
Mech. Unit - Montie Wayne						Demo - Eagle Ro		
Pacific Builders & Roofing dba WSP Roofing								
8150 Sierra College Blvd. #200	\$299,995.00	\$2,758.00	10	\$27,580.00	\$8,512.00	\$327,575.00	\$8,512.00	\$336,087.00
Roseville, CA 95661								
T: 916-784-6655 FAX: 916-784-2233								
Subcontractors								
None Listed								
Webco Inc.			10	¢0.00				
2451 Easman Ave, Suite 16 Oxnard, Ca 93030	NO BID SUBMITTED		10	\$0.00				
T: 805/981-8181 FAX: 805/981-8883								
1. 605/961-6161 FAX. 605/961-6665 Subcontractors								
Subcontractors								