
Robertson Gymnasium Re-Roofing, Bldg. 533
Project No.:  FM100345S/101-78

University Representative: Daniel Belding
Estimated Construction Cost: $675,000.00 

ALTERNATES

 General Contractor Base Bid
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable Alternate #1

Base Bid & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates

Action Roofing
534 E. Ortega 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93103 NO BID SUBMITTED 
T:    805-966-3696  FAX:  805-966-6102

Subcontractors

All American Roofing
412 Construction Ave 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Camarillo, CA 93012 NO BID SUBMITTED 
T:   805-388-2121   FAX:  805-388-2304

Subcontractors

Anning Johnson Co.
13250 Temple $446,000.00 $500.00 30 $15,000.00 $322,000.00 $461,000.00 $322,000.00 $783,000.00
Industry, CA 91745
T:  626-369-7131   FAX:  626-336-3673

Subcontractors
Roofing Demolition: Honeycutt
ACM Abatement: Brickley Environmental 

Architectural Accent
1388 La Culebra Circle 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Camarillo, CA 93012 NO BID SUBMITTED 
T:    805-302-4507  FAX:  805-435-1733

Subcontractors

Best Contracting Services
19027 S. Hamilton Ave. $470,700.00 $0.00 30 $0.00 $311,700.00 $470,700.00 $311,700.00 $782,400.00
Gardena, CA  90248
T: 310-328-6969      FAX:  310-328-9176

Subcontractors
Demolition:  A to Z Environmental Service Inc.
ACM:  FCG & Company 

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, Friday, August 19, 2011
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Cambron Roofing
PO Box 743 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Goleta, CA 93116 NO BID SUBMITTED 
T:    805-685-9496  FAX: 805-685-7791

Subcontractors

Channel Coast Corp
123 Santa Barbara St. 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101 NO BID SUBMITTED 
T:  805-899-1227    FAX: 805-899-8690

Subcontractors

Channel Islands Roofing
4155 N. Southbank Road $422,800.00 $0.00 30 $0.00 $273,700.00 $422,800.00 $273,700.00 $696,500.00
Oxnard, CA 93030
T:   805-485-1622   FAX:  805-485-8634

Subcontractors
Tear Off:  FCG & Co. Inc. Alternate #1 - Abatement:  FCG & Co. Inc.
Abatement:  FCG & Co. Inc. Alternate #1 - Tear Off:  FCG & Co. Inc.

CI Services
26861 Trabuco Rd. #353 $850,000.00 $455.00 30 $13,650.00 $863,650.00 $0.00 $863,650.00
Mission Viejo, CA 92691 No Change
T:    714-678-8828  FAX:  866-305-6010

Subcontractors
Tear Off:  Roof Removal
Abatement: Roof Removal 

Commercial Roofing Systems, Inc.
11735 Goldring Rd. $524,757.00 $1,200.00 30 $36,000.00 $296,940.00 $560,757.00 $296,940.00 $857,697.00
Arcadia, CA 91006
T:  626-359-5354     FAX:  626-359-2654

Subcontractors
Roof Demolition & Abatement: A to Z Environmental Alternate #1 - Roof Demolition & Abatement: A to Z Environmental Service Inc.

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, Friday, August 19, 2011
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Craig Roof Company, Inc.
132 Garden Street $419,814.00 $0.00 30 $0.00 $313,186.00 $419,814.00 $313,186.00 $733,000.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
T:  805-966-5331    FAX:  805-962-1168

Subcontractors
Demo & Abatement:  A to Z Environmental/ FCG & Co.

Custom Home Remodeling
217 Palos Verdes Blvd. #110 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Redondo Beach, CA 90277 NO BID SUBMITTED 
T:    310-897-0720  FAX:  310-316-6594

Subcontractors

Derrick's Roofing, Inc.
650 Ward Dr. Suite F 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93111 NO BID SUBMITTED 
T:   805-681-9954   FAX:  805-681-9952

Subcontractors

McDonnell Roofing Inc
1440 South State College Blvd 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Anaheim, CA 92806 NO BID SUBMITTED 
T:    714-844-2814  FAX:  714-844-2817

Subcontractors

Midstate Sheetmetal 
2604 B 'Q' Street 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Bakersfield, CA  93301 NO BID SUBMITTED 
T: 661-322-8009     FAX:  661-322-7545

Subcontractors

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, Friday, August 19, 2011
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Pacific Single Ply
PO Box 217 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
La Habra, CA 90633 NO BID SUBMITTED 
T:  562-691-3999    FAX:  562-691-5852

Subcontractors

Progressive Roofing
17805 Comconex Rd. 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Manteca, CA 95336 NO BID SUBMITTED 
T:    209-663-0862  FAX:  209-824-7235

Subcontractors

Richter Roofing Co Inc.
1405 W. Magnolia B 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Burbank, CA  91506 NO BID SUBMITTED 
T:   818-955-9094   FAX: 818-841-4349

Subcontractors

West American Roofing
1111 Rancho Conejo Bldg. Unit 504 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Newbury Park, CA 91320 NO BID SUBMITTED 
T:    818-991-1489  FAX:  805-375-8233

Subcontractors

Western States Roof System, Inc.
18605 Parthenia St. 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Northridge, CA 91324 NO BID SUBMITTED 
T:  818-718-0770    FAX:  818-718-1240

Subcontractors

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, Friday, August 19, 2011
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Pacific Builders & Roofing dbaWSP Roofing
8150 Sierra College Blvd. 200 $347,188.00 $0.00 30 $0.00 $267,559.00 $347,188.00 $267,559.00 $614,747.00
Roseville, CA 95661
T:   916-784-6655   FAX:  916-784-2233

Subcontractors
Asbestos Abatement: A to Z Environmental

Waterproofing Experts, Inc.
7736 Deering Ave. $445,800.00 $0.00 30 $0.00 $280,600.00 $445,800.00 $280,600.00 $726,400.00
Canoga Park, CA 91304
T:    818-592-6392  FAX:  818-592-6716

Subcontractors
Standard Demolition:  A to Z Environmental Services 
Lead Abatement & Asbestos Removal:  FCG & Company, Inc. 

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, Friday, August 19, 2011


