

Project: HSSB Dance Drama High Tower PVC Roof Replacement

Project No.: FM110569S/980835

Estimated Construction Cost: \$436,500

University Representative: Joe Van Thyne, Project Manager

BASE BID		COMPENSABLE DELAY			TOTAL PROJECT COST
General Contractor	Base Bid	Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Base Bid w/unit prices & Compensable Delays
4 Seasons RFG, Inc. 1300 W. Colegrove Ave. Montebello, CA 90640	NO BID SUBMITTED		10	\$0.00	\$0.00
T: FAX: Subcontractors					
A to Z Environmental 15220 Gard Avenue Norwalk, CA	NO BID SUBMITTED		10	\$0.00	\$0.00
T: FAX: Subcontractors					
Action Roofing 534 E. Ortega Street Santa Barbara, CA 93103	\$445,744.00	\$0.00	10	\$0.00	\$445,744.00
T:805-966-3696 FAX: 805-966-6102 Subcontractors					
Crane Lifts: Specialty Crane & Rigging					
Best Contracting 19027 S. Hamilton Avenue Gardena, CA 90748	\$566,200.00	\$0.00	10	\$0.00	\$566,200.00
T: 310-328-6969 FAX: 310-329-9176 Subcontractors					
Demolition:A to Z Environmental Service, Inc.					
Plumbing: Performance Contractors, Inc.					
Cambron Roofing 7334 Hollister Ave., #J, P.O. Box 743		\$0.00	10	\$0.00	\$0.00

Bid Open: 8/23/11 Time: 2:30 p.m.

Project: HSSB Dance Drama High Tower PVC Roof Replacement

Project No.: FM110569S/980835

Estimated Construction Cost: \$436,500

University Representative: Joe Van Thyne, Project Manager

BASE BID		COMPENSABLE DELAY			TOTAL PROJECT COST
General Contractor	Base Bid	Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Base Bid w/unit prices & Compensable Delays
Goleta, CA 93117	NO BID SUBMITTED				
T: FAX:					
Subcontractors					
Channel Islands Roofing					
4155 Southbank Road	\$438,777.00	\$0.00	10	\$0.00	\$438,777.00
Oxnard, CA 93030					
T: 805-485-1622 FAX: 805-485-8634					
Subcontractors					
Crane: Specialty Crane & Rigging					
EFIS Repairs: Specialty Team Plastering, Inc.					
Commercial Roofing Systems, Inc.					
11735 Goldring Rd.		\$0.00	10	\$0.00	\$0.00
Arcadia, CA 91006	NO BID SUBMITTED				
T: FAX:					
Subcontractors					
Derrick's Roofing					
650 Ward Drive, Ste. F	\$422,774.00	\$0.00	10	\$0.00	\$422,774.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93111					
T: 805-681-9954 FAX: 805-681-9952					
Subcontractors					
Golden State Roofing					
19703 Eddington Dr.		\$0.00	10	\$0.00	\$0.00
Carson, CA 90746	NO BID SUBMITTED				

Bid Open: 8/23/11 Time: 2:30 p.m.

Project: HSSB Dance Drama High Tower PVC Roof Replacement

Project No.: FM110569S/980835

Estimated Construction Cost: \$436,500

University Representative: Joe Van Thyne, Project Manager

BASE BID		COMPENSABLE DELAY			TOTAL PROJECT COST
General Contractor	Base Bid	Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Base Bid w/unit prices & Compensable Delays
T: FAX:					
Subcontractors					
IB Roofing Systems					
1207 Accabar St.		\$0.00	10	\$0.00	\$0.00
Bakersfield, CA 93327	NO BID SUBMITTED				
T: FAX:					
Subcontractors					
Newton Construction					
P.O. Box 3260		\$0.00	10	\$0.00	\$0.00
San Luis Obispo, CA 93403	NO BID SUBMITTED				
T: FAX:					
Subcontractors					
Sika Sarnafil					
2822 Dove Tail Drive		\$0.00	10	\$0.00	\$0.00
San Marcos, CA 92078	NO BID SUBMITTED				
T: FAX:					
Subcontractors					
T. Angeles Roofing					
P.O. Box 40837		\$0.00	10	\$0.00	\$0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93140	NO BID SUBMITTED				
T: FAX:					
Subcontractors					

Bid Open: 8/23/11 Time: 2:30 p.m.

Project: HSSB Dance Drama High Tower PVC Roof Replacement

Project No.: FM110569S/980835

Estimated Construction Cost: \$436,500

University Representative: Joe Van Thyne, Project Manager

BASE BID		COMPENSABLE DELAY			TOTAL PROJECT COST
General Contractor	Base Bid	Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Base Bid w/unit prices & Compensable Delays
Tartlo and Son 440 B Stanton Arroyo Grande, CA 93420	NO BID SUBMITTED	\$0.00	10	\$0.00	\$0.00
T: FAX: Subcontractors					
Waterproofing Experts, Inc. 11735 Goldring Rd. Arcadia, CA 91006	\$482,203.00	\$0.00	10	\$0.00	\$482,203.00
T: 818-592-6392 FAX: 818-592-6716 Subcontractors					
Demolition: A to Z Environmental Services EIFS System Work: McPherson Plastering					
Western States Roof System, Inc. 18605 Parthenia St. Northridge, CA 91324	NO BID SUBMITTED	\$0.00	10	\$0.00	\$0.00
T: FAX: Subcontractors					

Bid Open: 8/23/11 Time: 2:30 p.m.