
Santa Ynez Landscaping
FM110334S/987768

Bid Summary University Representative: Daniel Belding
Estimated Construction Cost: $165,000.00 

OTAL PROJECT COST

 General Contractor Base Bid
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable

Base Bid & 
Compensable 
Delays Total

Acacia Erosion Control, Inc.
604 S. San Marcos Rd. $184,820.00 $1.00 30 $30.00 $184,850.00 $184,850.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93111
T: 805-964-2585     FAX:  805-964-6169

Subcontractors

American Gardens
PO Box 6740 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Torrance, CA 90504 NO BID SUBMITTED
T:  310-523-4678    FAX:  310-523-2095

Subcontractors

Azalea Landscape
1016 North Milpas $0.00 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA NO BID SUBMITTED
T:   805-882-0051  FAX:  805-882-1154

Subcontractors

Bob Trautz Land Development
509 Wentworth Avenue $0.00 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA  93101 NO BID SUBMITTED
T: 805-966-3537     FAX: 805-966-3537

Subcontractors

IWL Inc
415 N. Quarantina $0.00 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93103 NO BID SUBMITTED
T:  805-966-2907    FAX: 805-957-1947

Subcontractors

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, Wednesday, August 10, 2011
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JD Humann Inc.
PO Box 2205 $0.00 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Orcutt, CA 93455 NO BID SUBMITTED
T:  805-925-7744    FAX: 805-928-7877

Subcontractors

KCI Environmental, Inc.
545 Calle San Pablo $0.00 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Camarillo, CA 93010 NO BID SUBMITTED
T:    805-432-2387  FAX:  805-383-9003

Subcontractors

LCG Corp
350 S. Maple St. #L $0.00 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Corona, CA  92888 NO BID SUBMITTED
T:  951-549-0075    FAX:  951-549-9605

Subcontractors

Newton Construction  
259 Higuera Street 30
San Luis Obispo, CA 93401 Blank Blank
T:    805-544-5583   FAX: 805-544-5584

Subcontractors

Rock Bottom, Inc.
2724 Landco Dr. $134,656.00 $1,000.00 30 $30,000.00 $164,656.00 $164,656.00
Bakersfield, CA 93308
T: 661/859-1700      FAX:  661/859-1707

Subcontractors

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, Wednesday, August 10, 2011
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Santa Barbara Plumbing
137 Ocean View Ave $0.00 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Carpinteria, CA 93013 NO BID SUBMITTED
T: 805-684-4787     FAX:  805-684-5630

Subcontractors

Spiess Construction Co
1110 E. Clark Avenue, Suite U-2 $194,831.00 $100.00 30 $3,000.00 $197,831.00 $197,831.00
Santa Maria, CA 93455
T:   805-937-5859   FAX:  805-934-4432

Subcontractors
Irrigation & Planting: J.D. Humann

Valley Crest Landscape Maintenance
2910 Sherwin Ave. $143,700.00 $275.00 30 $8,250.00 $151,950.00 $151,950.00
Ventura, CA 93003
T:  805-642-9300    FAX:  805-642-6990

Subcontractors

Venco Western, Inc.
2400 Eastman Ave. $138,726.00 $125.00 30 $3,750.00 $142,476.00 $142,476.00
Oxnard, CA 93030
T:   805-981-2400   FAX:  805-983-7111

Subcontractors

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, Wednesday, August 10, 2011


