
Project: Campus Point Stair Access Way
Project No.: FM110220S/987767
University Representative: George Levinthal, Project Manager

Estimated Construction Cost: $156,000

 General Contractor Base Bid Unit Price
Unit 
Quantity Description

Total Unit 
Price

Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable

Base Bid w/unit prices & 
Compensable Delays

Acacia EC
604 S. San Marcos $260,065.00 $28.00 100 Addtnl. Drilling $2,800.00 $1.00 10 $10.00 $323,375.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101 $605.00 100 Steel Cage $60,500.00

$0.00 0 $0.00
T: 805-964-2585              FAX: 805-964-8661 $0.00 0 $0.00

Subcontractors $63,300.00
Hand Rail Metal Works: Goleta Fabrication Inc dba Precision Welding
Rebar: Vista Steel Co.

DJ Dunn Construction NO BID SUBMITTED
263 Meadow Road $0.00 100 Addtnl. Drilling $0.00 10 $0.00 $0.00
Buelton, CA 93927 $0.00 100 Steel Cage $0.00

$0.00 0 $0.00
T: 805-325-1652            FAX: 805-688-6450 $0.00 0 $0.00

Subcontractors $0.00

EJS Construction
4998 Foothill Road $275,000.00 $33.00 100 Addtnl. Drilling $3,300.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $284,100.00
Carpinteria, CA 93013 $58.00 100 Steel Cage $5,800.00

$0.00 0 $0.00
T: 805-648-3131              FAX: 805-648-4806 $0.00 0 $0.00

Subcontractors $9,100.00
Survey: Prober Land Survey
Handrail Welding: Goleta Fabrication
Site Grading: Coastal Construction

Newton Construction Management
259 Higuera Street $345,000.00 $30.00 100 Addtnl. Drilling $3,000.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $350,500.00
San Luis Obispo, CA 93401 $25.00 100 Steel Cage $2,500.00

$0.00 0 $0.00
T: 951-544--5583             FAX: 951-544-5584 $0.00 0 $0.00

Subcontractors $5,500.00
Grading/Excavation: CGI
Steel Handrail: J&D Fabrication
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Schock Contracting
P.O. Box 61505 $290,000.00 $30.00 100 Addtnl. Drilling $3,000.00 $1.00 10 $10.00 $295,460.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93160 $24.50 100 Steel Cage $2,450.00

$0.00 0 $0.00
T: 805-681-9796             FAX: 805-681-9717 $0.00 0 $0.00

Subcontractors $5,450.00
Casson Drilling: Terra Firma Drilling
Reinforcement Steel: Vista Steel

Southland Construction NO BID SUBMITTED
10760 Burbank Blvd. $0.00 100 Addtnl. Drilling $0.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $0.00
North Hollywood, CA 91601 $0.00 100 Steel Cage $0.00

$0.00 0 $0.00
$0.00 0 $0.00

T: 818-508-4134              FAX: 818-508-4141 $0.00 0 $0.00
Subcontractors $0.00

Spiess Construction NO BID SUBMITTED
1110 E. Clark Ave., Ste. 210 $0.00 100 Addtnl. Drilling $0.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Maria, CA 93455 $0.00 100 Steel Cage $0.00

$0.00 0 $0.00
T: 805-937-5859            FAX: 805- $0.00 0 $0.00

$0.00 0 $0.00
Subcontractors $0.00

Tierra Contracting NO BID SUBMITTED
5484 Overpass Road $0.00 100 Addtnl. Drilling $0.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93111 $0.00 100 Steel Cage $0.00

$0.00 0 $0.00
$0.00 0 $0.00

T: 805-964-8747            FAX: 805-964-4438 $0.00 0 $0.00
Subcontractors $0.00
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Project: Campus Point Stair Access Way
Project No.: FM110220S/987767
University Representative: George Levinthal, Project Manager

Estimated Construction Cost: $156,000

 General Contractor Base Bid Unit Price
Unit 
Quantity Description

Total Unit 
Price

Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable

Base Bid w/unit prices & 
Compensable Delays

BASE BID UNIT PRICES COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST

Tomar Construction 
120 S. Calavo Ste., Ste. B $218,700.00 $28.00 100 Addtnl. Drilling $2,800.00 $200.00 10 $2,000.00 $226,500.00
Santa Paula, CA 93060 $30.00 100 Steel Cage $3,000.00

$0.00 0 $0.00
T: 805-525-6500             FAX: 805-525-6565 $0.00 0 $0.00

Subcontractors $5,800.00
Survey: MNS Engineers
Drilling: Terra Firma
Metal Fabrication: Goleta Fabrication

Union Engineering
1399 Arundell Ave. $321,287.00 $93.00 100 Addtnl. Drilling $9,300.00 $660.00 10 $6,600.00 $340,137.00
Ventura, CA 93003 $29.50 100 Steel Cage $2,950.00

$0.00 0 $0.00
T: 805-644-3373              FAX: 805-644-3380 $0.00 0 $0.00

Subcontractors $12,250.00
Survey: Benner & Carpenter
Handrail / Misc. Iron: Goleta Fabrication dba Precision Welding

Bid Open: 9/13/11  Time: 2:30 p.m.


