
Art Museum Security and Access Control, Bldg. 534
Project No. FM110546S/987775

Bid Summary Estimated Construction Cost: $134,000.00
University Representative: Deedee Ciancola

TAL PROJECT COST

 General Contractor Base Bid
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable

Base Bid & 
Compensable 
Delays Total

ADT Security Services
9131 Oakdale Rd. 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Chatsworth, CA NO BID RECEIVED
T:  805/231-1483    FAX:  818/428-6775

Subcontractors

Brannon Inc. DBA Smith Electric Services
1340 W. Betteravia Road $188,385.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $188,385.00 $188,385.00
Santa Maria, CA 93455
T:   805/621-5000  FAX:  805/621-5050

Subcontractors
Security/Access - SSD Systems

Newton Construction Management
259 Higuera                                             PO Box 3260 $175,000.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00
San Luis Obispo, CA 93401              SLO, CA 93403
T:   805/544-5583   FAX:  805/544-5584

Subcontractors
Security - SSD Systems

Protection One
14801 Califia St. $0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Van Nuys, CA 91411 NO BID RECEIVED
T:   818/849-2536   FAX:   805/757-8607

Subcontractors

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY

Bid Open: 2:30PM, Thursday, September 15, 2011
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SSD Systems
1740 N. Lemon Street $0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Anaheim, CA 92801 NO BID RECEIVED
T:   714/449-9900   FAX:  714/449-0403

Subcontractors

Taft Electric
1694 Eastman Avenue $156,886.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $156,886.00 $156,886.00
Ventura, CA 93003
T:  805/688-0121     FAX: 805/688-0125

Subcontractors
Security/Access Control - SSD Systems

West Corporation
PO Box 414 $0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Cayucos, CA 93430 NO BID RECEIVED
T:    805/772-2863   FAX:  805/772-2893

Subcontractors

Bid Open: 2:30PM, Thursday, September 15, 2011


