
Exterior Painting, Events Center Bldg. 505
Project No.: FM120001S/421-89

BID SUMMARY Estimated Construction Cost:$105,000.00
University Representative: Croft Yjader

ALTERNATES

 General Contractor Base Bid Compensable Delay Days
Total 
Compensable Alternate #1 Alternate #2

Base Bid 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates

AGV Painting
1223 Carlton Dr 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Glendale, CA 91205 NO BID SUBMITTED
T:    818/437-0482  FAX:  818/545-8860

Subcontractors

Anemos Enterprises Inc.
12464 Brickellia St.          P.O. Box 722349 $114,000.00 $300.00 10 $3,000.00 $8,000.00 $10,000.00 $117,000.00 $18,000.00 $135,000.00
San Diego, CA 92129       San Diego, CA 92172
T:    858/538-3801  FAX:  858/538-3801

Subcontractors

Astro Painting Co
2988 S. Citrus St $0.00 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Covina, CA 91791 NO BID SUBMITTED
T:  626/966-3840   FAX: 626/332-1423

Subcontractors

Augustine Painting
125 N. Nopal Street $0.00 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101 NO BID SUBMITTED
T:    805/450-6162  FAX:  805/899-3204

Subcontractors

C.T. Georgiou Painting Co
433 Lecouvreur Ave $0.00 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Wilmington, CA 90744 NO BID SUBMITTED
T:    310/834-8015  FAX:  310/834-1660

Subcontractors

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST
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CBM Painting & Decoration Co
4230 W. Ave J-7 $0.00 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Lancaster, CA 93536 NO BID SUBMITTED
T:  661/718-2523    FAX:  661/943-5402

Subcontractors

Channel Coast Corp
123 Santa Barbara St $0.00 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101 NO BID SUBMITTED
T:  805/896-3827    FAX: 805/899-8690

Subcontractors

Cor-Ray Painting
10114 Shoemaker Ave $0.00 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Fe Springs, CA 90670 NO BID SUBMITTED
T:   805/331-9161   FAX:  805/734-6798

Subcontractors

Everlast Builders Inc
16654 Soledad Cyn Rd Ste #302 $65,000.00 $200.00 10 $2,000.00 $29,000.00 $100,000.00 $67,000.00 $129,000.00 $196,000.00
Canyon Country, CA 91387
T:   661/299-2353   FAX:  661/299-2248

Subcontractors

J & P Construction
2310 A Street $734,006.11 $5,000.00 10 $50,000.00 $40,848.58 $999,999.99 $784,006.11 $1,040,848.57 $1,824,854.68
Santa Maria, CA 93455
T:  805/352-1144    FAX:  805/922-8962

Subcontractors
Coatings - Universal coatings
Lead Abatement - MEC, Inc.
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McNall Painting
425 Conejo Lane $0.00 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93103 NO BID SUBMITTED
T:  805/966-3454    FAX: 

Subcontractors

Olympos Painting Inc
7933 Gloria Ave #9 $66,000.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $44,000.00 $22,000.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00 $132,000.00
Van Nuys, CA 91406
T:   818/904-0662   FAX:  818/904-0669

Subcontractors

Omega Construction
P.O. Box 7038 $78,000.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $39,000.00 $50,000.00 $78,000.00 $89,000.00 $167,000.00
Northridge , CA 91327
T:   818/364-9421   FAX:  818/968-1854

Subcontractors

Pacific Painting Co Inc
19025 Parthenia St $46,600.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $56,000.00 $21,000.00 $46,600.00 $77,000.00 $123,600.00
Northridge, CA 91324
T:   818/993-5899   FAX:  818/993-5895

Subcontractors

Piana Construction & Painting
16352 Barneston St $87,000.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $60,000.00 $30,000.00 $87,000.00 $90,000.00 $177,000.00
Granada Hills, CA 91844
T:  818/488-1740    FAX:  818/488-1740

Subcontractors
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Prime Painting Contractors Inc.
17033 Gledhill St $89,000.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $15,000.00 $0.00 $89,000.00 $15,000.00 $104,000.00
Northridge , CA 91325 N/A Refused
T:    818/833-8866  FAX:  818/833-3109

Subcontractors

South Coast Painting
29318 S. Highmore Ave $31,800.00 $100.00 10 $1,000.00 $20,800.00 $0.00 $32,800.00 $20,800.00 $53,600.00
Rancho Palos Verdes, CA 90275 No Change
T:     310/938-0368  FAX:  310/933-0287

Subcontractors

Specified Painting Systems
33562 Yucaipa Blvd #4-340 $0.00 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Yucaipa, CA  92399 NO BID SUBMITTED
T:   909/790-3670   FAX:  909/790-3670

Subcontractors

Tony Painting Inc
12882 Valley View St $58,500.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $17,850.00 $999,999.99 $58,500.00 $1,017,849.99 $1,076,349.99
Garden Grove, CA 92845
T:  714/899-5303    FAX:  714/899-5305

Subcontractors

U. S. National Corp
25667 Paseo Lauro Court $0.00 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Valencia, CA 91355 NO BID SUBMITTED
T:   661/212-1351   FAX:  661/894-0531

Subcontractors
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US Workway Painting
1267 Leggio Lane $89,000.00 $250.00 10 $2,500.00 $0.00 $0.00 $91,500.00 $0.00 $91,500.00
Upland, CA 91784 No Change No Change
T:    951/264-1500  FAX:  909/608-1063

Subcontractors

USNC
P.O. Box 4929 $0.00 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Panorama City, CA 91412 NO BID SUBMITTED
T:   818/894-8420   FAX:  818/894-0531

Subcontractors

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, October 6, 2011


