
Project: Admissions Office Suite 1234 Remodel, Bldg. 552
Project #: FM110556 S / 987769

Estimated Construction Cost: $215,680.00
University Representative: Jennifer Hernandez

Bid Open: Time: 2:30pm  Date: November 8, 2011 Apparent Lowest Responsible Bidder is highlighed in Yellow.

 General Contractor Base Bid Compensable Delay Days Total Compensable
Base Bid & 

Compensable Delays Total
Bottenfield Construction
24328 Apple St. No Bid Submitted 5 No Bid Submitted
Newhall, CA     91321
T: 805/ 648-4240     F: 805/648-4249

Subcontractors

Diani Building Corp.
351 N. Blosser Rd. $176,000.00 $200.00 5 $1,000.00 $177,000.00 $177,000.00
Santa Maria, CA     93456
T: 805/ 925-9533     F: 805/ 928-2150

Subcontractors
Glass & Glazing - Santa Barbara Glass     Flooring - Floor Connection     Painting - Cal Pro Painting     Acoustic Ceilings - Chaney Company
HVAC - J.R. Barto     Electrical - Vastola Electric     Communication Cabling - Pacific Coast

EJS Construction
4998 Foothill Rd. $172,510.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $172,510.00 $172,510.00
Carpinteria, CA     93013
T: 805/ 684-6381     F: 805/ 684-6446

Subcontractors
T-Bar Ceiling - Service Tech     Flooring - Floor Connection     HVAC - J.R. Barto
Data / Electrical - Good Service Electric     Paint - Cal tro Painting

Hoover Enterprises
2401 Eastman Ave. #21 No Bid Submitted 5 No Bid Submitted
Oxnard, CA     93030
T: 805/ 278-1116     F: 805/ 278-2240

Subcontractors

Jacob Construction
6717 Murro Rd. $215,940.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $215,940.00 $215,940.00
Atascadero, CA     93422
T: 805/ 460-6940     F: 805/ 460-6609

Subcontractors
Electrical - Pargon Industrial Applications     Communications - Hoover Enterprises     Mechanical - J.R. Barto     Flooring - Floor Connection, Inc.
Framing & Drywall - Hernandez Drywall     Partition & Ceiling - Woodward Acoustics, Inc.     Acoustical Insulation - American Eco Services
Doors & Windows - Integrity Millworks     Painting - Vanguard Painting
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Newton Construction
PO Box 3260 $202,500.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $202,500.00 $202,500.00
San Luis Obispo, CA     93403
T: 805/ 544-5583     F: 805/ 544-5584

Subcontractors
Flooring - Floor Connection     Painting - California Pro Painting     HVAC - Reed's Heating
Acoustical Ceiling - Chaney Company     Data - Pacifica Comm     Framing / Drywall - Premier

Paragon Industrial Application
7450 Santa Cruz Rd. No Bid Submitted 5 No Bid Submitted
Atascadero, CA     93422
T: 805/ 462-1355     F: 805/ 460-6609

Subcontractors

Place Construction & Development Inc.
610 Ridgeview Ct. No Bid Submitted 5 No Bid Submitted
Diamond Bar, CA     91765
T: 909/ 348-2542     F: 909/ 861-1440

Subcontractors

Quincon, Inc.
PO Box 1029 $181,351.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $181,351.00 $181,351.00
Grover Beach, CA     93483
T: 805/ 305-1150     F: 805/ 481-2440

Subcontractors
Demolition - Channel Coast Corporation     Doors & Windows - The Door Stop     Framing & Gypsum Board - Hernandez Drywall
Suspended Ceiling - Service Tech     Insulation - American Eco Services     Carpet - Flooring Connection     Painting - P. Tell Painting
Mechanical - J.R. Barto     Electrical - Vastola Electric     Communications - PacifiCom
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