
Bid Summary
East Entrance Road Improvements

FM060260S/126-17
Estimated Construction Cost: 1,800,000.00

PM: D. Ciancola
Bid Opening Date: Tuesday, March 14, 2006

Contractor Base Bid
Compensable 

Delay Days
Total 

Compensable  Unit (SF) Price 

Unit Price Total 
(17000 Est. 
Quanties) Alternates

Base Bid Plus 
Compensable Delays 

Plus Unit Price Total Total With Alternates

A.J. Diani Construction No Bid Submitted 30

Granite Construction $1,896,028.00 $100.00 30 $3,000.00 $4.50 $76,500.00 $1,975,528.00 $1,975,528.00 $2,208,528.00

5335 Debbie Lane 1.    D   $-5000.00

Santa Barbara, CA 93111 2.    D   $-34000.00

805/964-9951/ Fax 805/967-1431 3.    D   $-8000.00

4.   A   $280000.00

Subcontractors: 

Striping: Pro-Line Stripping

Electrical: Lee Wilson Electric Company, Inc.

Landscape: Azalea Landscape & Envir. Srv.

Signs: Karman LTD 

Stamped Concrete: Sullivan Concrete

J. D. Humann Landscape, Inc No bid Submitted 30

Lash Construction Inc $2,016,363.00 $1.00 30 $30.00 $2.00 $34,000.00 $2,050,393.00 $2,050,393.00 $2,497,433.00

721 Carpinteria Street 1.    D   $-5000.00

Santa Barbara, CA 93140 2.    D   $-34160.00

805/963-3553/ Fax 805/965-8189 3.    D   $-13800.00

4.   A    $500,000.00

Subcontractors: 

Stamped Concrete: Sullivan Concrete Textures

Digital Signs: Karman LTD 

Striping & Signs: Pro-Line Striping Inc.

Survey: Benner & Carpenter

Landscape: Azalea Landscape & Envir. Srv.

Clear & Grub: Pacific Tree Inc.

Electrical: Lee Wilson Elecric Company, Inc.

RQ Construction No Bid Submitted 30

Sansone Company, Inc. No Bid Submitted 30

Spiess Construction Company, Inc. No Bid Submitted 30

TSM No Bid Submitted 30

United Seal Coating & Slurryseal Inc. No Bid Submitted 30
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