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Contractor

Base Bid

Bid Summary

657 PSB Laboratory Hawker Laboratory Renovation
FM060660S/980790

Estimated Construction Costs: $165,000.00

Compensable Delay

Days

Total Compensable

Base Bid Plus Compensable Delays

Project Manager: J. Gonzales
Bid Opening Date: Friday, September 29, 2006 @ 2:30PM

Total

Brannon Inc., DBA Smith Electric Service
2335 Meredith Lane

Santa Maria, CA 93455
805/922-6243/ Fax 805/349-7270

Subcontractors:

Lab Equipment: ISEC, Inc.

Paint: Vanguard Painting, Inc

Epoxy Floor: Epic Contracting, Inc.

Fire Sprinkler: S&M Fire Protection

Controls: Johnson Controls, Inc.

Roofing: Channel Island Roofing Inc.

Air Balance: Los Angeles Air Balance Co. , Inc.

$786,918.00

$0.00

5

$0.00

$786,918.00

$786,918.00

Carroll Construction

216 E. Guiterrez

Santa Barbara, CA 93101
805/966-4810/ Fax 805/969-5654

Subcontractors:

Drywall: AGS Wall Systems, Inc.

Paint: Vanguard Painting, Inc

Flooring: Techniquex

Fume Hoods/Lab Casework: ISEC, Inc.
HVAC: Dahl Air Conditioning, Inc.
Electric: Goleta Electric Company
Plumbing: M/M Mechanical, Inc.

$831,544.00

$200.00

$1,000.00

$832,544.00

$832,544.00

Dahl Air Conditioning

30 S. La Pataera Lane, Suite 9
Goleta, Ca 93117

805/964-2002/ Fax 805/683-7654

No Bid Submitted

EJS Construction Inc.

4191 Carpinteria Ave., #7
Carpinteria, CA 93013
805/684-6381/ Fax 805/684-6312

Subcontractors:

Roofing: Derricks Roofing

Electrical: McCarty Electric

Plumbing: Goleta Plumbing & Mechanical

Fire Protection: Joy Equipment Protection, Inc.
Drywall: Garibay Drywall Inc.

Cabinets: ISEC Inc.

Painting: Mar Vista Painting

Flooring: Ray Mac Painting

HVAC: Dahl Air Conditioning, Inc.

$783,500.00

$0.00

$0.00

$783,500.00

$783,500.00
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Base Bid

Bid Summary

657 PSB Laboratory Hawker Laboratory Renovation
FM060660S/980790

Estimated Construction Costs: $165,000.00

Compensable Delay

Days

Total Compensable

Base Bid Plus Compensable Delays

Project Manager: J. Gonzales

Bid Opening Date: Friday, September 29, 2006 @ 2:30PM

Total

Lack Construction

420 E. Carrillo Street

Santa Barbara, CA 93101
805/963-3600/ Fax 805/963-6060

No Bid Submitted

5

Los Angeles Air Conditioning Inc.

1714 Lindbergh Court
La Verne, CA 91750

909/596-7077/ Fax 909/596-6657

No Bid Submitted

M/M Mechanical

1027 Cindy Lane

Carpinteria, CA 93013
805/745-1126/ Fax 805/745-1116

No Bid Submitted

SBS Corporation

30851 Agoura Road, #302
Agoura Hills, CA 91301-4346
818/597-4363/ Fax 818/497-4368

No Bid Submitted

Techniquex

26247 Enterprise Court

Lake Forest, CA 92630
714/614-5182/ Fax 480/443-4118

No Bid Submitted




