
Bid Summary
E-Beam Lith Environmental Chamber - Re-bid

FM060557SR/987659

Bid Opening Date: Wednesday, 
October 4, 2006 @ 2:30PM

Project Manager: J.Gonzales

Contractor Base Bid Compensable Delay Days Total Compensable Base Bid Plus Compensable 
Delay Total

American Cleanroom Systems $392,915.00 $3,565.00 5 $17,825.00 $410,740.00 $410,740.00

29722 Ave de las Baneras

Ranco Santa Margarita, CA 92688

949/589-5656/ Fax 909/589-6109

Subcontractors: None

Anderson Systems $251,915.59 $0.00 5 $0.00 $251,915.59 $251,915.59

5958 Corta Street

Goleta, CA 93117

805/683-6133/ Fax 805/964-2357

Subcontractors:

Architectural: Unistrut Corporation

Demo/Temp Barrier: Pacific Acoustics North Inc.

Air Balance: La Air Balance Company Inc.

Electrical: Bruce Winstrom DBA Goleta Electric

Brannon Inc. DBA Smith Electric Service $214,100.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $214,100.00 $214,100.00

2335 Meredith Lane

Santa Maria, CA 93455

805/922-6243/ Fax 805/922-9770

Subcontractors:

Air Balance: Los Angeles Air Balance Company, Inc.

Clean Room: Unistrut Corporation

Carroll Construction $264,867.00 $100.00 5 $500.00 $265,367.00 $265,367.00

216 E. Gutierrez Street

Santa Barbara, CA 93101

805/966-4810/ Fax 805/966-5654

Subcontracts: 

Clean Room: Unistrut Corporation

Mech: CT-Montel Inc., DBA Committ Technnologies, Inc.

Electric: Bruce Winstrom DBA Goleta Electric Co.

Plumbing: Kittle Plumbing
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Commit Technologies No Bid Submitted 5
313 North First Street

Lompoc, CA 93436

805/735-8887/ Fax 805/735-8826

EJS Construction Inc No Bid Submitted 5

4191 Carpinteria Ave., #7

Carpinteria, CA 93013

805/684-6381/ Fax 805/684-6312

Lack Construction No Bid Submitted 5

420 East Carrillo Street

Santa Barbara, CA 93101

805/963-3600/ Fax 805/963-6060

Los Angeles Air Conditioning No Bid Submitted 5

1714 Lindbergh Court

La Verne, CA 91750

909/596-7070/ Fax 909/596-6657

Pacific Acoustics North $249,620.00 $200.00 5 $1,000.00 $250,620.00 $250,620.00

133 East Ortega Street

Santa Barbara, CA 93101

805/963-1538/ Fax 805/564-7044

Subcontractors:

Plumbing/HVAC: Anderson Plumbing DBA Anderson Systems

Electrical: Imperial Electric Company

Painting: Ruben J. Gomez Painting & Decorating

Walls/Ceilings: Unitstrut Corporation

Practical Cleanroom Solutions No Bid Submitted 5

313 North First Street

Lompoc, CA 93436

805/735-8825/ Fax 805/735-8826


