Bid Summary Project Manager: J.Gonzales
Burnham Laboratory Bid Opening Date:
FM060653S/981510 Tuesday,March 20, 2007 @ 2:30PM

Estimated Construction Costs: $850,000.00

Base Bid Plus
|Contractor Base Bid Compensable Delay Days Total Compensable Compensable Delays Total
Anderson Systems No Bid Submitted 5
5958 Corta Street
Goleta, CA 93117
805/683-6133/ Fax 805/964-2357

Argus Contracting, Inc No Bid Submitted 5
2340 E. Artesia Blvd

Long Beach, CA 90805
562/422-7370/ Fax 562/422-8703

Carroll Construction $1,048,000.00 $300.00 5 $1,500.00 $1,049,500.00 $1,049,500.00
216 E. Gutierrez Street

Santa Barbara, CA 93101
805/966-4810/ Fax 805/966-5654

Subcontractors:

Drywall: A G S Wall Systems Inc
Plaster: TFT Plastering Inc.

Lab Equipment: ISEC Inc.

Accoustic Tile: Pacific Acoustics North
Paint: Landgraff's Painting

Flooring: Reliable Floor Coverings Inc.
HVAC: Dahl Air Conditioning Inc.
Plumbing: M/M Mechanical Inc.
Electric: Paragon Electrical Construction Inc.
Asbestos: Castlerock Environmental Inc.

Castlerock Environmental, Inc No Bid Submitted 5
12041 Mora Drive

Santa Fe Spings, CA 90670
562/941-9244/ Fax 562/941-9204

Channel Coast Corporation No Bid Submitted 5
525 E. Micheltorena Street, Suite 101
Santa Barbara, CA 93103
805/899-1227/ Fax 805/899-8690

Dahl Insulation No Bid Submitted 5
30 S. La Petera Lane, Suite 9
Goleta, CA 93117

805/964-2002/ Fax 805/683-7654
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EJS Construction No Bid Submitted 5

4191 Carpinteria Ave, Suite 7
Carpinteria, CA 93013
805/684-6381/ Fax 805/684-6312

Goleta Plumbing

90 Santa Felicia Dr.

Goleta, CA 93117

805/967-3502/ Fax 805/685-9992

No Bid Submitted

Imperial Electric Company
6445 Calle Real
Goleta, CA 93117

805/681-0676/ Fax 805/681-0703

No Bid Submitted

ISEC Inc.

2363 Teller Road, #105
Thousand Oaks, CA 91320
805/375-6957/ Fax 375-6935

No Bid Submitted

J. R. Barto Heating
414 N. O Street

Lompoc, CA 93936
805/736-5160/ Fax 805/737-0450

No Bid Submitted

Quality Environmental Inc.
13340 E. Firestone Blvd. Unit 1

Santa Fe Springs, CA 90670
562/623-9643/ Fax 562/623-9793

No Bid Submitted

Pacific Acoustics North

133 East Ortega Street

Santa Barbara, CA 93101
805/963-1538/ Fax 805/564-7044

No Bid Submitted

Project Development Group
1801-C Via Burton Street

Fullerton, CA 92831
714/780-0000/ Fax 714/780-0290

Bid Rejected
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Base Bid
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Project Manager: J.Gonzales
Bid Opening Date:
Tuesday,March 20, 2007 @ 2:30PM

Total

SBS Corporation
31416 Agoura Road, Suite 135

Westlake Village, CA 91361
818/597-4363/ Fax 818/597-4368

Subcontractors:

Demo/Abatement: VAC Eniromental & Demolition Contractors

Painting: Vanguard Painting Inc.

Acoustical Ceiling: Pacific Acoustics North Inc.
Flooring: Reliable Floor Covering Inc.
Framing/Gypsum: A G S Wall Systems Inc.
Plumbing: Goleta Plumbing & Mechanical
Mechanical: Dahl Air Conditioning Inc.
Signage: Signs of Success Inc.

Plaster: TFT Plastering Inc.

Electrical: Venco Electric Inc.

Casework: ISEC Inc.

$1,060,358.00

$500.00

5

$2,500.00

$1,062,858.00

$1,062,858.00

Schock Contracting
340 S. Kellogg, Suite J

Goleta, CA 93117
805/681-9796/ Fax 805/681-9717

No Bid Submitted

Smith Electric Service

2335 Meredith Lane

Santa Maria, CA 93455
805/922-6243/ Fax 805/349-7270

Subcontractors:

Abatement: VAC Enviromental & Demolition Contractors
Flooring: Floor Connection Inc.

Acoustical Ceiling: Pacific Acoustics North

Casework: ISEC Inc.

Painting: Guy Smithson Painting & Decorating
Controls: Johnson Controls Inc.

Air Balance: American Air Balance Co. Inc.

Fire Alarm: Golden State Alarms Inc.

$998,000.00

$0.00

$0.00

$998,000.00

$998,000.00

Taft Electric

650 Alamo Pintado Road, Suite 201
Solvang, CA 93463

805/688-0121/ Fax 805/688-0125

No Bid Submitted




