
Bid Summary
MRL Lab Remodel, Room 1056

FM070242S/987656

Bid Opening Date: Wednesday 
April 4, 2007 @ 2:30PM

Project Manager: G.  Levinthal

Contractor Base Bid Compensable Delay Days Total Compensable Delay Total

Anderson Systems $345,858.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $345,858.00

5958 Corta Street

Goleta, CA 93117

805/683-6133/ Fax 805/964-2357

Subcontractors: 

Architectural: Pacific Acoustics North

Floors: Cover All Inc. (Phoenix Floors)

Casework: ISEC Inc.

Electrical: Imperial Electric Company

Painting: D&D Painting Company

Controls: Johnson Controls Inc.

Air Balance: LA Air Balance Company, Inc.

Century Contractors Corp. No Bid Submitted 10

333 N. Lantana Street, Suite 118

Camarillo, CA 93010

805/482-7000/ Fax 805/482-7554

Commit Technologies No Bid Submitted 10

313 North First Street

Lompoc, CA 93436

805/735-8887/ Fax 805/735-8826
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Echternacht Construction No Bid Submitted 10

3024 De La Vina Street, Suite D

Santa Barbara, CA 93105

805/898-2644/ Fax 805/898-2646

EJS Construction Inc $329,300.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $329,300.00

4191 Carpinteria Ave., #7

Carpinteria, CA 93013

805/684-6381/ Fax 805/684-6312

Subcontractors: 

HVAC: West Coast Mechanical Inc.

Electrical: VESB Inc., DBA Vastola Electric

Plumbing: M/M Mechanical Inc

Drywall: Garibay Drywall Inc.

Millwork: Advanced Lab Concepts Inc.

Paint: Mar Vista Painting

Flooring:  Cover All Inc. (Phoenix Floors)

Imperial Electric No Bid Submitted 10

6445 Calle Real

Goleta, CA 93117

805/681-0676/ Fax 805/681-0703
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Lack Construction $323,629.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $323,629.00

420 E. Carrillo Street

Santa Barbara, CA 93101

805/963-3600/ Fax 805/963-6060

Subcontractors:

Painting: Guy Smithson Painting & Decorating

Plumbing: M/M Mechanical Inc.

HVAC: West Coast Mechanical Inc.

Electric/Data: VESB Inc DBA Vastola Electric

Lab Casework: Advanced Lab Concepts Inc.

Lorenzo Perez Construction No Bid Submitted 10

837 Blaine Ave

Filmore, CA 93015

805/907-3152

Schock Contracting No Bid Submitted 10

340 S. Kellogg, Suite J

Goleta, CA 93117

805/681-9796/ Fax 805/681-9717
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Smith Electric Service $399,900.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $399,900.00

2335 Meredith Lane

Santa Maria, CA 93455

805/922-6243/ Fax 805/349-7270

Subcontractors: 

Lab Equipment: ISEC Inc.

Paint: Guy Smithson Painting & Decorating

Air Balance: LA Air Balance Company Inc.

Controls: Johnson Controls Inc.

SBS Corporation No Bid Submitted 10

31416 Agoura Road, Suie 135

Westlake Village, CA 91361

818/597-4363/ Fax 818/597-4368

Urquidez Construction No Bid Submitted 10

2948 San Marcos Ave

Los Olivos, CA 93441

805/688-5654/ Fax 688-3085


