
Bid Summary
Westgate Re-

Roof Clerestory
FM070393S/292-63

Bid Opening Date: Friday,
June 22, 2007 @ 2:30PM

Project Manager: M. Schwartzbach

Contractor Base Bid Compensable 
Delay Days Total 

Compensable
Base Bid Plus 

Compensable Delay Unit Prices Unit Price 
Estimated Quantity Total Unit Price Total

Beachside Construction  $311,640.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $311,640.00 #1

101 Arnold Place, Ste C $175.00 10 $1,750.00 $313,390.00

Goleta, CA 93117 #2

805/683-7745/ Fax 805/683-3086 $0.00 10 $0.00

Subcontractors: 

Roofing: Channel Islands Roofing

Painting:  Best painting

Glazing: S. B. Glass

Best Contracting Services $376,190.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $376,190.00 #1
19027 S. Hamilton Ave $190.00 10 $1,900.00 $385,090.00
Gardena, Ca 90248 #2
310/328-6969/ Fax 310/328-9176 $700.00 10 $7,000.00

Subcontractors: 

Roof Demo: Roof Removal, Inc.

California Commercial Roofing Systems $480,000.00 $2,875.00 10 $28,750.00 $508,750.00 #1

5850 Thille Street, St 108 $80.00 10 $800.00 $513,400.00

Ventura, CA 93003 #2

805/644-1640/ Fax 805/644-1740 $385.00 10 $3,850.00

No Subcontractors

Cambron Roofing No Bid Submitted 10
P.O. Box 743

Goleta, Ca 93116

805/685-9496/ Fax 805/685-7791



Bid Summary
Westgate Re-

Roof Clerestory
FM070393S/292-63

Bid Opening Date: Friday,
June 22, 2007 @ 2:30PM

Project Manager: M. Schwartzbach

Contractor Base Bid Compensable 
Delay Days Total 

Compensable
Base Bid Plus 

Compensable Delay Unit Prices Unit Price 
Estimated Quantity Total Unit Price Total

Carroll Construction  $242,000.00 $100.00 10 $1,000.00 $243,000.00 #1

216 E. Gutierrez Street $200.00 10 $2,000.00 $248,000.00

Santa Barbara, CA 93101 #2

805/966-4810/ Fax 805/966-5654 $300.00 10 $3,000.00

Subcontractors: 

Roofing: Channel Islands Roofing

Paint: Landgraff's Painting

Glazing: Greganti Glass

Trim: Superior Millwork of SB Inc.

Channel Coast Corporation No Bid Submitted 10
525 E. Micheltorena Street

Santa Barbara, Ca 93103

805/899-1227/ Fax 805/899-8690

Channel Islands Roofing No Bid Submitted 10
4155 N. Southbank Road

Oxnard, CA 93036

805/485-1622/ Fax 805/485-8643

Derrick's Roofing No Bid Submitted 10
650 Ward Drive

Santa Barbara, CA 93111

805/681-9954/ Fax 805/681-9952



Bid Summary
Westgate Re-

Roof Clerestory
FM070393S/292-63

Bid Opening Date: Friday,
June 22, 2007 @ 2:30PM

Project Manager: M. Schwartzbach

Contractor Base Bid Compensable 
Delay Days Total 

Compensable
Base Bid Plus 

Compensable Delay Unit Prices Unit Price 
Estimated Quantity Total Unit Price Total

Lack Construction $281,890.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $281,890.00 #1

420 E. Carrillo Street $128.00 10 $1,280.00 $283,370.00

Santa Barbara, CA 93101 #2

805/963-3600/ Fax 805/963-6060 $20.00 10 $200.00

Subcontractors:

Roofing: Cambron Roofing & Waterproofing

Painting: Guy Smithson Painting & Decorating

Glass/Glazing: Santa Barbara Glass Company

Letner Roofing Company $345,000.00 $1,500.00 10 $15,000.00 $360,000.00 #1

1490 N. Glassell $175.00 10 $1,750.00 $369,250.00

Orange, CA 92867 #2

714/633-0030/ Fax 714/633-0280 $750.00 10 $7,500.00

Subcontractor: 

Tear Off: Roofing Excellence

Carpentry: D M Garr Construction

S. J. Deferville Construction Inc. No Bid Submitted 10
2520 Skyway Drive, St. B

Santa Maria, Ca 93455

805/925-2988/ Fax 805/346-2452


