
Bid Summary
East Gate Installation
FM070280S/986570

Bid Opening Date: Tuesday
June 26, 2007 @ 2:30PM

Project Manager: C. Yjader

Contractor Base Bid Compensable Delay Days Total Compensable Base Bid Plus Compensable 
Delay Alternates Total

Blum & Sons Electrical Inc. No Bid Submitted 20

606 Linden Ave

Carpinteria, CA 93013

805/684-1010/ Fax 805/684-2260

Diani Building Corp. $1,869,000.00 $650.00 20 $13,000.00 $1,882,000.00 Alt #1 $1,958,000.00
295 N. Blosser Road $22,000.00
Santa Maria, CA 93456 Alt #2
805/925-9533/ Fax 805/928-2150 $8,000.00

Alt #3
Subcontractors: $46,000.00
Drilled Piers: R. Myers Inc.

Landscape/ Irrigation: Planet Earth Landscape Construction

Rebar: CMC Steel Fabricators inc., DBA CMC Rebar Fresno

Stone Veneer: T. Cabot Construction

Structural Steel: Craftsman Construction & Erectors Corp.

Metal Wall: Cassidy's United Construction

Lath & Plaster: Cassidy's United Construction

Signs: Brandt Development LTD, DBA Brandt Commercial Signs

Electrical: Blum & Sons Electric Inc.

Composite Metal Wall Assembly: A Zahner Company

Lack Construction $2,227,084.00 $0.00 20 $0.00 $2,227,084.00 Alt #1 $2,370,889.00

420 E. Carrillo Street $59,478.00

Santa Barbara, CA 93101 Alt #2

805/963-3600/ Fax 805/963-6060 $14,327.00

Alt #3

Subcontractors: $70,000.00

Composite Metal Arch: A Zahner Company

Concrete: Anderson's Concrete Concepts Inc.

Cranage: Specialty Cranes & Rigging Corp. DBA Specialy Cranes & Rigging

Doors: John Pence Building Specialties Inc.

Electrical: Blum & Sons Electric Inc.

Framing: Cassidy's United Construciton

Landscape: Planet Earth Landscape Construction

Lath/Plaster: Cassidy's United Construction

Masonry: Peralez Masonry

Sheet Metal: Mid-Land Sheet Metal Inc.

Signage: Signs of Success Inc.

Structural Steel: Craftsman Construction & Erectors Inc.

Traffic Control: BAIBA's Safety Service Inc.
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Lash Construction $1,812,067.00 $800.00 20 $16,000.00 $1,828,067.00 Alt #1 $1,784,967.00

721 Carpinteria Street $26,100.00

Santa Barbara, CA 93103 Alt #2

805/963-3553/ Fax 805/965-8189 $10,800.00

Alt #3

Subcontractors: -$80,000.00

Stone Veneer: Tile Trends 

Struct. Steel: Abraham Steel Fabrication Inc.

Rebar: CMC Steel Fabricators Inc., DBA CMC Rebar Fresno

Electrical: Blum & Sons Electric Inc.

CIDH Piles: Case Pacific Company

Erosion Control/Landscape: KCI Environmental Inc.

Composite Arch: A Zahner Company

Metal Studs/Backer Board: Anderson Burton Contruciton Inc.

Parsam Construction No Bid Submitted 20
3334 Barnes Circle

Glendale, CA 91208

818/236-3633/ Fax 818/236-3634

Sharma-Merco JV $1,865,000.00 $1,000.00 20 $20,000.00 $1,885,000.00 Alt #1 $1,882,000.00

13840 Princeton Ave. $21,000.00

Moorpark, Ca 93021 Alt #2

805/532-1141/ Fax 805/532-1790 $0.00

Alt #3

Subcontractors: -$24,000.00

Drilled Piers: American Caisson Inc., DBA The Mahaffey Companies

Irrigation/Landscaping: KCI Environmental Inc.

Reinforced Steel: CMC Steel Fabricators Inc., DBA CMC Rebar Fresno

Stone Veneer: Peralez Masonry

Struct. Steel: Craftsman Construction & Erectors Inc.

Metal Studs: United Wall Systems Inc.

Metal Arch: A Zahner Company

Electrical: Blum & Sons Electric Inc

Plaster: McPherson Plastering Inc.
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Schock Contracting No Bid Submitted 20
340 S. Kellogg, Suite J

Goleta, CA 93117

805/681-9796/ Fax 805/681-9717

Specialty Construction Inc $1,786,000.00 $696.00 20 $13,920.00 $1,799,920.00 Alt #1 $1,881,420.00

645 Clarion Court $29,500.00

San Luis Obispo, Ca 93401 Alt #2

805/543-1706/ Fax 805/543-1722 $9,000.00

Alt #3

Subcontractors: $43,000.00

Irrigation/Lanscaping: Ironwood Landscape

Reinforcing Steel: CMC Steel Fabricators Inc., DBA CMC Rebar Fresno

Stone Veneer/Masonry: Artistic Brick Construction

Structural Steel: Abraham Steel Fabrication Inc.

Metal Framing: United Wall Systems Inc.

Composite Metal Arch: A Zahner Company

Flahing /Sheet Metal: Mid-Land Sheet Metal Inc.

Lath/Plaster: SLO Plastering Inc.

Photo Voltaic Systems: Blum & Sons Electric Inc.

Electrical: Blum & Sons Electric Inc.

Spiess Construciton $1,936,960.00 $300.00 20 $6,000.00 $1,942,960.00 Alt #1 $1,976,115.00

1110 E. Clark Ave., Suite 210 $21,500.00

Santa Maria, Ca 93455 Alt #2

805/937-5859/ Fax 805/934-4432 $11,655.00

Alt #3

Subcontractors: $0.00

Concrete: Ishco Inc, DBA Castle Contracting Corp.

Rebar: CMC Steel Fabricators Inc. DBA CMC Rebar Fresno

Masonry: Peralez Masonry

Drilling: Javier's Construction Inc.

AC Paving: LMT Enterprises Inc, DBA Tyner Paving Company

Electrical: Blum & Sons Electric Inc.

Metal Framing: Anderson Burton Construction Inc.

Landscape: J.D. Humann Landscaping Inc.

Metal Arch: A. Zahner Company

Whitaker Contractors No Bid Submitted 20
2572 Concrete Ct.

Paso Robles, Ca 93446

805/226-4020/ Fax 805/226-4021
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