
Bid Summary
Bldg 300 - Office/Classroom Renovation

FM070392S/987682

Project Manager: G. Levinthal
Bid Opening Date:, Tuesday, June 12, 2007 @ 2:30PM

Contractor: Base Bid Unit Prices

Unit price 
Estimate 

Quantities (3)
Compensable 

Delay
Compensable Delay 

Multiplier Extented CD Total Before Alt.'s Alternates

EJS Construction Inc $219,400.00 $100.00 $300.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $219,700.00 1.  A    $9,850.00

4191 Carpinteria Ave, Ste 7 2.  A    $17,465.00

Carpinteria, Ca 93013 3.  A    $1,420.00

805/684-6381/ Fax 805/684-6312 4.    D   $2,500.00

5.    N/C 

Subcontractors: 6.  A    $1,507.00

Steel: All Metal Fabrication 7.    N/C 

HVAC: Jer's Heat

Electrical: Mc Carty Electric Inc.

Fire Alarm: Golden State Alarms Inc.

Ceiling: Pacific Acoustics North

Drywall: Garibay Drywall Inc.

Paint: California Pro Painting Inc.

Flooring: AC Ramirez Floor Coverings Inc.

Landscape: Coastal Landscape

Changes in Contractors due to Alternates:

Alt. #6 - Mini Blinds: John Pence Building Specialites Inc.

L.E. Construciton No Bid Submitted



Bid Summary
Bldg 300 - Office/Classroom Renovation

FM070392S/987682

Project Manager: G. Levinthal
Bid Opening Date:, Tuesday, June 12, 2007 @ 2:30PM

Contractor: Base Bid Unit Prices

Unit price 
Estimate 

Quantities (3)
Compensable 

Delay
Compensable Delay 

Multiplier Extented CD Total Before Alt.'s Alternates

Bob Trautz Land Development Co. Inc $248,952.00 $189.00 $567.00 $475.00 10 $4,750.00 $254,269.00 1.  A    $6,400.00

509 Wentworth Ave. 2.  A    $7,676.00

Santa Barbara, CA 93101 3.  A    $1,500.00

805/966-3537/ Fax 805/966-3537 4.    D   $2,500.00

5.    N/C 

Subcontractors: 6.  A    $1,850.00

Flooring/Vinyl:  A C Ramirez Floor Coverings Inc. 7.    D   $750.00

Framing/Drywall: Thomas Drywall Inc.

Acoustical Ceiling: Pacific Acoustics North

Partial Demolition: Eagle Roof Removal Inc.

Electrical:  Blum & Sons Electric Inc.

HVAC: West Coast Mechanical

Painting: Van - Go Painting

Metal Railing:Delta Welding & Fabrication Inc.

Insulation: Santa Barbara Building Products.

Changes in Subcontractors due to Alternates: 

Alt #6 - Mini Blinds: Floor Connection

Center Line Construction No Bid Submitted

Blum & Sons Electric No Bid Submitted



Bid Summary
Bldg 300 - Office/Classroom Renovation

FM070392S/987682

Project Manager: G. Levinthal
Bid Opening Date:, Tuesday, June 12, 2007 @ 2:30PM

Contractor: Base Bid Unit Prices

Unit price 
Estimate 

Quantities (3)
Compensable 

Delay
Compensable Delay 

Multiplier Extented CD Total Before Alt.'s Alternates

Lack Construction $255,600.00 $207.00 $621.00 $100.00 10 $1,000.00 $257,221.00 1.  A    $11,314.00

420 E. Carrillo Street 2.  A    $11,471.00

Santa Barbara, CA 93101 3.  A   $5,313.00

805/963-3600/ Fax 805/963-6060 4.   D   $1,500.00

5.    N/C 

Subcontractors: 6.  A   $1,386.00

Electrical: Blum & Sons Electric Inc. 7.    D   $750.00

HVAC: West Coast Mechanical Inc.

Floor Covering: Floor Connection Inc.

Drywall: AGS Wall Systems Inc.

Glass: Santa Barbara Glass

Ceiling: Pacific Acoustics North

Painting: California Pro Painting Inc.

Insulation: Santa Barbara Building Products

No Changes in Subcontractors due to Alternates

J.A. B. Builders Relief of Bidder

1595 Via Alta Mesa

Nipomo, CA 93444

805/959-5954/ Fax 85/929-4744



Bid Summary
Bldg 300 - Office/Classroom Renovation

FM070392S/987682

Project Manager: G. Levinthal
Bid Opening Date:, Tuesday, June 12, 2007 @ 2:30PM

Contractor: Base Bid Unit Prices

Unit price 
Estimate 

Quantities (3)
Compensable 

Delay
Compensable Delay 

Multiplier Extented CD Total Before Alt.'s Alternates

Carroll Construction Company Inc $214,980.00 $200.00 $600.00 $100.00 10 $1,000.00 $216,580.00 1.  A    $15,000.00

216 E. Gutierrez Street 2.  A    $11,585.00

Santa Barbara, CA 93101 3.  A    $8,718.00

805/966-4810/ Fax 805/966-5654 4.    D   $2,500.00

5.    N/C

Subcontractors: 6.  A     $1,340.00

Acoustic Tile: Pacific Acoustics North 7.   D    $750.00

Drywall: AGS Wall Systems Inc.

Flooring: Floor Connection

Paint: Calif. Pro Painting Inc. DBA CPPI Construction

HVAC: West Coast Mechanical

Electric: Blum & Sons Electric Inc.

Aluminum Windows: Greganti Glass

Changes in Subcontractors due to Alternates: 

Alt. #3 - Roofing: Derricks Roofing Inc.

Alt. #6 - Blinds: John Pence Building Specialites Inc.

St. Vincents No Bid Submitted



Bid Summary
Bldg 300 - Office/Classroom Renovation

FM070392S/987682

Project Manager: G. Levinthal
Bid Opening Date:, Tuesday, June 12, 2007 @ 2:30PM

Contractor: Base Bid Unit Prices

Unit price 
Estimate 

Quantities (3)
Compensable 

Delay
Compensable Delay 

Multiplier Extented CD Total Before Alt.'s Alternates

Beachside Associates, Inc. $216,000.00 $200.00 $600.00 $100.00 10 $1,000.00 $217,600.00 1.  A    $10,000.00

101 Arnold Place, Suite C 2.  A    $12,000.00

Goleta, CA 93117 3.  A    $12,800.00

805/683-7745/ Fax 805/683-3066 4.    D   $2,500.00

5.   N/C

Subcontractors: 6.  A    $2,000.00

Insulation: Western Insulation LP 7.   N/C

Concrete: Ram Construction Inc.

Electrical: Blum & Sons Electrical Inc.

HVAC: St. Vincents Mechanical Inc.

Drywall: Thomas Drywall Inc.

Windows: Santa Barbara Glass Company

Roofing: Cambron Roofing & Waterproofing

Painting: Best Painting Inc.

Flooring: Floor Connection Inc.

Welding: Griffin Welding

Acoustic: Pacific Acoustics North

No Changes in Subcontractors due to Alternates

Urquidez Construction Inc. No Bid Submitted


