

Bid Summary
 Devereux Culvert Replacement
 FM070588S/986120
 Estimated Construction Costs: \$1,000,000.00

Project Manager: E. Brown
 Bid Opening Date: Monday, August 6, 2007 @ 2:30PM



Contractor	Base Bid	Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Unit Price	Unit Price Estimated Quantity	Total Unit Price	Base Bid Plus Compensable Delays	Total
Abbott Contracting & Engineering Inc. 250 Gulfstream Norco, CA 92860 951/905-0823/ Fax 951/898-0788	No Bid		5			10,000.00			
Alliance Contracting 155 Granada Street, #C Camarillo, CA 93010 805/388-0069/ Fax 805/388-0071	No Bid		5			10,000.00			
Camarillo Engineering P.O. Box 758 Somis, CA 93066 805/389-4655/ Fax 805/389-4560 Bridge: Contech Bridge Solutions Piles: Foundation Pile Inc Steel Work: CHP Steel Guard Rails: Acorn	\$1,396,102.00	\$3,750.00	5	\$18,750.00	\$7.50	10,000.00	\$75,000.00	\$1,414,852.00	\$1,489,852.00
Cushman Contracting Corp. 5354 Overpass Road Goleta, CA 93117 805/964-8661/ Fax 805/967-6057	No Bid		5			10,000.00			
Granite Construction 5335 Debbie Lane Santa Barbara, CA 93111 805/964-9951/ Fax 805/967-1431 Piles: HMC MBGR/Fence: C&W Specialty Rebar: Vista Steel	\$1,318,820.00	\$550.00	5	\$2,750.00	\$3.00	10,000.00	\$30,000.00	\$1,321,570.00	\$1,351,570.00
John Madonna Construction 12165 Los Osos Valley Road San Luis Obispo, CA 93405 805/543-7751/ Fax 805/543-7754	No Bid		5			10,000.00			
Lash Construction 721 Carpinteria Street Santa Barbara, CA 93103 805/963-3553/ Fax 805/965-8189 Rebar: Vista Steel Piles: Hatchett Mountain Construction MBGR: C&W Construction Specialty	\$1,366,000.00	\$600.00	5	\$3,000.00	\$5.00	10,000.00	\$50,000.00	\$1,369,000.00	\$1,419,000.00

Bid Summary
 Devereux Culvert Replacement
 FM070588S/986120
 Estimated Construction Costs: \$1,000,000.00

Project Manager: E. Brown
 Bid Opening Date: Monday, August 6, 2007 @ 2:30PM



Contractor	Base Bid	Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Unit Price	Unit Price Estimated Quantity	Total Unit Price	Base Bid Plus Compensable Delays	Total
Mendez Concrete 1210 E. Santa Paula Street Santa Paula, CA 93060 805/525-8043/ Fax 805/525-8057 Piles: Foundation Pile, Inc. Guard Railing: Alcorn Fence Co. Rebar: CHP Steel Co. Inc.	\$1,996,395.00	\$1,800.00	5	\$9,000.00	\$6.00	10,000.00	\$60,000.00	\$2,005,395.00	\$2,065,395.00
R. Burke Corporation 865 Capitolio Way San Luis Obispo, CA 93401 805/543-8568/ Fax 805/543-2521 Piles: Hatchett Mountain Construction Rebar: Vista Steel Fence & Rails: C&W Construction Specialty	\$1,823,655.00	\$1,000.00	5	\$5,000.00	\$7.00	10,000.00	\$70,000.00	\$1,828,655.00	\$1,898,655.00
Sanson 710-21 Fiero Lane San Luis Obispo, CA 93401 805/549-0667/ Fax 549-0702	No Bid		5			10,000.00			
Schock Contracting 340 S. Kellogg, Ste J Goleta, CA 93117 805/681-9796/ Fax 805/681-9717	No Bid		5			10,000.00			
Specialty Construction Inc. 645 Clarion Court San Luis Obispo, CA 93401 805/543-1706/ Fax 805/543-1722	No Bid		5			10,000.00			
S.P. Pazargad Engineering Construction Inc. 7120 Hayvenhurst Ave, #108 Van Nuys, CA 91406 818/901-8883/ Fax 818/901-8884 Piles: Foundation Pile, Inc	\$1,350,000.00	\$4,000.00	5	\$20,000.00	\$4.65	10,000.00	\$46,500.00	\$1,370,000.00	\$1,416,500.00

Bid Summary
 Devereux Culvert Replacement
 FM070588S/986120
 Estimated Construction Costs: \$1,000,000.00

Project Manager: E. Brown
 Bid Opening Date: Monday, August 6, 2007 @ 2:30PM



Contractor	Base Bid	Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Unit Price	Unit Price Estimated Quantity	Total Unit Price	Base Bid Plus Compensable Delays	Total
Summer Construction, Inc. 15245 Telegraph Road Santa Paula, CA 93060 805/933-9364/ Fax 805/525-3412	No Bid		5			10,000.00			
Tierra Contracting 5484 Overpass Road Santa Barbara, CA 93111 805/964-8747/ Fax 805/964-4438	No Bid		5			10,000.00			
Tiffany Group Inc. 19528 Ventura Blvd, #359 Tarzana, CA 91356 818/342-0330/ Fax 818/342-0660	No Bid		5			10,000.00			
Union Engineering 3658 N. Ventura, Ave. Ventura, CA 93001 805/648-3373/ Fax 805/648-6634 Rebar: Vista Steel Co. AC Pave: J-Pave, Inc. Manholes: Precon Products Dewatering: Rain for Rent MBGR & Barrier: C&W Construction Specialty Sheet Piling: Foundation File Inc. Survey: Benner & Carpenter Furnish & Install Concrete Piles: Foundation Pile Temporary Fence: C&W Construction Specialties	\$1,580,000.00	\$7,000.00	5	\$35,000.00	\$5.00	10,000.00	\$50,000.00	\$1,615,000.00	\$1,665,000.00
Whitaker Contractors 2752 Concrete Court Paso Robles, CA 93446 805/226-4020/ Fax 805/226-4021	No Bid		5			10,000.00			