UC UCSB

Bid Summary
Phelps Creek Bridge Bank Layback
FM070596S/986130

Bid Opening Date: Thursday
August 9,2007 @ 2:30PM
Project Manager: E. Brown

" Contractor

Base Bid

Compensable Delay

Days Total Compensable

Unit Price

Est. Qty

Total Unit Price

Alternate

Total Unit

Granite Construction
5335 Debbie Lane

Santa Barbara, CA. 93111
Subcontractor

Vista Steel Company

$1,069,232.00

$550.00

5 $2,750.00

$1.00

$10,000.00

$10,000.00

-$25,000.00

$1,056,982.00

Lash Construction Company
721 Carpinteria Street

Santa Barbara, CA. 93103
Subcontractors

ACE Fence Company

KCI Environmental

Vista Steel Company

$1,188,000.00

$600.00

5 $3,000.00

$4.50

10000

$45,000.00

-$30,000.00

$1,206,000.00

Peter Lapidus Construction
1975 Cravens Lane

Carpinteria, CA. 93013
Subcontractors

Kenneth W. Hoffman Const.
Debbie Shaw Landscape

Rain for Rent

Specialty Crane & Rigging

$1,087,066.00

$300.00

5 $1,500.00

$3.00

10000

$30,000.00

-$18,620

$1,099,946.00

Shaw Excavating & Grading
P.0. Box 171

Carpinteria, CA. 93014
Subcontractors

Lash Construction

Benner & Carpenter

KCI Environmental

$1,209,300.00

$100.00

5 $500.00

$2.90

10000

$29,000.00

-$30,000.00

$1,208,800.00

Summer Construction, Inc.
15245 Telegraph Road

Santa Paula, CA. 93060
Subcontractors

Mendez Concrete, Inc.

Vista Steel Company

KCI Environmental
Rain for Rent
Hatchette Mountain Const.

$1,889,508.10

$1,500.00

5 $7,500.00

$4.50

10000

$45,000.00

No Chg.

$1,942,008.00

Alliance Contracting
155 Granada Street #C
Camarillo, CA. 93010

No Bid Submitted

Camarillo Engineering
P.O. Box 758

Somis, CA. 93066

No Bid Submitted

Damar Construction, Inc.
4773 Ortega Street
Ventura, CA. 93003

No Bid Submitted

Elevation General Engr.
2336 Skyway Drive
Santa Maria, CA. 93454

No Bid Submitted

Gilliam and Sons
9813 Rosedale Hwy
Bakersfield, CA. 93312

No Bid Submitted




Bid Summary

Phelps Creek Bridge Bank Layback

FMO0705965/986130

Bid Opening Date: Thursday
August 9,2007 @ 2:30PM
Project Manager: E. Brown

" Contractor

Base Bid

Compensable Delay

Days

Total Compensable

Unit Price

Est. Qty

Total Unit Price

Alternate

Total Unit

John Madona Construction
12165 Los Osos Valley Road
San Luis Obispo, CA. 93405

No Bid Submitted

Sansone
710-21 Fiero Lane
San Luis Obispo, CA. 93401

No Bid Submitted

Schock Contracting
340 So. Kellogg, Suite "J"
Goleta, CA. 93117

No Bid Submitted

Specialty Construction, Inc.
645 Clarion Court
San Luis Obispo, CA. 93401

No Bid Submitted

S.P. Pazargad Engr. & Const
7120 Hayvenhurst Ave.. #108
Van Nuys, CA. 91406

No Bid Submitted

Union Engineering
3658 N. Ventura Ave.
Ventura, CA. 93001

No Bid Submitted




Bid Summary
Phelps Creek Bridge Bank Layback
FM070596S/986130

Bid Opening Date: Thursday
August 9,2007 @ 2:30PM
Project Manager: E. Brown



Bid Summary
Phelps Creek Bridge Bank Layback
FM070596S/986130

Bid Opening Date: Thursday
August 9,2007 @ 2:30PM
Project Manager: E. Brown



