

Bid Summary
 Low Pressure Drop Filter Installation
 FM070167S/107-14

Bid Opening Date: Tuesday
 January 22, 2008 @ 2:30PM
 Project Manager: M. Peppers



Contractor	Base Bid	Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Base Bid Plus Compensable Delay	Total
Ardalan Construction Company, Inc 1459 Thousand Oaks Blvd, G1 Thousand Oaks, CA 91362 805/496-7273 FAX 805/496-7310	NO BID SUBMITTED		10			
Brannon dba Smith Electric Service 2335 Meredith Lane Santa Maria, CA 93455 805/922-6243 FAX 805/349-7270	NO BID SUBMITTED		10			
Dahl Air Conditioning, Inc. 30 S. La Patera Lane Ste 9 Goleta, CA 93117 805/964-2002 FAX 805/683-7654	\$284,736.00	\$0.00	10	\$0.00	\$284,736.00	\$284,736.00
EJS Construction Inc. 4181 Carpinteria Ave, #7 Carpinteria CA 93013 805/684-6381 FAX 805/684-6446 Subcontractors: HVAC: WESTAIRE HEATING & AIR CONDITIONING	\$212,880.00	\$0.00	10	\$0.00	\$212,880.00	\$212,880.00
Kadlec Sheet Metals, Inc. 314 Edison Ave Santa Barbara, CA 93103 805/963-4900 FAX 805/963-4417	\$185,900.00	\$0.00	10	\$0.00	\$185,900.00	\$185,900.00
Lack Construction 420 East Carrillo Street Santa Barbara, CA 93101 805/963-3600 FAX 805/963-6060	NO BID SUBMITTED		10			

M. Peppers
8-18-08

Bid Summary
 Low Pressure Drop Filter Installation
 FM070167S/107-14

Bid Opening Date: Tuesday
 January 22, 2008 @ 2:30PM
 Project Manager: M. Peppers



Contractor	Base Bid	Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Base Bid Plus Compensable Delay	Total
Los Angeles Air Conditioning 1714 Lindbergh Court La Verne, CA 91750 909/596-7077 FAX 909/596-6657	\$310,000.00	\$100.00	10	\$1,000.00	\$311,000.00	\$311,000.00
Montie Wayne Sheet Metal & Heating 93 Castillian Drive Goleta, CA 93117 805/968-2215 FAX 805/968-2250	NO BID SUBMITTED		10			
Tri-Dim Filter Corporation 14551 E. Bonelli Street City of Industry, CA 91746 626/333-9428 FAX 626-330-1380	\$144,000.00	\$386.32	10	\$3,863.20	\$147,863.20	\$147,863.20
United Mechanical Contractors Inc. 19360 Rinaldi Street, #310 Porter Ranch, CA 91328 805/583-1010 FAX 805/582-1123	NO BID SUBMITTED		10			
Westaire Heating & Air Conditioning, Inc. 4350 Transport St #105 Ventura, CA 93003 805/642-9993 FAX 805/642-9996	NO BID SUBMITTED		10			

[Handwritten Signature]
 1/28/08