Estimated Construction Cost: $950,000.00
Bid Opening Date: February 07, 2008, 2:30 PM
University Representative: James Gonzales

Project Name: MOCVD TCR Lab E-Il Room 1141
Project No.: FM080185L/981520

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY

ALTERNATES

TOTAL PROJECT COST

General Contractor

Compensable Total

Base Bid Delay Days|Compensable

Alternate #1

Base Bid & Compensable

Delays

Allied Environmental Services

No Bid Submitted

11333 Vanowen

5 $0.00

$0.00

North Hollywood, CA 91605

Tel: 818/781-2490 FAX 818/781-2496

Subcontractors

AMG & Associates, INC.

No Bid Submitted

26470 Ruether Ave, #108

5 $0.00

$0.00

Santa Clarita, CA 93150

Tel: 661-251-7405 FAX 661/251-7405

Subcontractors

Anderson Burton Construction

No Bid Submitted

1131 El Camino Real

5 $0.00

$0.00

Arroyo Grande, CA 93420

Tel: 805/481-5096 FAX 805/473-8890

Subcontractors

Anderson Systems

No Bid Submitted

5958 Corta Street

5 $0.00

$0.00

Goleta, CA 93117

Tel: 805/683-6133 FAX 805/964-2357

Subcontractors

Ardalan Construction Company, Inc.

No Bid Submitted

1459 Thousand Oaks blvd, Suite G1

5 $0.00

$0.00

Thousand Oaks, CA 91362

Tel: 805/496-7273 FAX 805/496-7310

Subcontractors

Beachside Construction

No Bid Submitted

101 Arnold Place, Ste C

$0.00 5

$0.00

$0.00

Goleta, CA 93117

Tel: 805/683-7745 FAX 805/683-3066

Subcontractors

Blum & Sons Electric

No Bid Submitted

606 Linden Avenue

5 $0.00

$0.00

Carpinteria, CA 93013

Tel: 805/684-1010 FAX 805/684-2260

Subcontractors

Bottenfield Construction

$1,055,086.00

$5,390.00

$1,057,586.00

P.O. Box 55172

$500.00 5

$2,500.00

Valencia, CA 91355

Tel: 661-260-1720

Subcontractors

Gypsum Board: Rutherford Company Inc.

Painting: Ray-Mac Painting Inc

Electric: Venco Electric Inc.

Mechanical/Plumbing: Alpha Plumbing & Mechanical

Acoustical Tile: Cali Acoustics

Brannon Inc., DBA Smith Electric Service

$870,740.00

$12,640.00

$870,740.00

2335 Meredith Lane

$0.00 5

$0.00

Santa Maria, CA 93455

Tel: 805/922-6243 FAX 805/349-7270

Subcontractors

T-Bar CeilingTiles: Pacific Acoustic North Inc.

Painting: Guy Smithson Painting & Decoratin Inc.

Controls: Johnson Controls, Inc.

Test & Balance: Los Angeles Air Balance Company Inc.
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BVB Construction

No Bid Submitted

2300 Knoll Drive, Suite E

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Ventura, CA 93003

Tel: 805/642-8381 FAX 805/642-8382

Subcontractors

Cinary Construction Company , Inc.

No Bid Submitted

4024 Lost Springs Dr.

$0.00

$0.00

Calabasas Hills, CA 91301

Tel: 818/880-6772 FAX 818/880-6562

Subcontractors

Environmental Heating and A/C

No Bid Submitted

821 N. Maulhardt Avenue

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Oxnard, CA 93030

Tel: 805/278-4425 FAX 805/278-4420

Subcontractors

F. Rodgers Specialty Construction

No Bid Submitted

301 Bonnie Circle, Ste 100

$0.00

$0.00

Corona, CA

Tel: 951/549-8000 FAX 951/549-8120

Subcontractors

Goleta Plumbing

No Bid Submitted

90 Santa Felicia Dr.

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Goleta, CA 93117

Tel: 805/967-3502 FAX 805/685-9992

Subcontractors

Imperial Electric

No Bid Submitted

6445 Calle Real

$0.00

$0.00

Goleta, CA 93117

Tel: 805/681-0676 FAX 805/681-0703

Subcontractors

Kadlec Sheet Metals

No Bid Submitted

314 Edison Avenue

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Santa Barbara, CA 93103

Tel: 805/963-4900 FAX 805/963-4417

Subcontractors

Lack Construction

$994,400.00

$10,250.00

$994,400.00

420 East Carrillo Street

$0.00

$0.00

Santa Barbara, CA 93101

Tel: 805/963-3600 FAX 805/963-6060

Subcontractors

Painting: Ray-Mac Painting Inc.

Drywall/Stud: United Wall Systems Inc.

Acoustic Ceiling: Anderson Burton Construction

HVAC: Dahl Air Condtioning Inc.

Electrical: Slum & Sons Electric Inc.

Los Angeles Air Conditioning

No Bid Submitted

1714 Lindbergh Court

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

La Verne, CA 91750

Tel: 909/596-7077 FAX 909/596-6657

Subcontractors
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Newton Construction

$880,000.00

$11,400.00

$882,000.00

259 Higuera Street

$400.00

$2,000.00

San Luis Obispo, CA 93140

Tel: 805/544-5583 FAX 805/544-5584

Subcontractors

Metal Sud/Drywall/ Acoustic Ceiling: Anderson Burton

Painting: DFK Const. Inc. DBA American Coatings

HVAC: Alpha Plumbing & Mechanical Inc.

North Coast Construction

No Bid Submitted

P.O. Box 824

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Lompoc, CA 93438

Tel: 805/740-1227 FAX 805/740-1727

Subcontractors

Queen Construction Corp (3)

No Bid Submitted

3840 Cottonwood Gr Tr

$0.00

$0.00

Calabasas, CA 91301

Tel: 818/926-1044 FAX 818/878-0488

Subcontractors

SBS Corporation

No Bid Submitted

31416 Agoura Road, Suite 135

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Westlake Village, CA 91361-4621

Tel: 818/597-4363 FAX 818/597-4368

Subcontractors

Schock Contracting

No Bid Submitted

340 S. Kellogg, Ste J

$0.00

$0.00

Goleta, CA 93117

Tel: 805/681-9796 FAX 805/681-9717

Subcontractors

Sigma Construction Inc.

No Bid Submitted

2300 Knoll Drive, Unit E

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Ventura, CA 93003

Tel: 805/642-8377 FAX 805/642-8378

Subcontractors

Sun Rise Construction Inc

No Bid Submitted

1019 W. 3rd Street

$0.00

$0.00

San Bernardino, CA 92410

Tel: 909/381-2310 FAX 909/888-5234

Subcontractors

Taft Electric Company

No Bid Submitted

650 Alamo Pintado Road, Ste 201

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Solvang, CA 93463

Tel: 805/688-0121 FAX 805/688-0125

Subcontractors

Thomas Schwab Corp.

No Bid Submitted

5330 Derry Ave, Suite A

$0.00

$0.00

Agoura, CA 91301

Tel: 818/865-8053 FAX 818/865-1439

Subcontractors




