
 � Psychology Rooms 2201/2207 Remodel
FM080364S/987707

Bid Opening date: 4/25/2008 at 2:30PM
University Rep: G. Levinthal

 General Contractor Base Bid
Compensable 

Delay Days
Total 

Compensable

Base Bid  & 
Compensable 
Delays

Tasco Construction  $102,030.00 $1,530.00 10 $15,300.00 $117,330.00
651 Via Alondra, Ste 715
Camarillo, CA 93012

T:   805/987-1824   FAX:  805/389-0514
Subcontractors

Doors                         Door Solutions
Drywall                       CJR Construction
T-Bar Ceiling             Acoustical Precision, Inc.
Flooring                     The Floor Store
Painting                      General Coatings
Fire Protection          3-D Fire Protection
HVAC                        Churchill Heating & Air
Electric                      Tri Tech Electric

Carroll Construction  $141,900.00 $100.00 10 $100.00 $142,900.00
121 S. Quarantina
Santa Barbara, CA 93103

T:   805/966-4810 FAX:  805/966-5654
Subcontractors

Acoustic Tile               Pacific Acoustics
Insulation                     Santa Barbara Building Products
Drywall                         AGS
Fire Protection           3-D Fire
Flooring                      AC Ramirez
HVAC                          W. Coast Mechanical
Paint                             Smithson
Doors                          Door Stop
Electric                        Val/u

Lack Construction  $143,808.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $143,808.00
420 East Carrillo Street
Santa Barbara,  CA 93101

T:   805/963-3600  FAX:  805/966-5655
Subcontractors

Insulation                        Santa Barbara Bldg. Products
Doors/Hardware           Door Stop
Metal Studs/Drywall    AGS Wall System
Carpeting                        AC Ramirez
Acoustic Celiling           Pacific Acoustics
Painting                          Certa Pro Painters
HVAC                              W. Coast Mech.
Fire Protection               R.J. Fire Sprinkler
Electrical                         Scott & Sons

EJS Construction  
4191 Carpinteria Avenue, Ste 7 $121,800.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $121,800.00
Carpinteria, CA  93013

T:  805/684-6381      FAX: 805/684-6312
Subcontractors

HVAC                           W. Coast Mechanical
Electrical                      Good Service
Fire Protection           Joy Fire
Ceiling                          Pacific Acoustics
Drywall                         Garibay Drywall
Paint                              Maravista Paint
Flooring                       AC Ramirez
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Gencon Development, Inc. 
PO Box 61738 $139,000.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $139,262.00
Santa Barbara,  CA  93160

T:     805/692-0040  FAX:  805/692-8880
Subcontractors

Framing                        Holmes Construction 
Fire Sprinklers             Nargon Fire &  Safety
Ceiling                           Pacific Acoustics
Painting                        McNall Painting
Carpeting                     Fancy Floors
Mechanical                  W. Coast Mechanical
Electrical                      Scott & Sons

Zimmerman Construction  
24 Touran Lane NO BID SUBMITTED
Goleta, CA 93117

T:   805/453-1654  FAX:   805/966-5658
Subcontractors

Newton Construction  
259 Higuera Street NO BID SUBMITTED
San Luis Obispo

T:   805/544-5583    FAX:  805/5445585
Subcontractors

Evans & Son, Inc
25812 Springbrook Avenue $133,762.00 $550.00 10 $5,500.00 $139,262.00
Santa Clarita, CA 91350

T:    661/254-8787  FAX:  661/254-5959
Subcontractors

T-Bar/Acoustical                     G&S Acoustics
Drywall/Steel Stud Framing   United Wall Systems
Flooring                                     Gallagher's Floor Design
Painting                                      CertaPro Painters
Fire Sprinklers                          3-D Fire Protection
Mechanical                                W. Coast Mechanical
Electrical                                    Scott & Sons Electric
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Beachside Construction  (3)
101 Arnold Place, Ste C NO BID SUBMITTED 10
Goleta, CA 93117
T:   805/683-7745   FAX:  805/683-3066

Subcontractors

Avaco Construction, Inc.
12072 Amber Hill Trail $146,259.00 $400.00 10 $4,000.00 $150,259.00
Moreno Valley, CA 92557

T:  951/243-7911    FAX:  951/243-1353
Subcontractors

Framing/Drywall         United Wall systems
Electrical                       Scott & Sons Electrical
Paint                               CertaPro Painters
HVAC                            W. Coast Mechanical
Framing/Drywall          United Wall systems
Fire Protection             3-D Fire Protection  
Flooring/T-bar               Flooring 101

Brannon Inc., DBA Smith Electric
1740 Betteravia Rd. $115,175.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $115,175.00
Santa Maria, CA 93454

T:   805/922-6243   FAX: 805/966-5666
Subcontractors

Painting                       Guy Smithson
Fire Sprinklers            Nargon Fire
Acoustical Ceiling      Pacific Acoustics
Flooring                      AC Ramirez
Air Balance                 L.A. Air Balance
Controls                      Johnson Controls

R.J. Tunney Co.
1060 Calle Las Trancas NO BID SUBMITTED 10
Thousand Oaks, CA 91320
T:   805/750-4751   FAX:  805/966-5667

Subcontractors


