

Bid Summary
Stemcell Laboratory Renovation
FM080263S/981580

Bid Opening date: 5/1/2008 at 2:30PM
University Rep: J. Gonzales

General Contractor	Base Bid	COMPENSABLE DELAY			TOTAL
		Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Base Bid & Compensable Delays
American Demolition 620 Poinsettia Street Santa Ana, CA 92701 T: 714/936-6670 FAX: 714/550-9172	No Bid Submitted		5		
Anderson Systems 5158 Corta Street Santa Barbara, CA 93117 T: 805/683-6133 FAX: 805/964-2357	No Bid Submitted		5		
Beachside Construction 101 Arnold Place, Suite C Goleta, CA 93117 T: 805/683-7745 FAX: 805/683-3066	No Bid Submitted		5		
Blum & Sons Electric 606 Linden Ave Carpinteria, CA 93013 T: 805/684-2260 FAX: 805/684-2260	No Bid Submitted		5		
Bottenfield Construction 24832 Apple Street Newhall, CA 91321 T: 661/260-1720 FAX: 661/260-1401	\$852,500.00	\$450.00	5	\$2,250.00	\$854,750.00
Subcontractors					
Mechanical: Dahl Air Conditioning Inc.					
Flooring: Von Batsch Inc., DBA Western Waterproofing & Coating					
Resilient Flooring: Floor Connection Inc.					
Casework: ISEC Inc.					
Ceilings: MDK Construction Company Inc. DBA Continuous Quality Service					
Paint: California Pro Painting Inc., DBA C P I Construction & Mechanical					
Electrical/Fire: Venco Electric Inc.					
Plumbing: H P S Mechanical Inc.					
Demo/Asbestos: Allied Environmental Services					
Framing: Pacific Coast Drywall					
Doors/Frames: Door Stop					

Bid Summary
Stemcell Laboratory Renovation
FM080263S/981580

Bid Opening date: 5/1/2008 at 2:30PM
University Rep: J. Gonzales

General Contractor	Base Bid	COMPENSABLE DELAY			TOTAL
		Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Base Bid & Compensable Delays
Brannon Inc., DBA Smith Electric Service 1340 W. Betteravia Santa Maria, CA 93455 T: 805/922-6243 FAX: 805/349-7270	\$748,300.00	\$0.00	5	\$0.00	\$748,300.00
Subcontractors					
Acoustical Ceiling: Pacific Acoustic North Inc.					
Painting: Guy Smithson Painting & Decorating Inc.					
Poly Flooring: Santa Barbara Surfacing Inc.					
Abatement & Demo: Allied Environmental Services					
Lab Equipment: ISEC Inc.					
Controls: Johnson Controls Inc.					
Air Balance: American Air Balance Company Inc.					
Vinyl Tile: Floor Connection Inc.					
Carroll Construction 121 S. Quarantina Santa Barbara, CA 93103 T: 805/966-4810 FAX: 805/966-5654	\$755,985.00	\$100.00	5	\$500.00	\$756,485.00
Subcontractors					
Flooring: Floor Connection Inc.					
Painting: Guy Smithson Painting & Decorating Inc.					
Drywall: A G S Wall Systems Inc.					
Acoustical Tile: Pacific Acoustics North Inc.					
Lab Casework: ISEC					
Electrical: Blum & Sons Electric Inc.					
Plumbing: M/M Mechanical Inc.					
HVAC: J R Barto Heating/Air - Conditioning/Sheet Metal Inc.					
Asbestos: Specialized Environmental Inc.					
Polymer Flooring: Von Batsch Inc., DBA Western Waterproofing & Coating					
Cornucopia Associates Inc 2724 W. Main Street Alhambra, CA 91801 T: 626/289-8608 FAX: 626/289-8609	No Bid Submitted		5		
Dahl Air Conditioning Inc. 30 S. La Patera Lane, Suite 9 Goleta, CA 93117 T: 805/964-2002 FAX: 805/683-7654	No Bid Submitted		5		
Subcontractors					

Bid Summary
 Stemcell Laboratory Renovation
 FM080263S/981580

Bid Opening date: 5/1/2008 at 2:30PM
 University Rep: J. Gonzales

		COMPENSABLE DELAY			TOTAL
General Contractor	Base Bid	Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Base Bid & Compensable Delays

Bid Summary
Stemcell Laboratory Renovation
FM080263S/981580

Bid Opening date: 5/1/2008 at 2:30PM
University Rep: J. Gonzales

General Contractor	Base Bid	COMPENSABLE DELAY			TOTAL
		Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Base Bid & Compensable Delays
EI Rivas Construction 36617 Rose Street Palmdale, CA 93592 T: 661/285-2521 FAX: 661/285-7520	No Bid Submitted		5		
Hub Zone Corporation 9300 Santa Anita Ave Rancho Cucamonga, CA 91730 T: 909/484-0933 FAX: 909/484-0939	No Bid Submitted		5		
Lack Constuction 420 East Carrillo Street Santa Barbara, CA 93101 T: 805/963-3600 FAX: 805/963-6060	\$831,995.00	\$0.00	5	\$0.00	\$831,995.00
Subcontractors					
Lead & Asbestos Abatement: Allied Environmental Services					
Selective Demo: Allied Environmental Services					
Doors, Frames, & Hardware: California Flooring & Constrion Inc.					
Acoustical Ceiling: A C S Construction Inc.					
Drywall: Pre-Con Industries Inc.					
Resilient Flooring: C C F Flooring Contractors					
Painting: Guy Smithson Painting & Decorating Inc.					
Polymer Flooring: C C F Flooring Contractors					
Lab Case Work: ISEC					
HVAC: Dahl Air Conditioning Inc.					
Fire Protection: R & R Fire Protection Inc.					
Electrical: A C S Construcion Inc.					
Plumbing: M/M Mechanical Inc.					
Pat McCarthy Construction 633 E., Ventura Blvd. Oxnard, CA 93036 T: 805/485-4646 FAX: 805/278-2177	No Bid Submitted		5		
SBS Corporation 31416 Agoura Road, Suite 135 Westlake Village, CA 91361 T: 818/597-4363 FAX: 818/397-4368	No Bid Submitted		5		

Bid Summary
 Stemcell Laboratory Renovation
 FM080263S/981580

Bid Opening date: 5/1/2008 at 2:30PM
 University Rep: J. Gonzales

General Contractor	Base Bid	COMPENSABLE DELAY			TOTAL
		Compensable Delay	Days	Total Compensable	Base Bid & Compensable Delays
Southland Construction 10760 Burbank Blvd. North Hollywood, CA 91601 T: 818/508-4134 FAX: 818/508-4141	No Bid Submitted		5		
Specialized Environmental, Inc. 12115 Rivera Road Whittier, Ca 90606 T: 562/698-9222 FAX: 562/698-9247	No Bid Submitted		5		
Unlimited Environmental 13905 32nd Street Signal Hill, CA 90755 T: 562/981-6600 FAX: 562/981-2218	No Bid Submitted		5		