Engineering Il Life Safety Fire Sprinkler Fire Alarm System Upgrade

Project No. FM080325L/981320
UR: Frank Castanha

Estimated Construction Cost: $2,550,000.00

BASE BID

COMPENSABLE DELAY

TOTAL PROJECT COST

General Contractor

Base Bid

Compensable
Delay

Day! Compensable

Total

Base Bid w/
Compensable
Delays

Total

American Coatings

NO BID

316-A N. First Street

20

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Lompoc, CA 93436

T: 805/736-4282 Fax:805/736-4473

Subcontractor

Blum & Sons Electric

NO BID

606 Linden Avenue

20

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Carpinteria, CA 93013

T: 805/684-1010 Fax: 805/684-2260

Subcontractor

Channel Coast Corp

NO BID

912 De La Vina Street

$0.00

20

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Santa Barbara, CA 93101

T: 805/899-1227 Fax: 805/899-8690

Subcontractor

Cosco Fire Protection

NO BID

4233 W. Sierra Madre, #108

$0.00

20

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Fresno, CA 93722

T: 559/275-3795 Fax: 559/275-8006

Subcontractor

JAM Fire Protection

1930 S. Myrtle Avenue

$2,569,300.00

$100.00

20

$2,000.00

$2,571,300.00

$2,571,300.00

Monrovia, CA 91016

T: 626/256-4400 FAX: 626/256-4401

Subcontractors

Lack Construction

NO BID

420 East Carrillo Street

$0.00

20

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Santa Barbara, CA 93101

T: 805/963-3600 Fax: 805/963-6060

Subcontractors

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, Tuesday, June 3, 2008
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Newton Construction

NO BID

259 Higuera Street

$0.00

20

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

San Luis Obispo, CA 93401

T: 805/544-5583 FAX: 805/544-5584

Subcontractors

SBS Corporation

31416 Agoura Road, #135

$1,962,171.00

$1,000.00

20

$20,000.00

$1,982,171.00

$1,982,171.00

Westlake, CA 91361

T: 818/597-4363 Fax: 818/597-4368

Subcontractor

Painting: Ray Mac Painting

Electric & Fire Alarm: VenCo Electric

Fire Sprinkler: California Central Fire Protection

Smith Electric Service

1340 W. Betteravia Road

$2,517,000.00

$0.00

20

$0.00

$2,517,0

00.00

$2,517,000.00

Santa Maria, CA 93455

T: 805/621-5055 Fax: 805/621-5190

Subcontractor

Fire Alarm Supplier: Simplex Grinnell

Painting: American Coating

Fire Sprinkler: S&M Fire Protection

Fire Stopping: Smith Electric Service

Taft Electric

NO BID

650 Alamo Pintado Road, Ste 201

$0.00

20

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Solvang, CA 93463

T: 805/688-0121 FAX: 805/688-0125

Subcontractors

Transbay Fire Protection, Inc

NO BID

4672 W. Jennifer Avenue, #101

$0.00

20

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Fresno, CA 93722

T: 559/276-6076 FAX: 559/276-6282

Subcontractors

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, Tuesday, June 3, 2008




