
Project: SAASB Chilled Waterline Extension, Bldg. 568
Project No. FM080138S/128-44
University Representative: G. Levinthal

Estimated Construction Cost: $130,000.00

TOTAL PROJECT COST

 General Contractor Base Bid
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable

Base Bid & 
Compensable 
Delays Total

Carroll Construction NO BID SUBMITTED
121 S. Quarantina 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
T:   805-966-4810   FAX: 805-966-5654

Subcontractors

EJS Construction
4191 Carpinteria Ave. Suite 7 $138,600.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $138,600.00 $138,600.00
Carpinteria , CA 93013

T:   805-684-6381   FAX: 805-684-6312
Subcontractors

Sunset Sheetmetal Guy Smithson
Good Service Johnson Control
Goleta Plumbing Tierra Contracting
Stucco Concepts

LA Air
1714 Lindbergh Court $177,365.00 $20.00 10 $200.00 $177,565.00 $177,565.00
La Verne, CA 91705
T:  909/596-7077   FAX:  909/596-6657

Subcontractors
Dahl A/C Southwest Group
Johnson Controls
So. Cal. Coatings
Rymax

Lack Construction
420 East Carrillo Street $156,275.00 $100.00 10 $1,000.00 $157,275.00 $157,275.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
T:  805-963-3600     FAX: 805-963-6060

Subcontractors
AGS Wall System Superior Stucco
Derricks Roofing Goleta Plumbing
Tower Air Blum & Sons
Guy Smithson

Pasadena Buildings NO BID SUBMITTED
21 E. Villa St $0.00 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Pasadena, CA 91103
T:   626/449-0805   FAX: 262/795-8720

Subcontractors

Schock Contracting NO BID SUBMITTED
PO Box 61505 $0.00 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93160
T:   805/681-9796   FAX: 805/681-9717

Subcontractors

Smith Electric
1340 W. Betteravia $182,200.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $182,200.00 $182,200.00
Santa Maria, CA 93455
T:   805/922-6243   FAX: 805/349-7270

Subcontractors
Tarlton & Son's
Guy Smithson Painting

William Griffith Welding NO BID SUBMITTED
343 Dana Pt. Ave. $0.00 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Ventura, CA 93004
T:  805/794-0995    FAX: 805/794-0995

Subcontractors

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY

Bid Open: 2:30PM, June 17, 2008


