
Project: Art Surge Bldg. 434 - Women's Center
Project No.: FM080317S/981500 
University Representative: Telli Foster

Estimated Construction Cost: $820,000.00

TOTAL PROJECT COST

 General Contractor Base Bid
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable

TOTAL: Base Bid w/ 
Compensable Delays

Bottenfield Construction No Bid
24832 Apple Street 5 $0.00 $0.00
Newhall, CA 91321
T:   661/260-1720   FAX: 661/260-1401

Subcontractors

Carroll Construction Company, Inc.
121 S. Quarantina $555,875.00 $100.00 5 $500.00 $556,375.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93103
T:  805/966-4810   FAX:  805/966-5654

Subcontractors
Demo - Cal Flo                        ACC Tile - Pacific Acoustic    Paint - Lundgraff    Plumb. - M/M Mech.
Drywall - AGS Wall Sys.          Floor - DFS    Drapes - Drapery Affair    Electric - AMP
Cer Tile - R. Courtney              Tact Wall - SM Acoustics    HVAC - West Coast Mech.    Storefront - GMM Sheet Metal - West Coast Mech.

Channel Coast Corporation No Bid Submitted
123 Santa Barbara St. $0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
T:    805/899-1227  FAX:  805/899-8690

Subcontractors

Diani Building Corp.
295 N. Blosser Road $617,000.00 $500.00 5 $2,500.00 $619,500.00
Santa Maria, CA 93456
T: 805/925-9533    FAX: 805/928-2150

Subcontractors
Glazing - SB Glass                     Acoust. Ceil. - Cali USA   Visual Display - Claridge Products HVAC - West Coast Mech.
Gyp. Board - AG Wall Sys.         Floor. - DFS Flooring   Draperies - Drapery Affair Elect. - Vastola Electric
Ceramic Tile - R. Courtney          Paint. - American Coat.   Plumb. - IPS Plumbing Roof. - Derricks Roofin           Insulation - Viking Insulation

EJS Construction
4191 Carpinteria Avenue, Ste 7 $484,800.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $484,800.00
Carpinteria, CA 9513
T:   805/684-6381     FAX: 805/684-6312

Subcontractors
Roof - Derricks                  Plumb. - Koehuer Tile - Conception Tile Flooring - DFS Floor
HVAC - West Coast          Ceiling - Pac. Acoustics Paint. - American Coat. Drapery - Drapery Affair
Electric - Vastola              Drywall - Garibay Glazing - SB Glass

JEC Inc. No Bid Submitted
1703 Cadenhorn Dr. $0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00
Agoura, CA 9151
T:  818/597-1708     FAX:  818/865-1150

Subcontractors

Lack Construction
420 East Carrillo Street $669,000.00 $200.00 5 $1,000.00 $670,000.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
T:   805/963-3600      FAX:  805/963-6060

Subcontractors
Demo - Calif. Land Clearing         Ceramic Tile - Hollywood   Doors/Frames - Classic Insta     Tack. Wall - SM Acous. Drywall - AGS
Bldg. Insul. - Masco                  Acous. Ceil. - Pac. Acous.   Visual Disp. - John Pence      HVAC - US Air Plumb. - MM Mech.
Roofing - Derrick's                     Painting - Guy Smithson   Signage - America's Signs      Air Balance - Air Test Floor. - DFS Flooring
Wiring Devices - Vastola            Draperies/Tracks - Arjays

Leon Aftandiliantz No Bid Submitted
6967 Bobbyboyar Avenue $0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00
Westhills, CA 9157
T:  818/427-0659    FAX:  818/878-0488

Subcontractors
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Newton Construction  
259 Higuera Street $526,000.00 $100.00 5 $500.00 $526,500.00
San Luis Obispo, Ca 93401
T:  805/544-5583    FAX:  805/544-5584

Subcontractors
Roof - Derrick's                Tile - R. Courtney Acoustic Ceiling - Woodward   Tack. Wall Board - SM Acoustical
Glazing - SB Glass          Paint. - American Coatings HVAC - US Air Cond.
Drywall - Premier             Floor. - DFS Flooring Plumbing - LDM Plumbing

Oak Tree Construction
5149 Catalon Avenue $767,900.00 5 $0.00 $767,900.00
Woodland Hills, CA 91364 No amount filled in
T:    818/999-3935    FAX:  818/999-2009

Subcontractors
Drapery - Drapery Affair          HVAC - Kreimer A/C Signage - Sign-A-Rama
Floor - DFS Flooring              Drywall - AM Acoustics Acoustic Ceilings - AM Acoustics
Electric - E.D. Electric           Painting - Moshe Cafri

Pat McCarthy Construction
633 E. Ventura Blvd. $580,000.00 $500.00 5 $2,500.00 $582,500.00
Oxnard, CA 9536
T: 805/485-4646  FAX: 805/278-2177

Subcontractors
Demo - Cal-Flo                             Carpentry - FN Const.   Alum.Storefront - Perf. Glass     Acoustic Ceil. - FN Const. Specialties - John Pence
A/C Paving - Quality Paving           Insulation - Viking Insul.   Glazing - Perf. Glass    Floor. - DFS Flooring Window Cvr. - Arjays
Concrete - Ortega General Eng.     Roof. - Channel Island   Drywall - FN Const.    Wall Sys. - SM Acoustics Plumb. - IPS Plumbin
HVAC & S/M - Kaiser A/C             Electric - Vastola   Doors & Frames - Classic Instal.     Paint. - American Coatings Signage - Signs of Success
Ceramic Tile - R. Courtnery Tile      Surveyer - Penfield & Smith

S. Santillano Construction No Bid Submitted
PO Box 15 $0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00
Richgrove, CA 93261
T: 661/599-5815    FAX: 661/792-2755

Subcontractors

SBS Corp.
31416 Agoura Rd. 135 $659,118.00 5 $0.00 $659,118.00
Westlake Village, CA No amount filled in
T:818/597-4363    FAX:  818/597-4368

Subcontractors
Electric - Venco           Demo - Demo Cleaning HVAC - West Coast Mech. Drywall - AGS Drywall      Alum./Glazing - Wolf CGS Inc.
Drapery - Arjay's          Roofing - Derrick's Acous. Ceil. - Cali USA Acoustic
Paint - Testa                Plumb. - IPS Plumbing Tack. Board - SM Acoustical

Schock Contracting  No Bid Submitted
340 S. Kellogg, Ste J $0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00
Goleta, CA 93117
T:805/681-9796     FAX:  805/681-9717

Subcontractors

Smith Electric No Bid Submitted
1345 W. Betteravia $0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Maria, CA 93455
T: 805/621-5000      FAX:  805/621-5050

Subcontractors

Bid Open: 2:30PM, Friday, June 27, 2008


