
Project: Laboratory Renovation 3166, Harold Frank Hall-Bldg. 556
Project No. FM080551S/987708/077-08
University Representative: Deedee Ciancola

Estimated Construction Cost: $248,000.00
License Required: B General Bldg.

TAL PROJECT COST

 General Contractor Base Bid
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable

Base Bid w/ 
Compensable 
Delays Total

Beachside Construction NO BID SUBMITTED
101 Arnold Place, Ste C 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Goleta, CA 93117
T:    805/683-7745  FAX:  805/683-3066

Subcontractors

Bottenfield Cosntruction - Lic. # 818911, B
24832 Apple St $222,200.00 $500.00 5 $2,500.00 $224,700.00 $224,700.00
Newhall, CA 91321
T:  661-260-1720    FAX: 661/260-1401

Subcontractors
Demo-West Coast Painting-Guy Smithson Electric - RA Electric
Metal Fab. - Pacific Coast Bldg. Specialty-Rockwell Laser Ind.
Doors & Frames - Door Stop (supplier) Casework & Fixt.- ISEC
Acoustic Ceil. - Pacific Acoustics HVAC-ABC Servs.
Resilient Floor.- Floor Connection Plumbing- M/M Mech.

Carroll Construction - Lic. # 464263, B
121 S. Quarantina $214,500.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $214,500.00 $214,500.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93103
T: 805/966-4810    FAX:  805/966-5654

Subcontractors
Lab Equip. - ISEC HVAC - JR Barto
Paint - Guy Smithson AC Tile - Pacific Acoustics
Electric - Good Service Bldg. Spec.- John Pence
Flooring - Floor Connection Drywall - AGS Wall Sys.
Plumbing - M/M Mech.

Crawford Green NO BID SUBMITTED
1604 State Street, Ste C $0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 
T:  805/966-3400    FAX: 805/884-8314

Subcontractors

Diani Building Corp. NO BID SUBMITTED
295 N. Blosser Road $0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Maria, CA 
T:  805/925-9533    FAX:  805/928-2150

Subcontractors

EJS Construction - Lic.# 560947, B
4191 Carpinteria Avenue, Ste 7 $232,600.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $232,600.00 $232,600.00
Carpinteria, CA 93013
T:   805/684-6381   FAX: 805/684-6312

Subcontractors
HVAC - Dahl Window Treat. - Louis H Hill Co.
Electrical - Good Svc. Cabs/Hood - ISEC
Plumbing - Goleta Plumb. Paint - Guy Smithson
Ceiling - Pacific Acoustic Floor - Floor Connection
Drywall - Garibay Drywall

Lack Construction- Lic. # 609080, B, C-33
420 East Carrillo Street $207,975.00 $200.00 5 $1,000.00 $208,975.00 $208,975.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
T:  805/963-3600    FAX: 805/963-6060

Subcontractors
Demo - West Coast & Sons Painting - Guy Smithson
Metal Fram./Drywall - AGS Wall Sys. Lab Fume & Casework - ISEC
Insulation - Western Insulation Plumbing - M/M Mech.
Acoustical Ceil. - Pacific Acoustic HVAC - US Air Conditioning
Resilient Floor. - Floor Connection Electrical - Vastola

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY

Bid Open: Wednesday, July 9, 2008 2:30 PM
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Queen Construction Corp - Lic.# 906954, B
3840 Cottonwood Gr Tr $171,129.00 $500.00 5 $2,500.00 $173,629.00 $173,629.00
Calabasas, CA 91301
T:   818/926-1044   FAX: 818/878-0488

Subcontractors
Laboratory Fume Hood - Leon Aftandiliantz
Piping Insulation - Leon Aftandiliantz
Ductwork Insulation - Leon Aftandiliantz
Laboratory Exhaust Fan - Leon Aftandiliantz

Salvador Santillano Construction NO BID SUBMITTED
PO Box 15 $0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Richgrove, CA 93261
T:    661/599-5815  FAX: 661/792-2755

Subcontractors

SBS Corp. NO BID SUBMITTED
31416 Aguora Rd. $0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Westlake, CA 91361
T:    818/597-4363  FAX:  818/599-4368

Subcontractors

Tomar Construction dba TJ Construction NO BID SUBMITTED
5304 Elmhurst St. $0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Ventura, CA 93003
T:   805/642-8816   FAX:  805/642-8814

Subcontractors

West Coast & Son's Demolition NO BID SUBMITTED
11455 Azahar St. $0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Ventura, CA 93004
T:   805/421-3523   FAX:  805/486-2526

Subcontractors

Woody Boyce Builders NO BID SUBMITTED
3500 La Entrada $0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93105
T:   805/682-5245   FAX:  805/682-5270

Subcontractors

Bid Open: Wednesday, July 9, 2008 2:30 PM


