
Bid Summary
Events Center Air Handler Changeout

FM080404S/421-65
Estimated Construction Costs: $172,000.00

Project Manager: G. Levinthal
Bid Opening Date: Thursday,

August 14, 2008 @ 2:30PM

Contractor Base Bid
Compensable 

Delay Days
Total 

Compensable
Base Bid Plus Compensable 

Delays Total
Brannon Inc., DBA Smith Electric Service $163,477.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $163,477.00 $163,477.00
2335 Meredith Lane
Santa Maria, CA 93455
805/922-6243/ Fax 805/349-7270

Subcontractors:
Controls: Johnson Controls Ins.
Test& Balance: L.A. Air Balance Co. Inc.
Roofing: Channel Islands Roofing Inc.

Blum & Sons Electric No Bid Submitted 10
606 Linden Avenu
Carpinteria, CA 93013
805/684-1010/ Fax 805684-2260

Dahl Air Conditioning, Inc. No Bid Submitted 10
30 S. La Patera Lane, Ste 9
Goleta, CA 93117
805/964-2002/ Fax 805/683-7654

Craig Roof Company, Inc. No Bid Submitted 10
132 Garden Street
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
805/966-5331/ Fax 805/962-1168

GM Electric No Bid Submitted 10
2674 E. Main Street. "D"
Ventura, CA 93003
805/961-6459/ Fax 805/644-0113

Kadlec HVAC $215,750.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $215,750.00 $215,750.00
314 Edison Ave.
Santa Barbara, CA 93103
805/963-4400/ Fax 805/963-4417

Subcontractors: None
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Lack Construction $289,300.00 $200.00 10 $2,000.00 $291,300.00 $291,300.00
420 E. Carrillo Street
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
805/963-3600/ Fax 805/963-6060

Subcontractors: 
HVAC: Dahl Air Conditioning Inc.
Roof Patching: Derrick's Roofing Inc.
Electrical: DBA Vastola Electric of SB
Painting: Guy Smithson Painting & Décor. Inc.

Los Angeles Air Conditioning Inc. $171,400.00 $10.00 10 $100.00 $171,500.00 $171,500.00
1714 Lindbergh Court
La Verne, CA 91750
909/596-7077/ Fax 909/596-6657

Subcontractors:
Electrical: Rymax Electric Inc.
Roofing/Gen: Thomas O'Neill Construction
Insulation: Dahl Air Conditioning Inc.
Air Balance: Penn Air Control Inc.
Controls: Johnson Controls

Queen Construction Corp. No Bid Submitted 10
3840 Cottonwood Gr-Tr
Calabasas, CA 91301
818/926-1044/ Fax 818/878-0488

United Mechanical Contractors, Inc. $197,000.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $197,000.00 $197,000.00
4645 E. Industrial Street, 2H
Simi Valley, CA 93063
805/583-1010/ Fax 805/582-1126

Subcontractors:
Electrical: G M Electric's
Controls: Advanced Automated Systems Inc.


