
Project: El Colegio Rd. Improvement
Project No. FM080435L/986051
University Representative: Erich Bron

Estimated Construction Cost: $4,300,000.00

ALTERNATES

 General Contractor Base Bid Unit Price
Unit 
Quantity Description

Total Unit 
Price

Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable Alternate #1 Alternate #2

Base Bid w/unit 
prices & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates

Berry General Engineering Contractors NO BID SUMBITTED
350 W. Lewis Street $0.00 5000 Square Feet $0.00 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Ventura, CA 93001 $0.00 0 NOT USED $0.00
T:  805/643-7567     FAX:  805/643-7482 $0.00 5000 Square Feet $0.00

Subcontractors $0.00

C.A. Rasmussen, Inc.
28548 Livingston Ave. $3,293,900.00 $5.30 5000 Square Feet $26,500.00 $2,500.00 30 $75,000.00 $665,000.00 -$25,000.00 $3,410,400.00 $640,000.00 $4,050,400.00
Valencia, CA 91355 $0.00 0 NOT USED $0.00
T:   661/367-9040  FAX: 661/367-9097 $3.00 5000 Square Feet $15,000.00

Subcontractors $41,500.00
Electrical - Lee Wilson Electric Survey- Benner & Carpenter Inc. Change in Sub due to Alternates:
Landscape- KCI Environmental Underground- Tierra Contracting Masonry- Glasspoole Masonry
Slurry Seal-Penn Woods
Striping- Sudhakar International

Granite Construction Company
5335 Debbie Lane                PO Box 50085 $3,286,029.00 $5.00 5000 Square Feet $25,000.00 $100.00 30 $3,000.00 $554,341.00 -$25,000.00 $3,339,029.00 $529,341.00 $3,868,370.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93111   Watsonville, CA 95077-5085 $0.00 0 NOT USED $0.00
T:   805/964-9951  FAX: 805/967-1431 $5.00 5000 Square Feet $25,000.00

Subcontractors $50,000.00
Tree Removal- JTS Landscaping- KCI Environmental
Construction Signs- Statewide Safety Shoring- Super Seal & Stripe
Ret. Wall- Glasspoole Masonry Grade Seal- Super Seal & Stripe
Electric- Lee Wilson Electric Slury Seal- Mission Paving

John Madonna Construction
12165 Los Osos Valley Road $4,850,000.00 $5.00 5000 Square Feet $25,000.00 $2,000.00 30 $60,000.00 $900,000.00 -$25,000.00 $4,960,000.00 $875,000.00 $5,835,000.00
San Luis Obispo, CA 93405 $0.00 0 NOT USED $0.00
T:  805/543-7751     FAX:  805/543-7754 $5.00 5000 Square Feet $25,000.00

Subcontractors $50,000.00
Masonry-Boydston Stiping-Sudhakar Co. Change in Sub due to Alternates:
Landscaping-American Landscaping Asphalt-Union Asphalt Concrete-Precision Concrete
Electric- Lee Wilson Tree Removal-Cal. Land Clearing Landscape- American Land
Concrete-Precision Concrete Electric-Lee Wilson Electric

BASE BID UNIT PRICES COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST

Bid Open: Thursday, August 7, 2008, 2:30 PM
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Lash Construction
721 Carpinteria Street                       PO Box 4649 $3,179,871.00 $3.72 5000 Square Feet $18,600.00 $100.00 30 $3,000.00 $491,693.00 -$25,000.00 $3,218,321.00 $466,693.00 $3,685,014.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93103               SB Ca 93140 $0.00 0 NOT USED $0.00
T:   805/963-3553   FAX: 805/965-8189 $3.37 5000 Square Feet $16,850.00

Subcontractors $35,450.00
Landscaping- KCI Environmental Survey- Benner & Carpenter
Striping- Proline Striping Electric- Lee Wilson
Masonry- Glasspoole Masonry Slurry Seal- Penn Woods
Clear Trees- Calif. Industries

Mallcraft NO BID SUMBITTED
2225 N. Windsor Avenue $0.00 5000 Square Feet $0.00 $0.00 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Altadena, CA 91001 $0.00 0 NOT USED $0.00
T:   626/398-3598   FAX:  626/398-3547 $0.00 5000 Square Feet $0.00

Subcontractors $0.00

Nye & Nelson, Inc.
1860 Eastman Ave Suite 108 $3,223,346.00 $9.15 5000 Square Feet $45,750.00 $550.00 30 $16,500.00 $328,975.00 $0.00 $3,373,126.00 $328,975.00 $3,702,101.00
Ventura, CA 93003 $45,030.00 1 NOT USED $45,030.00
T:  805/654-1682    FAX:  805/654-8241 $8.50 5000 Square Feet $42,500.00

Subcontractors $133,280.00
Electric- Lee Wilson Concrete- AA & P Contractors Inc. Remove Trees- California Industries, Inc.
Underground- Tierra Contracting, Inc. Striping- Pro-line Striping
Landscaping- Azalea Landscape Cont. Fencing- C&W Construction Spec. Inc.
Slurry Seal- Penn Woods Masonry- Glasspoole Masonry

Papich Construction Co. Inc. NO BID SUMBITTED
1686 Ramona Ave. Suite D $0.00 5000 Square Feet $0.00 $0.00 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Grover Beach, CA $0.00 0 NOT USED $0.00
T:  805/473-3016    FAX:  805/481-5966 $0.00 5000 Square Feet $0.00

Subcontractors $0.00
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R. Burke Corporation
PO Box 957 $3,886,190.00 $4.00 5000 Square Feet $20,000.00 $1,000.00 30 $30,000.00 $316,700.00 -$25,000.00 $3,954,190.00 $291,700.00 $4,245,890.00
San Luis Obispo, CA 93406 $0.00 0 NOT USED $0.00
T:  805/543-8568    FAX:  805/543-2521 $3.60 5000 Square Feet $18,000.00

Subcontractors $38,000.00
Signs- Statewide Safety & Signs Signal & Electric- Lee Wilson Electric
Striping & Marking- Sudhakar Co. Landscape & Irrigation- KCI Environmental, Inc.
Minor Concrete- AA & P Contractors Slurry Seal- Penn Woods Corp. 
Tree Removal- California Industries, Inc.

Toro Enterprises Inc.
PO Box 6285                       511 Buena Vista Ave. $3,599,200.00 $5.00 5000 Square Feet $25,000.00 $960.00 30 $28,800.00 $680,000.00 -$25,000.00 $3,675,500.00 $655,000.00 $4,330,500.00
Oxnard, CA 93031               Oxnard, CA 93030 $0.00 0 NOT USED $0.00
T:   805/483-4515   FAX:  805/483-2001 $4.50 5000 Square Feet $22,500.00

Subcontractors $47,500.00
Construction Area Signs- Statewide Safety & Signs Storm Drain Reclaimed Water- Tierra Contracting Change in Sub due to Alternates:
Survey & Staking- Pennfield & Smith Street Lighting Triffic Signals- Lee Wilson Electric Steel Rail Fence- C.W. Construction
Striping & Making-  Pro-line Striping Tree Removal & Clearing- California Industrial Inc. Block Rotaining Wall- Glasspoole Masonry
Landscape & Irrigation- KCI Environmental

Traffic Signal Maintenance NO BID SUMBITTED
5367 Ogan Rd. $0.00 5000 Square Feet $0.00 $0.00 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Carpinteria, Ca 93013 $0.00 0 NOT USED $0.00
T:  805/684-5054    FAX:  805/684-5058 $0.00 5000 Square Feet $0.00

Subcontractors $0.00

Union Asphalt, Inc. NO BID SUMBITTED
1625 E. Donovan Rd. $0.00 5000 Square Feet $0.00 $0.00 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Maria, CA 93453 $0.00 0 NOT USED $0.00
T:  805/922-9858    FAX:  805/349-8301 $0.00 5000 Square Feet $0.00

Subcontractors $0.00

Bid Open: Thursday, August 7, 2008, 2:30 PM



Project: El Colegio Rd. Improvement
Project No. FM080435L/986051
University Representative: Erich Bron

Estimated Construction Cost: $4,300,000.00

ALTERNATES

 General Contractor Base Bid Unit Price
Unit 
Quantity Description

Total Unit 
Price

Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable Alternate #1 Alternate #2

Base Bid w/unit 
prices & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates

BASE BID UNIT PRICES COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST

Union Engineering Co. NO BID SUMBITTED
3658 N. Ventura Ave. $0.00 5000 Square Feet $0.00 $0.00 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Ventura, CA 93001 $0.00 0 NOT USED $0.00
T:    805/648-3373  FAX:  805/648-6634 $0.00 5000 Square Feet $0.00

Subcontractors $0.00

V. Lopez Jr. & Sons
200 E. Fesler, Ste 101                              PO Box 48 $3,398,686.00 $5.56 5000 Square Feet $27,800.00 $500.00 30 $15,000.00 $454,921.00 -$25,000.00 $3,467,986.00 $429,921.00 $3,897,907.00
Santa Maria, CA 93454                         SM, CA 93456 $0.00 0 $0.00
T:    805/928-1198  FAX: 805/928-8262 $5.30 5000 $26,500.00

Subcontractors $54,300.00
Concrete- Precision Concrete Asphalt- Toste Paving Change in Sub due to Alternates:
Guardrail- Alcorn Fence Electric- Lee Wilson Electric Concrete- Precision Concrete
Signs- Statewide Safety Striping- Sudhakar Co. Masonry- Peralez Masonry
Masonry- Peralez Masonry Landscape- Cascade Sprinklers Asphalt- Toste Paving

Whitaker Contractors, Inc.
2752 Concrete Court $4,244,701.00 $2.90 5000 Square Feet $14,500.00 $683.00 30 $20,490.00 $468,858.00 -$29,250.00 $4,297,941.00 $439,608.00 $4,737,549.00
Paso Robles, CA 93446 $0.00 0 $0.00
T:  805/226-4020    FAX:  805/226-4021 $3.65 5000 $18,250.00

Subcontractors $32,750.00
Electrical- Lee Wilson Electric Striping- Sudhakar Co.
Curb & Gutters- Precision Concrete Inc. Tree Removal- Petersons Tree Care
Landscape & Irrigation- Planet Earth Landscape
Slurry Seal- Penn Woods

Bid Open: Thursday, August 7, 2008, 2:30 PM


