
Bid Summary
San Miguel Reclaimed Water Continuation Project

FM080119S/987706
Estimated Construction Costs: $190,000.00

Project Manager: G. Levinthal
Bid Opening Date: Thursday, September 4, 2008 @ 2:30PM

Contractor Base Bid
Compensable 

Delay Days Total Compensable
Base Bid Plus 

Compensable Delays Total
Ditch Witch Underground Equipment No Bid Submitted 10

Hanly General Engineering Corp. $129,000.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $129,000.00 $129,000.00
3191 Mission Drive
Santa Ynez, CA 93460
805/688-3752 Fax: 805/688-7138

Subcontractor:
Directional Drilling: ACCU Bore Directional Drilling

Lack Construction $185,675.00 $200.00 10 $2,000.00 $187,675.00 $187,675.00
420 East Carrillo Street
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
805/963-3600/ Fax 805/963-6060

Subcontractors:
Demo: West Coast & Sons
Directional Drilling: Ventura Directional Drilling
Landscape: Town & County Watergardens Inc.
Temp. Fencing: Fence Factory
Concrete Patching: Gold Coast General Engineering
Plumbing: Eco Plumb
Earthwork: Gold Coast General Engineering

Lash Construction No Bid Submitted 10

Mainline Underground Construction Inc. No Bid Submitted 10

Schock Contracting Corp. No Bid Submitted 10

Spiess Construction No Bid Submitted 10

Tierra Contracting Inc. No Bid Submitted 10

Ventura Directional Drilling Inc. $169,000.00 $3,000.00 10 $30,000.00 $199,000.00 $199,000.00
P.O. Box 1574
Ventura, CA 93002-1574
805/642-5000/ Fax 805/340-3070

Subcontractor:
None


