
Bid Summary
Anacapa Residence Hall Re-Roofing Project, Bldg 547

FM0800578S/292-98

Bid Opening Date: Wednesday 
September 17, 2008 @ 2:30PM

Project Manager/Univ. Rep. George Levinthall

Contractor Base Bid Compensable Delay Days Total Compensible 
Delay Unit Price Rolls Total Unit Price Base Bid Plus Compensible 

Delay & Unit Price Total

Architectural Accent No Bid Submitted 4 2

1388 La Culebra Circle

Camarillo, CA 93012

805/302-4507/ Fax 805/435-1733

Best Contracting Services $135,835.00 $0.00 4 $0.00 $725.00 2 $1,450.00 $137,285.00 $137,285.00
19027 Hamilton Ave. 

Gardens, CA. 90248

310/328-6969/ Fax 310/328-9176

Subcontractors: 
Tear-off: Roof Removal Inc.

Blum & Sons Electric No Bid Submitted 4 2

606 Linden Avenue

Carpinteria, CA 93013

805/684-1010/ Fax 805/684-2260

Cambron Roofing & Waterproofing $139,713.00 $0.00 4 $0.00 $527.00 2 $1,054.00 $140,767.00 $140,767.00
7334 Hollister Ave.

Goleta, CA. 93117

805/685-9496/ Fax 805/684-7791

Subcontractor:
Abatement: Pearl Bay Corporation

Channel Coast Corporation No Bid Submitted 4 2

123 Santa Barbara Stree

Santa Barbara, CA 93101

805/899-1227/ Fax 805/899-8690

Channel Islands Roofing $124,500.00 $0.00 4 $0.00 $320.00 2 $640.00 $125,140.00 $125,140.00
4155 N. Southbank

Oxnard, CA. 93030

805/485-1622/ Fax 805/485-8634

Subcontractors: 
Abatement: Channel Coast Corporation
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Commercial Roofing Systems No Bid Submitted 4 2

11735 Goldring Road

Arcadia, CA 91006

626/359-5354/ Fax 626/359-2654

Craig Roofing Company $185,512.00 $0.00 4 $0.00 $625.00 2 $1,250.00 $186,762.00 $186,762.00
132 Garden Street

Santa Barbara, CA.90248

805/966-5331/ Fax 805/962-1168

Subcontractors:
Demo: Honeycutt Tear Off

Derrick's Roofing $184,900.00 $0.00 4 $0.00 $525.00 2 $1,050.00 $185,950.00 $185,950.00
651 Ward Drive, Suite "F"

Santa Barbara, CA. 93111

805/681-9954/ Fax 805/681-9952

Subcontractors: 
Asbestos Removal: Channel Coast Corp.

Electrical: Taft Electric Co.

F. Rodgers Corp. No Bid Submitted 4 2

28381 Constellation Road

Valencia, CA 91355

661/702/0263/ Fax 661/702-0449

Honeycutt Companies No Bid Submitted 4 2

3327 Hamner Ave

Norco, Ca 92860

800/464-8662/ Fax 800/464-1027

Midstate Sheetmetal, Inc. No Bid Submitted 4 2

5604B Q Street

Bakersfield, CA 93301

661/322-8009/ Fax 661/322-7545

RGSLA, Inc. Roofing $151,172.00 $2,850.00 4 $11,400.00 $1,494.18 2 $2,988.36 $165,560.36 $165,560.36
13555 Imperial Highway

Whittier, CA 90605

562/944-7799/ Fax 562/944-7769

Subcontractors:
Demo/ACM: Honeycutt Tear Off
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Richter Roofing Company Inc No Bid Submitted 4 2

1405 W. Magnolia Blvd, Ste B

Burbank, CA 91506

818/352-6765/ Fax 818/841-4349

TPS Roof Systems $151,891.00 $4,000.00 4 $16,000.00 $750.00 2 $1,500.00 $169,391.00 $169,391.00
23111 Antonio Parkway, Ste 205

Rancho Santa Margarita, CA 92688

949/216-9770/ Fax 949/216-9772

Subcontractors: 
Roof Removal: Roof Removal, Inc

Sheet Metal: BT Sheet Metal Inc.

West Coast & Sons Demolition No Bid Submitted 4 2

11455 Azahar Street

Ventura, CA 93004

805/421-3523/ Fax 805/486-2526

Zenco Engineering No Bid Submitted 4 2

438 Calle San Pablo, Unit D

Camarillo, CA 93012

805/482-2080/ Fax 4805/482-1883
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