
Project: Recreation Center Locker Room Renewal Bldg. 516
Project No. FM080446S/264-74
University Representative: Deedee Ciancola

Bid Open: 2:30PM, 
September 15, 2008

Estimated Construction Cost: $400,000.00

TOTAL PROJECT COST

 General Contractor Base Bid
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable

Base Bid & 
Compensable Delays Contract Total Prequalification 

Ardalan Construction - Reject Bid
1459 Thousand Oaks Blvd Suite G1 $666,264.00 $8,330.00 5 $41,650.00 $707,914.00 $666,264.00 Received
Thousand Oaks, CA 91362
T:    805/496-7273  FAX:  805/496-7310 Failed

Subcontractors
Electrical- R.A. Electric Lockers- John Pence Fire Sprinkler- R&R
Painting- DeMoor Painting Plumbing- M&M
Skylights- Sunglow Steel Frame- Precision Welding
Roofing- Derrick's HVAC- Dahl

Bottenfield Construction
24832 Apple St. $378,820.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $378,820.00 $378,820.00 Received
 Newhall, CA 91321
T:  661/260-1720    FAX: 661/260-1401 Passed

Subcontractors
Demo- West Coast & Sons Demo HVAC- ABC Sevices Roofing- Mike Garland Roofing
Skylights- Inter-Sky Fire Protection Sys.- RJ Fire Sprink.
Painting- Guy Smithson Electrical- RA Elec Plaster-Specialty Team Plaster
Solid Plastic Lockers- Fortress Lockers Plumbing-Omara Plumbing

Carroll Construction - Reject Bid
121 S. Quarantina $308,430.00 $1,000.00 5 $5,000.00 $313,430.00 Received
Santa Barbara, CA 93103
T:   805/966-4810  FAX: 805/966-5654 Failed

Subcontractors
Skylights- Sanglo Drywall- AGS Casework- Superior Lockers- Calif. Sports & Equip. Electric- Paragon 
Misc. Iron- J&D Fab Insulation- SB Building Toilet Partitions- Stambaugh Plumbing- Kuehler Fire Sprinklers- CA Central Fire
Roof- Derricks Plaster- TFT Paint- American Coatings HVAC- JR Barto

EJS Construction
4191 Carpinteria Avenue, Ste 7 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Carpinteria, CA 93013 NO BID
T: 805/684-6381     FAX: 805/684-6312

Subcontractors

G2000 Construction
28348 Roadside Dr. Suite 205 $258,650.00 $400.00 5 $2,000.00 $260,650.00 $258,650.00 Received
Agoura Hills, CA 91301
T:   818/889-6046   FAX: 818/889-6048

Subcontractors
Demo- The Peak Group Electrical- GOP Electric
Framing- The Peak Group HVAC- Las Americas A/C & Htg.
Painting- The Peak Group Fire Sprinkler- Certified Fire Protection Inc
Lockers- The Peak Group

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY
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Lack Construction - Reject Bid
420 East Carrillo Street $336,770.00 5 $0.00 $336,770.00 Received
Santa Barbara, CA 93101 (Left Blank)
T:  805/963-3600      FAX: 805/963-6060 Failed

Subcontractors
Demo- West Coast & Sons Flashing & Roof Patching- Cambron Roof. Lockers- Jessico dba. Russco Electrical- Vastola Elec.
Casework/Support Frames- Hales Eng Glass- Performance Glass HVAC- JR Barto
Dehumid. Installation/Skylights- Seguro Painting- Guy Smithson Fire Protection- RJ Fire Sprinkler
Casework- Superior Millwork Plaster- Stucco Concepts Plumbing- Koehler Plumbing

Newton Construction - Reject Bid 
259 Higuera Street                     PO Box 3260 $348,000.00 $100.00 5 $500.00 $348,500.00 Received
San Luis Obispo, CA 93401        SLO, CA 93403
T:  805/544-5583   FAX: 805/544-5584 Failed

Subcontractors
HVAC- Dahl A/C Lockers- C&S Construction
Plaster- Stucco Concepts Plumbing- Koehler Plumbing
Roof- Cambron Roofing
Fire Protection- Calif. Central F.P.

Pacific Property Restoration
3835 E. Thousand Oaks Blvd. Suite 210 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Westlake Village, CA 91362 NO BID
T:   800/607-5234   FAX:  818/991-7733

Subcontractors

Russco
2240 S. Thornburg St. 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Maria, CA 93455 NO BID
T:  805/922-1311    FAX:  805/928-2064

Subcontractors

S. Santillano Construction
PO Box 15 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Richgrove, CA 93261 NO BID
T:   661/599-5815   FAX: 661/725-6514

Subcontractors
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SBS Corporation
31416 Agoura Road, Suite 135 $324,500.00 $500.00 5 $2,500.00 $327,000.00 $324,500.00 Received
Westlake, CA 91361-4621
T:   818/597-4363   FAX: 818/597-4368

Subcontractors
Roofing- M. Cambron Roofing Toliet Partitions- Stumbaugh Electrical- Venco Electric
Painting- American Coatings HVAC- Canoga Park Heat & Air Skylites- Industrial Skylites
Lath & Plaster- TST Plastering Fire Protection- RJ Fire Sprinklers
Lockers- Fortress Locker Sys. Plumbing- M&M Mech

Schock Contracting
340 S. Kellogg, Ste J 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Goleta, CA 93117 NO BID
T:  805/681-9796    FAX: 805/681-9717

Subcontractors

Smith MEP
1340 W. Betteravia Rd. $284,000.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $284,000.00 $284,000.00 Received
Santa Maria, CA 93455
T:  805/621-5000    FAX: 805/621-5050

Subcontractors
Painting- American Coatings Roofing- Channel Islands
Stucco Patch- Patch Adams
Counter Tops- Superior Millwork
Skylights- Inter-sky

Splendid Construction
8939 S. Sepulveda Blvd. #110 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Los Angeles, CA 90045 NO BID
T:   805/205-3826   FAX:  310/342-0025

Subcontractors

Tasco Construction
651 Via Alondra, Ste 715 $313,653.00 $250.00 5 $1,250.00 $314,903.00 $313,653.00 Received
Camarillo, CA 93012
T:   805/987-1824   FAX:  805/359-0514

Subcontractors
Countertips- California Woodworking Lockers- Rusco Electric- KME Electric
Roofing- Tom Curry Roofing Fire Sprinklers- R&R Fire Protection
Sklights- JnL Glass Plumbing- Four R Plumbing
Plaster- Specialty Team Inc. HVAC- Adams Air



Project: Recreation Center Locker Room Renewal Bldg. 516
Project No. FM080446S/264-74
University Representative: Deedee Ciancola

Bid Open: 2:30PM, 
September 15, 2008

Estimated Construction Cost: $400,000.00

 General Contractor Base Bid
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable

Base Bid & 
Compensable Delays Contract Total Prequalification 

Viola Construction
1144 Commercial Ave. 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Oxnard, CA 93031 NO BID
T:  805/487-3871    FAX:  805/481/3870

Subcontractors

Vortex
320 Butte St. 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Bakersfield, CA 93305 NO BID
T:    661/324-5846  FAX: 661/324-5864

Subcontractors

ZJ Custom Construction
1111 Oxford St. 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Delano, CA 93215 NO BID
T:  661/778-9241    FAX: 661/725-0256

Subcontractors


