Project: Rec-Cen Aquatics Complex Renewal Bid Open: 2:30PM,

Project No. FM080741L/981560 September 26, 2008
University Representative: Deedee Ciancola Estimated Construction Cost: $1,800,000.00
BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST
Compensable Total Base Bid & Prequalification
General Contractor Base Bid Delay Days|Compensable |Compensable Delays Total Received
ASR Contractors, Inc.
5230 Wilson St. No Bid 5

Riverside, CA 92509
T: 951/779-6580 FAX: 951/779-6588
Subcontractors

Bottenfield Cosntruction

24832 Apple St. No Bid 5

Newhall, CA 91321

T: 661/260-1720 FAX: 661/260-1401
Subcontractors

California Commercial Pools

2255 E. Auto Centre Dr. No Bid 5

Glendora, CA 91740

T:909/394-1280 FAX: 909/394-4579
Subcontractors

Carroll Construction

121 S. Quarantina $1,665,000.00 $200.00

Santa Barbara, CA 93103

T: 805/966-4810 FAX: 805/966-5654
Subcontractors

All- South Coast Pool Plastering Inc.

4]

$1,000.00 $1,666,000.00 $1,666,000.00 Received

Condor, Inc.
3000 Durfee Ave $1,897,400.00 $1,400.00
El Monte, CA 91732
T:626/455-0050 FAX: 626/455-0070
Subcontractors
Demo- West Coast & Sons' Demolition
Concrete- Sharma General Engineering
Plaster- Jaguar Enterprises, Inc.
Electrical- Current Pro Electric

4]

$7,000.00 $1,904,400.00 $1,904,400.00 Received
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SBS Corporation

31416 Agoura Rd. Suite 135

No Bid

Westlake, CA 91361

T: 818/597-4363 FAX: 818/597-4368

Subcontractors

Sharma Contractors

13840 Princeton Ave.

No Bid

Moorpark, CA 93021

T: 805/532-1141 FAX: 805/532-1790

Subcontractors

Smith Electric Service

1349 W. Betteravia Rd

$1,659,400.00 $1,000.00

(&2

$5,000.00

$1,664,400.00

$1,664,400.00 Received

Santa Maria, CA 93455

T: 805/621-5000 FAX: 805/621-5050

Subcontractors

Swimming Pool- Nadar Inc.

Concrete Demo- Independent Concrete Cutting

Concrete/drainage- Sharma General Eng.

Tricon Construction

11419 Sunrise Gold Circle Suite 6

No Bid

Rancho Cordova, CA 95742

T: 916/638-9866 FAX: 916/638-9867

Subcontractors

Viola Construction Co.

1144 Commercial Avenue

$1,597,000.00 $1,000.00

(%))

$5,000.00

$1,602,000.00

$1,602,000.00 Received

Oxnard, CA 93031

T: 805/487-3871 FAX: 805/487-3870

Subcontractors

Demo- West Coast & Sons Demolition

Swimming Pool- Nadar, Inc.

Rebar- Gold Coast General Engineering

Site Utilities- Sharma General Engineering

Concrete Gold Coast General Engineering

Electrical- Walsh Electric |

Carpentry-M & T

Joint Sealants- F.Rodgers Corp.




