Project: Valentine Lab Renovation, CNSI Bldg. 266, Rm. 2404

Project No. FM080264SR/987703
University Representative:

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST
Base Bid w/
Compensable Total Compensable

General Contractor Base Bid Delay Days Compensable |Delays Total
Bottenfiled Construction
24832 Apple St. $289,200.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $289,200.00 $289,200.00
Newhall, CA 91321
T: 666/260-1720 FAX: 661/260-1401

Subcontractors
Building Inuslation- Western Ins. Acoustical Ceiling- Pacific Acoustics HVAC- JR Barto
Hallow Metal Doors & Frames- Door Stop Resilient Floor & Base- Floor Connection Mechanical- M/M
Finish Hardware- Door Stop Painting- Paseo Del Norte Painting Electrical- RA Electric
Gypsum Drywall & Metal Stud- United Wall Systems |/AC ELF Magnetic Shielding Sys.- Lima Bravo Controls- Johnson controls
Carroll Construction
121 S. Quarantina $292,000.00 $200.00 5 $1,000.00 $293,000.00 $292,000.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93103
T: 805/966-4810 FAX: 805/966-5654

Subcontractors
Drywall- AGS Plumbing- M/M Mech.
Acoustic Tile- Pacific Acoustics Flooring- Floor Connection
Electric- Good Service Magnetic Shielding- Lima Bravo
HVAC- JR Barto Painting- American Coating
JHK Contractors, Inc
1131 N. Mariposa Street 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Burbank, CA 91506 NO BID
T: 818/521-7627 FAX: 818/273-4304

Subcontractors
Lack Construction
420 East Carrillo Street $245,675.00 $200.00 5 $1,000.00 $246,675.00 $245,675.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
T: 805/963-3600 FAX: 805/963-6060

Subcontractors
Metal Framing- Seguro Flooring- Floor Connection Plumbing- Goleta Plumbing
Insulation- Western Insulation Painting- American Coatings Electrical- Good Service
Doors/Frames/Hardwar- Seguro Magnetic Shield- Lima Bravo
Acoustic Ceiling/Wall Panel- Pacific Acoustics North | HYAC- US Air Conditioning/Clean Air Mech.
Los Angeles Air Conditioning Inc.
1714 Lindburgh Court 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
La Verne, CA 91750 NO BID
T: 909/596-7077 FAX: 909/596-6657

Subcontractors
Pueblo Construction
5949 Hollister Ave, Ste E 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Goleta, CA 93117 NO BID

T: 805/683-1313 FAX: 805/683-2523

Subcontractors

Bid Open: Tuesday, October 7, 2008, 2:30 PM

Estimated Construction Cost: $275,000.00
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Queen Construction Corp

3840 Cottonwood Gr Tr

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Calabasas, CA 91301

NO BID

T: 818/926-1044 FAX: 818/878-0488

Subcontractors

SBS Corporation

31416 Agoura Road, Ste 135

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Westlake Village, CA 91361-4321

NO BID

T: 818/597-4363 FAX: 818/597-4368

Subcontractors

Smith Electric

1340 W. Betteravia

$268,400.00

$0.00

$0.00

$268,400.00

$268,400.00

Santa Maria, CA 93455

T: 805/621-5000 FAX: 805/621-5050

Subcontractors

Painting- American Coating

Acoustical Ceiling- Pacific Acoustics

Flooring- Floor Connection

Fire Protection- Nargan Fire

Shielding- Electro Magnetic Shielding

Controls- Johnson Controls

Tomar Construction Inc

5305 Elmhurst Street

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Ventura, CA 93004

NO BID

T: 805/642-8816 FAX: 805/642-8818

Subcontractors

Bid Open: Tuesday, October 7, 2008, 2:30 PM

Estimated Construction Cost: $275,000.00



