
Bid Summary
Biological Sciences Bldg. Renovation, Unit 2 - Re-Bid

FM060346LR/988620
Estimated Construction Costs: $1,000,000.00

Project Manager: S. Eggemeyer
Bid Opening Date: 

Tuesday, October 21, 2008 @ 2:30PM

Contractor Base Bid
Compensable 

Delay Days Total Compensable

Base Bid Plus 
Compensable 

Delays Total
A-Plus Fire Protection No Bid Submitted 10
470 Marquita Ave, Ste "B"
Paso Robles, CA 93446
805/226-0790/ Fax 805/434-0791

Blum & Sons Electric Inc. No Bid Submitted 10
606 Linden Ave
Carpinteria, CA 93013
85/684-1010/ Fax 805/452-0354

Brannon Inc., DBA Smith Electric Service $1,072,300.00 $250.00 10 $2,500.00 $1,074,800.00 $1,074,800.00
1340 W. Betteravia Road
Santa Maria, CA 93455
805/621-5055/ Fax 805/621-5190

Subcontractors: 
Fire Sprinklers: RJ Fire Sprinkler Systems Inc.
Painting: Guy Smithson Painting & Decorating Inc.
Acoustical Ceiling: Pacific Acoustics North Inc.
Plaster Patch: Patch Adam's Plastering
Fire Alarms: Golden State Alarms Inc.

Bottenfield Construction $940,222.00 $450.00 10 $4,500.00 $944,722.00 $944,722.00
34832 Apple Street'
Newhall, CA 91321
661/260-1720/ Fax 661/260-1401

Subcontractors: 
Electrical: Walsh Electric
Fire Stopping/ Fire Protection: A Plus Fire Protection Inc.
Painting: Paso Del Norte Painting Company Inc.
Acoustical Ceiling: MDK Construction Co. Inc DBA Continuous Quality Service
Drywall: Pacific Coast Drywall
Plastering: Specialty Team Plastering Inc.

California Central Fire Protection Inc. No Bid Submitted 10
358 Apache Trail
Arroyo Grande, CA 93420
805/481-1331/ Fax 805/481-3466
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Carroll Construction Company $870,525.00 $400.00 10 $4,000.00 $874,525.00 $874,525.00
121 Quarantina Street
Santa Barbara, CA 93103
805/966-4810/ Fax 805/966-5654

Subcontractors:
Fire Sprinkler: A-Plus Fire Protection Inc
Fire Stopping: A-Plus Fire Protection Inc
Demo: West Coast & Son's
Acoustical Ceilings: Pacific Acoustics North Inc.
Plaster/Drywall: TFT Plastering Inc.
Painting: Guy Smithson Painting & Decorating Inc.
Fire Protection: A-Plus Fire Protection Inc
Electric: Blum & Sons Electric Inc.
Fire Alarm: Blum & Sons Electric Inc.

EJS Construction Inc. $995,000.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $995,000.00 $995,000.00
4191 Carpinteria Ave, #7
Carpinteria, CA 93013
805/684-6381/ Fax 805/684-6312

Subcontractors:
Electrical: The Good Service Company
Fire Sprinkler: A-Plus Fire Protection Inc.
Fire Alarm: Golden State Alarms Inc.
Ceiling: Pacific Acoustics North Inc.
Paint:  Mar Vista Painting

JHK Contractors No Bid Submitted 10
1131 N. Mariposa Street
Burbank, Ca 91506
818/521-7627/ Fax 818/273-4304

Lack Construction No Bid Submitted 10
420 East Carrillo Street
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
805/963-3600/ Fax 805/963-6060

Schock Contracating No Bid Submitted 10
340 S. Kellogg, Ste J
Goleta, CA 93117
805/681-9796/ Fax 805/681-9717

Specialty Construction Inc. No Bid Submitted 10
645 Clarion Court
San Luis Obispo, CA 93401
805/543-1706/ Fax 805/543-1722

Viola Inc. No Bid Submitted 10
1144 Commercial Ave.
Oxnard, Ca 93031
805/487-3871/ Fax 805/487-3870
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