
Cosmogenic Nuclide Lab Renovation
FM080436S/016-00
Project Manager:  G. Levinthal

Estimated Construction Cost: $444,000.00

TOTAL PROJECT COST

 General Contractor Base Bid
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable

Base Bid & Compensable 
Delays

Bottenfield Construction
24832 Apple St. $549,200.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $549,200.00
Newhall , CA  91321
T:  661/260/1720     FAX:  661/260-1401

Subcontractors: Acoustical Ceil.- Cali USA Acoustics Electric- RC Elec.
HVAC- West Coast Mech. Epoxy Flooring- SB Surfacing Fire Alarm- Alpha Fire & Security
Demo- West Coast & Sons Int. Paint.- Paso del Norte Painting FMS- Johnson Controls
Roofing- Cambron Roof. Casework- ISEC
Plaster & Gyp Brd.- Pacific Coast Drywall Plumb.- Goleta Plumb.

Carroll Construction 
121 S. Quarantina $546,000.00 $200.00 10 $2,000.00 $548,000.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93103
T:  805/966-4810   FAX:  805/966-5654

Subcontractors: Paint- Guy Smithson HVAC- West Coast Mech.
Demo- West Coast & Sons Lab Casework- ISEC
Roofing- Derricks Roofing Plumb.- M/M Mech.
Drywall- AGS Electric- Blum & Sons
Flooring- Floor Seal Acoustical Tile- Santa Maria Acoustical

CFC, Inc. NO BID
703 Rancho Conejo Blvd. 10 $0.00 $0.00
Newbury Park, CA 91320
T:   805/498-4232   FAX:  805/498-8224

Subcontractors

David Atkin Construction NO BID
7061 Harmon Drive 10 $0.00 $0.00
Ventura, CA 91003
T:   805/642-1958   FAX:  805/650-9999

Subcontractors

EJS Construction
4191 Carpinteria Avenue, Ste 7 $537,300.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $537,300.00
Carpinteria, Ca 91013
T:   805/684-6381   FAX:  805/684-6312

Subcontractors: Ceiling- Santa Maria  Acoustical Fire Alarm- Tri Signal
Roofing- Derricks Drywall- Garibay Drywall
HVAC- West Coast Mech. Casework- ISEC
Electrical- RC Electric Paint- MarVista
Plumb.- Goleta Plumb. Floor- Floor Seal

Fast-Track Construction NO BID
5857 Uplander Way 10 $0.00 $0.00
Culver City, CA  90232
T:  310/215-1099     FAX:  310/215-1098

Subcontractors

ISEC Inc. NO BID
2363 Teller Road, #105 10 $0.00 $0.00
Thousand Oaks, CA  91320
T:  805/375-6957    FAX: 805/375-6935

Subcontractors

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, Tuesday, October 28, 2008
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Lack Construction
420 East Carrillo Street $600,000.00 $200.00 10 $2,000.00 $602,000.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
T:  805/963-3600    FAX: 805/963-6060

Subcontractors: Flooring/Paint.- Correct Coatings Fire Protection Alarm Sys.- Alpha Fire
Demo- West Coast & Sons Plastering & Gyp. Board- Specialtly Team Plumb.- M/M Mech.
Roofing- Cambron Roofing Acoustical Ceiling- Santa Maria Acoustical Electrical- Vastola Electric
Concrete- L. Ayala Enterprises Casework- ISEC
Mtl. Frame & Door Frms- Seguro HVAC- West Coast Mech.

SBS Corporation
31416 Agoura Road, Suite 135 $585,045.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $585,045.00
Westlake Village, CA  91361
T:   818/597-4363     FAX:  818/597-4368

Subcontractors Electrical- Venco
Concrete- Hughes Plumbing- M/M Mech.
Roofing- Derricks Roofing Mech.- West Coast Mech.
Painting- Ray Mac Painting Fume Hoods & Millwork- ISEC
Acoustical- Santa Maria Acoustical Fire Protection- Calif. Central Fire Protection

Schock Contracting
340 S. Kellogg, Ste J               PO Box 61505 $625,000.00 $100.00 10 $1,000.00 $626,000.00
Goleta, CA 93117                      SB, CA 93160
T: 805/681-9796     FAX: 805/681-9717

Subcontractors: Acoustical Ceil.- Santa Maria Acousitical HVAC- West Coast Mech.
Demo- West Coast & Sons Demolition Epoxy Flooring- Western Waterproofing Plumb.- Goleta Plumbing
Roof- Cambron Roofing Int. Paint.- Pacific Painting Electrical- Venco Electric
Mtl Drs/Frames- Classic Installation Fume Hoods- ISEC
Plaster/Gyp.- Pacific Interiors Casework- ISEC

Skyeline Construction NO BID
506 N. Quarantina Street 10 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93103
T:   805/966-1919   FAX:  805/966-1911

Subcontractors

Smith Electric
1340 W. Betteravia $563,900.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $563,900.00
Santa Maria, CA 93455
T:    805/621-5000  FAX: 805/621-5050

Subcontractors: Roofing- Channel Island Roofing
Painting- Van Guard Painting Plaster- Patch Adams
Epoxy Floor- SB Surface Fire Alarm- Golden State Alarms
Lab Equip/Casework- ISEC Air Balance- American Air Balance
Acoustical Ceil.- Santa Maria Acoustic Controls- Johnson Controls

Viola Construction Co.
1144 Commercial Avenue $558,000.00 $850.00 10 $8,500.00 $566,500.00
Oxnard, CA 91031
T:  805/487-3871    FAX: 805/487-3870

Subcontractors: Flashing & S/M- Cambron Fume Hoods- ISEC HVAC Controls- Johnson
Demolition- West Coast & Sons Acoustical Ceilings- Cali USA Lab. Casework- ISEC Electrical- Venco
Concrete- M&T Epoxy Marble Chip Floor.- Stonehard Lab. Sinks- ISEC
Misc. Rough Carpentry- M&T Painting- Certa Pro Plumbing- M/M
Membrame Roof.- Cambron Fume Hoods- ISEC HVAC- West Coast Mech.

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, Tuesday, October 28, 2008


