
Santa Catalina Towers Restroom Deck Renovations
Project No. FM090053S/987711
University Representative: George Levinthal

Estimated Construction Cost: $160,000.000

TOTAL PROJECT COST

 General Contractor Base Bid
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable

Base Bid w/ Compensable 
Delays

Benoit Construction
PO Box 91230 10 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93190 NO BID
T:  805/682-2126    FAX:  805/682-2172

Subcontractors

Carroll Construction 
121 S. Quarantina $199,950.00 $200.00 10 $2,000.00 $201,950.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93103
T:  805/684-4810     FAX:  805/966-5654

Subcontractors:
Water Proof.- SB Surfacing Plumbing- Kittle Plumb.
Cer. Tile- Visalia Tile Electric- Good Service
Handrail- Cooks Welding Fire Prot.- R&J Fire Sprinkler
Acoustic Tile- Pacific Acoustic Demo- West Coast
HVAC- Climate Control Drywall- AGS

Channel Coast Corporation
123 Santa Barbara  Street $196,353.00 $600.00 10 $6,000.00 $202,353.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
T:   805/899-1227  FAX:  805/899-8690

Subcontractors:
HVAC- West Coast Mech. Stone- David Tait Masonry Electrical- Good Service Elec.
Plumbing- Koehler Tile- Visalia Ceramic Tile Handrail- Craftsmen Construction & Erectors
Drywall-Thomas Install Concrete-Modern
Waterproofing- SB Surfacing Concrete Cutting- Penhall
Ceiling Tiles- Pacific Acoustics North Fire Suppression- 3-D Fire Protection

Cornejo Construction
PO Box 22302 10 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101 NO BID
T:   805/965-6404   FAX:  805/965-7644

Subcontractors

David Atkin Construction, Inc
PO Box 5490 10 $0.00 $0.00
Ventura, CA NO BID
T:   805/642-1958   FAX:  805/650-9999

Subcontractors

EJS Construction
4191 Carpinteria Suite 7 $203,600.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $203,600.00
Carpinteria, CA 93013
T:  805/684-6381    FAX:   805/684-6446

Subcontractors: Plumbing- M/M Mechanical   Paint- MarVista Paint.
Steel- All Metal Fire Protection- RJ Fire Sprink     Tile- Visailia Tile
HVAC/Sheet Metal- Jer's Repairs Installation Ceiling- Pacific Acoustics   Water Proof- SB Surfacing
Electrical- Good Service Drywall- Garibay Drywall

Frank Schipper Construction 
610 East Cota 10 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93103 NO BID
T:   805/963-4359   FAX:  805/963-1270

Subcontractors
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J.W. Bailey Construction
424 Olive St. $249,477.00 $500.00 10 $5,000.00 $254,477.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101
T:     805/963-1855  FAX:  805/965-9739

Subcontractors: Acoustics Ceil.- Pacific Acoustics HVAC- Climate Control
Demolition- Independent Concrete Cutting Ceramic Tile- Visalia Tile Plumbing- Kittle Plumbing
Drywall & Metal Studs- Floyd Mize Painting- Calif. Pro. Paint Electric- Good Service Elec.
Handrails- Precision Welding Fire Sprinkler- 3 D Fire Protection Stonework- Stonescapes
Waterproofing- Cambron Roof.

Lack Construction
420 E. Carrillo St. 10 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101 NO BID
T:   805/963-3600   FAX:  805/963-6060

Subcontractors

Newton Construction  
259 Higuera 10 $0.00 $0.00
San Luis Obispo, CA 93401 NO BID
T:   805/544-5583   FAX:  805/544-5584

Subcontractors

Dotzler Construction Inc. dba North Coast 
Construction
PO Box 824 $200,644.61 $0.00 10 $0.00 $200,644.61
Lompoc, CA 93436
T:  805/734-1227   FAX:  805/740-1727

Subcontractors Ceramic Tile- Visalia Ceramic 
Framing, Drywall- ACL Builders, Inc.
Doors & Hardware T-bar Ceiling- ACL Builders Inc.
Electrical - Good Service Electric

Pacific Property Restoration,Inc.
3835 E. Thousand Oaks,    Suite 310 10 $0.00 $0.00
Westlake Village , CA 91362 NO BID
T: 818/991-7722      FAX:   818/991-7733

Subcontractors

Queen Construction Corp
26500 Agoura Rd. 10 $0.00 $0.00
Calabasas, CA 91302 NO BID
T:  818/926-1044     FAX:  818/878-0488

Subcontractors

S. Santillano Construction
PO Box 15 10 $0.00 $0.00
Bakersfield, CA  93261 NO BID
T:  661/599-5815     FAX:  661/792-2755

Subcontractors
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SBS Corp.
31416 Agoura Rd. Suite 131 $181,403.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $181,403.00
Westlake Village, CA 91361
T:    818/597-4363  FAX:  818/597-4368

Subcontractors: Ceramic- Conception Tile, Inc. Fire Sprinklers- RJ Fire Sprinkler Sys.
Concrete- Hughes General Eng. HVAC- Climate Control Company Waterproofing- Santa Barbara Surfacing, Inc.
Structural Metal- John Wilson Steel Plumbing- M/M Mech.
Drywall/T-Bar- AGS Systems Electrical- Good Service Electric

Schock Contracting
P.O Box 61505 $199,990.00 $1.00 10 $10.00 $200,000.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93160
T:  805/681-9796    FAX:   805/681-9717

Subcontractors Tile- Visalia Ceramic Tile Drywall- Garibay Drywall
Demo- ICC Painting- Santa Barbara Painting Plumbing- Kittle Plumbing
Metal Fab- Precision Welding Waterproofing- Santa Barbara Surfacing HVAC- JR Barto
Acoustical Ceiling- Pacific Acoustics North Toilet Accessories- Stumbaugh Fire Sprinklers- RJ Fire Sprinkler Inc.
Electrical- Good Service Electric 

Skyeline Construction
506 N. Quarantina 10 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93103 NO BID
T:   805/966-1919   FAX:  805/966-1911

Subcontractors

Smith Electric
1340 Betteravia 10 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Maria, CA 93455 NO BID
T:  805/621-5000    FAX:  805/621-5050

Subcontractors

Tomar Construction, Inc. dba TJ Construction
5304 Elmhurst St. 10 $0.00 $0.00
Ventura, CA 93003
T:  805/642-8816    FAX:  805/642-8817

Subcontractors

Vernon Edwards Constructors, Inc.
PO Box 5849 $196,601.00 $750.00 10 $7,500.00 $204,101.00
Santa Maria, CA 93456
T:  805/614-9909     FAX:  805/614-9906

Subcontractors Door Installer- John Pence Bldg. Specialties HVAC- Ocean Air
Plumbing- Kittle Plumbing Ceramic- Hollywood Tile Electrical- Mark Schwind Electric
Metal Stud Drywall- AGS Wall Systems Painting- Calif. Pro Painting Fire Sprinkler- RJ Fire Sprinkler
Water Proofing- Santa Barbara Surfacing Acoustic Ceiling- ATI Construction

Vortex
320 Butte St. 10 $0.00 $0.00
Bakersfield, CA 93455
T:   661/324-5846   FAX:  661/324-5864

Subcontractors

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, Thursday, December 11, 2008


