Estimated Const. Cost: $525,000
Wednesday, January 14, 2009
University Rep.: Karl Burrelsman

Project: ESSB Communications Inside Wiring

Bid Summary Project No.: FM0802035/981240

Company

Base Bid

COMPENSABLE DELAY

Project Cost

Compensable
Delay

Days

Total
Compensable

Base Bid and
Compensable
Delays

Advance Communications & Consulting, Inc

8803 Swigert Court, Ste A

no bid submitted

20

Bakersfield, CA 93111

Tele: 661/664-0177 FAX: 661/664-0277

Subconiractors

Advantel

2222 Trade Zone Blvd.

$884,150.37

$500.00

20

$10,000.00

$894,150.37

San Jose, CA 95131

Bid Rejected

Tele: 800/377-4911  FAX: 408/954-5053

- |Bid included a

Subcontractors

proposal.

Blum and Sons Electric

606 Linden Ave.

$748,800.00

$50.00

20

$1,000.00

$749,900.00

Carpinteria, CA. 93013

Tele: 805-684-1010  FAX: 805-684-2260

Subcontractors

Communications - Jcomm

Caitek Communications

2910 S. Archibald #A-536

no bid submitted

20

Ontario, CA 91761

Tele: 909/229-4585  FAX: 909/657-4370

Subcontractors

3D Datacom

2544 North Renn Ave

$698,900.00

$1,000.00

20

$20,000.00

$718,900.00

Fresno, CA 93727

Tele: 558/291-6199 FAX: 559/291-6173

Subconiractors

Digital Technologies

11650 Mission Park Dr. Ste 112

no bid submitted

20

Rancho Cucamonga, CA 91730

Tele: 760/241-1621 _FAX: 760/241-1821

Subcontractor

ESC

2308 Market

no bid submitted

20

Ventura, CA 93204

Tele: 805/245-4475 FAX: 805/984-2312

Subconfractors

First Impuise

1835 Newport Blvd. A-109-442

no bid submitted

20

Costa Mesa, CA 92627

Teler 949/548-8585 FAX: 949/548-8805

Subconiractor

Bid Open: Wednesday Time: 2:30 P.M. Date: January 14, 2009




Project: ESSB Communications Inside Wiring Estimated Const. Cost: $525,000
Bid Summary Project No.: FM0902035/981240 Wednesday, January 14, 2009
’ University Rep.: Karl Burrelsman

High-Tech Electric
5888 E. Teague Ave. no bid submitted 20
Clovis, CA 93619

Tele: 559/299-7152 FAX: 59/299-3225
Subcontractors

iTech Solution

2838 Granite Creek Place $420,000.00 $420.00 20 $8,400.00 $428,400.00
San Jose, CA 95127 Bid Rejected
Tele: 408/832-8150 FAX: 408/251-3890 Bid Bond
Subcontractors Irregularity
JKL :

1051 Brush Hill Rd. no bid submitted 20

Thousand Oaks, CA 91360
Tele: 818/802-0757 FAX:
Subcontractor

Minco Construction
522 E. Airline Way $647,700.00 $100.00 20 $2,000.00 $649,700.00
Gardena, CA. 90248

Tele: 310/516-8100  FAX: 310/516-7404
Subcontractor

PacifiCom
330 N. Wood Road, Ste L $584,970.00 $0.00 20 $0.00 $584,970.00
Camarillo, CA 93010

Tele; 805-987-1351 FAX: 805-987-1353
Sucontractor

Grounding & Cable Pathways - Brannon inc. dba
Smith Electric Service

Pacific Coast Cabling, Inc. dba PCC Network Solutions

9340 Eton Ave. : $798,283.90 $0.00 20 $0.00 $798,283.90
Chatsworth, CA 91311 Bid Rejected
Tele: 800/313-1911 FAX: 818/407-1913 Bid Bond
Subcontractors Irreguiarity

Quintron Systems Inc.

2105 S. Blosser Rd $714,318.91 $300.00 20 $6,000.00 $720,318.91
Santa Maria, CA 93458 Bid Rejected
Tele: 805/928-4343 FAX: 805/928-5775 i No Bid Security
Subcontractors

Spectrum Communications
226 N. Lincoln Ave. no bid submitted 20
Corona, CA 92882

Tele: 800/319-8711 FAX: 951/273-3114
Subcontractors

Smith Eleciric Service
1340 W. Betteravia Rd. no bid submitted 20
Santa Maria, CA 93455

Tele: 805/621-5055 FAX: 805/621-5190
Subcontractors

Bid Open: Wednesday Time: 2:30 P.M. Date: January 14, 2009



Bid Summary

Project: ESSB Communications inside Wiring

Project No.: FM090203S/981240

Estimated Const. Cost: $525,000
Wednesday, January 14, 2009
University Rep.: Karl Burrelsman

Taft Electric

650 Alamo Pintado Rd, Ste 2

$1,024,669.00 $200.00

20

$4,000.00

1,028,669

Solvang, CA 93463

Tele: 805/688-0121 FAX: 805/688-0125

Subcontractors

TTP Inc.

393 Enterprise St.

$532,597.24 $2,800.00

20

$56,000.00

588,587.24

San Marcos, CA 92078

Tele: 760/510-1323 FAX: 760/510-8554

Subcontractors

Tyco Electronics

5825 Noble Ave.

no bid submitted

20

Van Nuys, CA 91411

Tele: 818/908-3300 FAX: 818/908-3331

Subcontractors

Vector Resources, Inc.

3530 Voyager St.

no bid submitted

20

Torrance, CA 90503

Tele: 310/436-1031 FAX: 310/436-1177

Subcontractors

Vision Communications

1421 State St. Ste F

no bid submitted

20

Santa BAabara, CA 93101

Tele: 805/963-7670 FAX :805/963-7673

Subcontractors

Western Digicom

15138 Goldenwest Circle

no bid submitted

20

Westminster, CA 92078

Tele: 818/652-4421 FAX: 818/548-4306

Subcontractors

Bid Open: Wednesday Time: 2:30 P.M. Date: January 14, 2008



