
Harold Frank Hall Renovation-Rooms 4110/4118
Project No. FM080365S/981590
University Representative: G. Levinthal

Estimated Construction Cost: $403,000.00

TOTAL PROJECT COST

 General Contractor Base Bid
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable

Base Bid & Compensable 
Delays

Bottenfield Construction
24832 Apple St. 10 $0.00 $0.00
Newall, CA 91351 NO BID
T:    805/896-8520  FAX:  661/260-1401

Subcontractors

Carroll Construction
121 Quarantina St 10 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101 NO BID
T:   805/966-4810   FAX: 

Subcontractors

Diani Building Corp.
295 North Blosser 10 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Maria, CA NO BID
T:   805/925-9533  FAX:  805/928-2150

Subcontractors

EJS Construction
4191 Carpinteria Avenue, Ste 7 $182,900.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $182,900.00
Carpinteria, CA 93013
T:  805/684-6381      FAX:  805/684-6446

Subcontractors
Electrical- Good Service Drywall- Garibay Drywall HVAC- West Coast Mech.
Plumbing- Goleta Plumbing Paint- Mar Vista
Ceiling- Pacific Acoustic North Flooring- New Image

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, Tuesday, April 7, 2009
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Ferrari Development
1350 Primavera Lane 10 $0.00 $0.00
Nipomo, CA 93444 NO BID
T:  805/440-5133    FAX:  805/929-3814

Subcontractors

J.W. Bailey Construction
424 Olive Street                                     PO Box 506 $197,493.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $197,493.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101                   SB, CA 93102
T:   805/963-1855   FAX:  805/965-9739

Subcontractors
Acoustic Ceilings- Cassidy's United Const. Blinds- Floor Connection   Electric- Barr West (Previous name Pacific Electric/Solar)
Flooring, Carpet & TS Base- New Image HVAC/Air Balance- JR Barto   Demo- JW Bailey
Painting- Guy Smithson Plumbing- Goleta Plumbing

John Donaldson Construction, Inc.
2472 Eastman Ave. Suite #32 $319,553.00 $250.00 10 $2,500.00 $322,053.00
Ventura, CA  93003
T:  805/654-1359     FAX:   805/643-4043

Subcontractors
HVAC- West Coast Mechanical
Electric-  Barr West (Previous name Pacific Electric/Solar)
Wall/Ceiling- Bill Davis Drywall

Kifer Construction
101 Arnold Place, Ste C 10 $0.00 $0.00
Goleta, CA 93117 No Bid
T:    805/683-7745  FAX:  805/683-3066

Subcontractors

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, Tuesday, April 7, 2009
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Kinyon Construction Inc.
4591 Merridock Court $337,280.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $337,280.00
Santa Maria, CA  93455
T:    805/938-7990  FAX:  805/934-9500

Subcontractors
HVAC- West Coast Mechanical Window Covering- Floor Connection Inc. Testing- West Coast Mechanical
Electric- Dodd's Electric Painting- Wilson Waterproofing
Flooring- Floor Connection Inc. Acoustic Ceilings- Cassidy's United Const.

Lack Construction
420 East Carrillo Street 10 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93101 No Bid
T:   805/963-3600    FAX: 805/963-6060

Subcontractors

Newton Construction & Management, Inc.
259 Higuera Street                          PO Box 3260 $207,000.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $207,000.00
San Luis Obispo, CA 93401         SLO, CA 93403
T:    805/544-5583  FAX:  805/544-5584

Subcontractors
Painting- Ignham Painting Acoustical Ceiling- Pacific Acoustic North Electrical- Good Service 
Flooring- New Image Plumbing- M/M Mechanical
Drywall- Central Drywall HVAC- West Coast Mechanical

Dotzler Construction Inc. dba North Coast 
Construction
PO Box 824                                    216 W. Walnut $235,890.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $235,890.00
Lompoc, CA  93438                    Lompoc, CA 93436
T:   805/740-1227   FAX:  805/740-1727

Subcontractors
Frame, T-bar, Doors, Drywall- ACL Builders HVAC- JR Barto
Flooring & Blinds- Floor Connection
Electrical- Blum & Sons

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, Tuesday, April 7, 2009
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SBS Corporation
31416 Agoura Rd. Suite 135 $296,679.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $296,679.00
Westlake Village, CA 91361
T:    818/597-4363  FAX:  818/597-4368

Subcontractors
Acoustical Ceilings- Pacific Acoustic North HVAC- Climate Control Painting- Ray Mac Painting
Plumbing- M/M Mechanical Electical- Val/U Electric
Flooring- New Image Metal Stud Framing- ATI Construction

Senel Construction Engineering
2935 Camino Del Zuro 10 $0.00 $0.00
Thousand Oaks, CA 91360 NO BID
T:  805/807-7767    FAX: 

Subcontractors

Brannon Inc DBA Smith Electric Service
1340 W. Betteravia Road $268,680.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $268,680.00
Santa Maria, CA 93455
T:    805/621-5000  FAX:  805/621-5050

Subcontractors
Painting- Guy Smithson Controls- Johnson Controls
Acoustical Ceiling- Pacific Acoustic North Air Balance- Los Angeles Air Balance Co. 
Flooring Floor Connection

Specialty Construction, Inc.
645 Clarion Court $247,149.00 $800.00 10 $8,000.00 $255,149.00
San Luis Obispo, CA 93401
T:   805/543-1706   FAX:  805/543-1722

Subcontractors
Demolition- B&B Construction  Plumbing- M/M Mechanical  Painting- Ingham Painting
Metal Stud, Drywall, Acoustical Ceiling- Cassidy United Construction  Electircal & Communiction- Blum & Sons
Louver Blinds- Floor Connection Flooring- New Image   Mechanical- JR Barto

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, Tuesday, April 7, 2009
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Tasco Construction, Inc.
651 Via Alondra, Ste 715 $164,396.00 $250.00 10 $2,500.00 $166,896.00
Camarillo, CA 93012
T:   805/987-1824   FAX:  805/389-0514

Subcontractors
T-bar Ceiling- Acoustical Precision Plumbing- M/M Mechanical
Electrical- KME Electrical HVAC- Climate Control Co. 
Flooring- New Image

Vernon Edwards
PO Box 5843 10 $0.00 $0.00
Santa Maria, CA  93456 No Bid
T:   805/614-9909   FAX:  805/614-9906

Subcontractors

Viola Constructors
1144 Commercial Ave. 10 $0.00 $0.00
Oxnard, CA 93031 No Bid
T:    805/487-3871  FAX:  805/487-3870

Subcontractors

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, Tuesday, April 7, 2009


