
NWC Cottages Remodel
Project No. FM090236S/981620
University Representative: Telli Foster 

Estimated Construction Cost: $360,000.00

ALTERNATES

 General Contractor Base Bid
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable Alternate #1 Alternate #2

Base Bid & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates

ACT Developers Inc. (I3)
2629 Foothill Blvd. #537 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
La Crescenta, Ca 91214 NO BID
T:  310/279-7262    FAX: 818/249-8265

Subcontractors

Ashlar Contractors (J-7)
15928 Ventura Blvd, Ste 209 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NO BID
T:      FAX: 

Subcontractors

Beachside Construction dba Kifer Const.(A9)
101 Arnold Place, Ste C $429,619.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $11,500.00 -$6,400.00 $429,619.00 $5,100.00 $434,719.00
Goleta, CA 93117
T: 805/683-7745    FAX: 805/683-3066

Subcontractors
HVAC- Frank Desimone HVAC Tile- David Thayler Tile Drywall- ATI Construction
Painting- Ray-Mac Painting Flooring- Cinderella Flooring
Electric- Taylor Electric Fire Protection- Nargan Fire

Below Magid Construction (K8)
146 Powers Avenue $659,168.60 $250.00 5 $1,250.00 $15,237.50 $18,337.90 $660,418.60 $33,575.40 $693,994.00
Santa Barbara, CA 93103
T: 805/966-3646     FAX: 805/966-0279

Subcontractors
Sheet Metal- Action Roofing HVAC- Dahl A/C Electrical- Taylor Electric Painting- Wynne Painting
Carpet/VCT- Cinderella Flooring Tile- Daniel Rohde Tile Drywall- Thomas Drywall
Plumbing- Construction Plumbing Parking Lot Gates- Goleta Fabrication Cabinetry/Laminate- UTT Construction

Bottenfield Construction (V23)
$0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NO BID
T:      FAX: 

Subcontractors

Carroll Construction (F18)
$0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NO BID
T:      FAX: 

Subcontractors

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST
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D W Hanson Construction (R19(
$0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NO BID
T:      FAX: 

Subcontractors

Dotzler Construction, DBA North Coast Construction (H6)
216 W. Walnut Ave $359,000.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $12,457.00 $13,848.00 $359,000.00 $26,305.00 $385,305.00
Lompoc, CA 93436
T:  805/740-1227    FAX:  805/740-1727

Subcontractors
Framing- ACL Builders Flooring- Floor Connection Plumbing- Pierce Plumbing
Doors/Hardware- ACL Builders Painting- Testa Painting Electrical- Ozzimo Electrical
Ceramic Tile- Lompoc Tile HVAC- West Coast Mech.

EJS (W11)
4191 Carpinteria Ave.                    PO BOX 939 $385,800.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $10,021.00 $27,800.00 $385,800.00 $37,821.00 $423,621.00
Carpinteria, Ca  93013
T:   805/684-6381   FAX: 805/684-6446

Subcontractors
Sheet Metal- Sunset Sheet Metal Plumbing- Koehler Paint- Testa Paint
HVAC- West Coast Drywall- Garibay Drywall Flooring- Floor Connection
Electrical- Ozzimo Counter Tops- Art Acraft Tile- Tile Trends

Ferrari Development (D12)
1350 Primavera Lane $356,658.53 $100.00 5 $500.00 $6,900.00 $7,013.00 $357,158.53 $13,913.00 $371,071.53
Nipomo, CA  93444
T:  805/929-1204    FAX: 805/929-3814

Subcontractors
Temp. Fencing- Fence Factory Plumbing- Pierce Plumbing Drywall/Texture- Graham's Drywall   Tile/Ceramic- Tee Tile
Gates- Gould Welding Mechanical- Dahl A/C Countertops/Trim- Superior Millwork of SB   Flooring- Cinderella Flooring 
Rough Framing- 3:16 Construction Electrical- Ozzimo Electric Pressure Washing & Int./Ext. Painting- Certapro Painters

Jack 'N Tool Box (X25)
$0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NO BID
T:      FAX: 

Subcontractors

Khan Construction (E-17)
$0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NO BID
T:      FAX: 

Subcontractors
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Kinyon Construction (M4)
4591 Merridock Court $382,147.20 $0.00 5 $0.00 $9,600.00 $10,148.40 $382,147.20 $19,748.40 $401,895.60
Santa Maria,  CA 93455
T:    805/938-7990  FAX: 805/934-9500

Subcontractors
Gates- Goleta Fabrication, Inc. HVAC- Top Notch Heating
Casework- Superior Millwork of SB Painting- Wilson Waterproofing
Flooring- Cinderella Flooring

Menchaca Construction Inc (L10)
$0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NO BID
T:      FAX: 

Subcontractors

Newton Construction  (Z5)
259 Higuera Street                                     PO Box 3 $325,000.00 $100.00 5 $500.00 $8,600.00 $10,000.00 $325,500.00 $18,600.00 $344,100.00
San Luis Obispo, CA 93401                    SLO, CA 93403
T: 805/544-5583     FAX: 805/544-5584

Subcontractors
Electrical- Amtak Electric Flooring/Painting/Carpentry- Remodel Pro's
HVAC- West Coast Mechanical
Fire Protection- California Central

Royal Oaks Property Development (T22)
$0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NO BID
T:      FAX: 

Subcontractors

S.J. Deferville Construction (U-24)
$0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NO BID
T:      FAX: 

Subcontractors

Sampanis Construction (N13)
$0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NO BID
T:      FAX: 

Subcontractors

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, Friday April 10, 2009



NWC Cottages Remodel
Project No. FM090236S/981620
University Representative: Telli Foster 

Estimated Construction Cost: $360,000.00

ALTERNATES

 General Contractor Base Bid
Compensable 
Delay Days

Total 
Compensable Alternate #1 Alternate #2

Base Bid & 
Compensable 
Delays Total Alternates 

Total with all 
Alternates

BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST

SBS Corp (Q1)
31416 Agoura Rd. #135 $392,433.00 $0.00 5 $0.00 $2,415.00 $0.00 $392,433.00 $2,415.00 $394,848.00
Westlake Village, CA 91361
T:    818/597-4363  FAX: 818/597-4368

Subcontractors
Ceramic Tile- Hollywood Tile, Inc. Fire Protection- California Central Fire Protection   Plumbing- M/M Mech.
Painting- RayMac Painting Mechanical- West Coast Mechanical   Drywall- United Wall Systems
Flooring- Reliable Floor Covering, Inc. Electric- Ozzimo Electric, Inc. 

Sigler Construction (B14)
$0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NO BID
T:      FAX: 

Subcontractors

Smith Electric (Y16)
$0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NO BID
T:      FAX: 

Subcontractors

Specialty Construction Inc. (S20)
$0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NO BID
T:      FAX: 

Subcontractors

Stonecastle Construction (P21)
$0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NO BID
T:      FAX: 

Subcontractors

Ultra Tek (G2)
9528 Somerset Blvd, BE $327,982.50 $1,000.00 5 $5,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $332,982.50 $0.00 $332,982.50
Bellflower, CA 90706
T:  562/925-1435    FAX: 562/925-1483

Subcontractors
HVAC- Dahl Air Conditioning

Whitney Construction (C-15)
$0.00 5 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

NO BID
T:      FAX: 

Subcontractors

Bid Open: 2:30 PM, Friday April 10, 2009


