Bid Summary University Representative: Jennifer Hernandez

Kerr Hall, Room 1110 Bid Opening Date: April 13, 2009 @ 2:30PM
FM090128S/987717
BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST
Total
Compensable Compen |Base Bid w/Compensable

General Contractor Base Bid Delay Days sable Delays
Beachside Construction No Bid Submitted 3
101 Arnold Place, Ste C
Goleta, CA 93117
T: 805/683-7745 FAX: 805/683-3066
Carroll Construction Co., Inc. No Bid Submitted 3
121 Quarantina St.
T: 805/966-4810 FAX: 805/966-5654
Cobblestone & Vines No Bid Submitted 3

1751 Berkshire Dr.

Thousand Oaks, CA 91362

T: 805/444-1586 FAX: 805/557-7334

Bid Rejected - Non
Cornejo Construction Company $140,000.00 Left Blank 3 Responsive

P.O. Box 22302

Santa Barbara, CA 93120

T: 805/965-6404 FAX: 805/965-7644

Subconractors

Paint: Ray- Mac Painting Inc.

Glass: J. N. L Glass Inc.

Delta Welding & Fabrication Inc.

Curtis Carpet Inc.

Pacific Acoutics North Inc.

Ozzimo Electric Inc.

U.S. Mechanical

I.C.C.

EJS Construction, Inc. $129,700.00 $0.00 3 $0.00 $129,700.00

4191 Carpinteria Ave., Ste 7

Carpinteria, CA 93013

T: 805-684-6381 FAX: 684-6312

Subcontractors

Drywall: Garibay Drywall

HVAC: J.R. Barto Heating/Air Conditioning/ Sheet Metal Inc.

Electrical: California Electric Company
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Ceiling: Pacific Acoustics North Inc.

Window Treatment: Floor Connection Inc.

Counter Top: Superior Millwork of S. B. Inc.

Paint: Mar Vista Painting

Glazing: J.& L Glass Inc.

Flooring: Floor Connection Inc.

Welding: John Wilson Steel & Fabrication Inc.
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FllII Carpentry No Bid Submitted 3

14 18th St.

Cayucos, CA 93430,

T: 805/440-5653 FAX: 805/995-3383

Ferrari Development Inc. $144,000.00 $0.00 3 $0.00 $144,000.00

1350 Primivera Lane

Nipomo, CA 93444

T: 805/440-5133 FAX: 805/929-3814

Subcontractors

Fencing/Handrail: Gould Welding

Rec Desk Wall & Countertops: Superior Millwork of S B Inc.

Base/Flooring/Shades: Floor Connection, Inc.

Painting: L & L Painting Inc., DBA CertaPro Painters

Glass Storefront/Doors: JN L Glass Inc.

Electrical: California Electric Company

Mechanical Div 15: Western Mechanical

Drywall/Steel Framing/T-bar Ceiling: Drywall Plus Inc.

Hanley General Engineering Corp. $159,900.00 $1.00 3 $3.00 $159,903.00

3191 Mission Dr.

Santa Ynez, CA 93460

T: 805/688-3752 FAX: 805/688-7138

Subcontractors

Electrical: AMP Electrical Company

Framing/Drywall: Gerritsen Drywall & Plastering Inc.

HVAC: H Poor & Company Inc., DBA Allstar Heating & Air Cond.

Storefront Doors/Glass: J-N-L Glass Inc.

Suspended Ceiling: Donald E. Webster Inc., DBA Broken Drum Insulation

J.W. Bailey Construction Company $165,260.00 $0.00 3 $0.00 $165,260.00

424 Olive St

Santa Barbara, CA 93101

T: 805/963-8855 FAX: 805/965-9739

Subcontractors

Glass & Glaze: J N L Glass Inc.




Bid Summary University Representative: Jennifer Hernandez

Kerr Hall, Room 1110 Bid Opening Date: April 13, 2009 @ 2:30PM
FM090128S/987717
BASE BID COMPENSABLE DELAY TOTAL PROJECT COST
Total
Compensable Compen |Base Bid w/Compensable
General Contractor Base Bid Delay Days sable Delays

Acoustic Ceiling: Pacific Acoustics North

Drywall & M Studs: J.W. Bailey Construction

Flooring: Floor Connection, Inc.

Painting: Ray-Mac Painting, Inc.

Shades: Floor Connection, Inc.

HVAC: Westaire Heating & Air Conditioning Inc.

Electrical: AMP Electrical Company

Steel Fencing: Delta Welding & Fabrication Inc.

Countertop: Superior Milwork of SB Inc.

Fire Sprinklers: RJ Fire Sprinklers Systsems Inc.
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Kinyon Construction Inc.

$134,908.00

$0.00

3 $0.00 $134,908.00

4591 Merridoc Court

Santa Maria, CA 93455

T: 805/938-7990 FAX: 805/934-9500

Subcontractors

Floor/Window Covers: Floor Connection Inc.

Electrical: Dodds Electric

Storefront: J N L Glass Inc.

Reception Desk: Superior Millwork Of S B Inc.

Drywall/Metal Studs: Premier Drywall

HVAC: Top Notch Heating Inc.

McCook Development

No Bid Submitted

211 Village Commons, Ste. 11

Camarillo, CA 93012

T: 805/384-9800 FAX: 805/384-9830

Mr. T's Construction

No Bid Submitted

1600 Orange Ave

Redlands, CA 92373

T: 909/730-6921 FAX: 909/792-9009

Newton Construction

No Bid Submitted

259 Higuerea

San Luis Obispo, CA 93401

T: 805/544-5583 FAX: 805/544-5584
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Dotzler Construction Inc., DBA North Coast Construction $149,380.00 $0.00 3 $0.00 $149,380.00

P.O. Box 824

Lompoc, CA 93438

T: 805/734-6751 FAX: 805/734-6763

Subcontractors

Drywall & Framing: A C L Builders Inc.

Doors/Frms/Hardware: A C L Builders Inc.

TBar Ceiling: A C L Builders Inc.

Painting: Ray-Mac Painting Inc.

Flooring: Floor Connection Inc.

HVAC: J.R. Barto Heating/Air Conditioning/Sheet Metal Inc.
Electrical: California Electric Company

SBS Corp No Bid Submitted 3
31416 Agoura Rd., Ste 135

Westlake Village, CA 91361-4621

T: 818/597-4363 FAX: 818/597-4368

Sigler Construction Services, Inc. No Bid Submitted 3
1300 Toronto Circle

Carpinteria, CA 93013

T: 805/566-0123 FAX: 805/684-6221

Smith No Bid Submitted 3
1340 Betteravia Rd.

Santa Maria, CA 93455

T: 805/621-5000 FAX: 805/621-5050
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Tasco Construction $127,622.00 $0.00 3 $0.00 $127,622.00

651 Via Alondra, Ste 715

Camarillo, CA 93012

T: 805/987-1824 FAX: 805/389-0514

Subcontractors

Cabinetry: Superior Millwork of S B Inc.

Insulation: Five Star Insulation Inc.

HM Frames & Doors: Door Solutions, Inc.

Storefronts: Performance Glass

Drywall: C J R Construction

T-Bar Ceiling: Acoustical Precision

Flooring: Floor Connection Inc.

Roller Shades: Floor Connection Inc.

Painting: General Coatings Corporation

Plumbing: Four R Plumbing Inc.

HVAC: Churchill's Heating & Air Conditioning Inc.

Fence & Handrail: John Wilson Steel & Fabrication Inc.

Demolition: DemoCleaning Corporation

Electrical: O'Conner Electric Inc.

Tomar Construction dba TJ Construction No Bid Submitted 3

5304 Elmhurst St.

Ventura, CA 93003

T: 805/642-8816 FAX: 805/642-8817

Ultra Tek No Bid Submitted 3

9528 Somerset Blvd.

Bellflower, CA 90706

T: 562/925-1435 FAX: 562/925-1483
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